
!Mari ;( qo to--4 

MORI riø t190 00-41 

ri-r*- ti1 ale.  fa Ma' 

'qn-Tiggr-654 

71WE,  7WT siTITT 
797.  sthil4 TRW1T ginsmObTa 

'km* tricevise 
WPT— 1, WM 

( \tot 	qi32-Bifritt4i 

FIVWX, 1:111RWTTI  17 tro+4T, 1985 

ITUtfq 26, 1907 ww.,(411 

siRU t:RVIT 

fatir4i9;Flyni 

?kart 1677/TiMe-fg--1- 1 (EE)- 3 5-1985  

wait*, 17 ferinu, 1985 

qfETTE9-ffr  

fafga 

"NM TT tiNtifq" T59"gcl'a 200 T Vag' Tinfir 	Ret<IT 3'97 stis3 fdt1T9' RIMB gra mita- 
SlaT5.Cmitu Tilk WITT (ti;NTR) fatiwn 1985 (It fqn is 17 frinnt <, 1985 47) 9414 SIAT9' Tet 

WAT 	39"C 	Ralf4141:14C4IT 299'9', 1985 T 	;9-4mErron 	(if 	cgin,•m.  gm SI'Tlf4Tff 
REM MTh' e I 

\it-10,51.1.'14T Tfrat 	ciliM (Treraff) IT1iL441, 1985 
(3"1"t CRT' Valli-N.1 kiziall 29,9 1985) 

[47r 3-fl'T Sraqf fq11T7ITtrUT' Uti Trill.  gm] 
sthr arnitq afh crcrr -r esrfkzrff, 1979 TT arlaff.K *NM 7Zk 

miaii9trq 
TITO' TivR19-4 UthtRi ai fff =9-fkfta-er 8114f9WIT irIIuqiffr 

1-- ( 1) qaffqfq 397 STt5T aTPthathcluTTt (4-41179') sTfaf91T, 1985 
Ter WRI711 I 	 • 

( 2) rfe -q4 fk9lw 	 Nt 	,n4 Tr7TIC, a1f1119T gio.r, ‘trf thfiM 
ffger 

Kffurg miT 3PR 
siRni 



rgflT SktR" 317114R131 ITqa', 17 fti 	c, 1 985 

2--377 Wi 3TFITZath TITT•TaTTIT19.44, 1979 TT, f74 ark ik* Bilje9.44 
TT igfT EITTT 12 , 34ITTU (1) , kriZ "7T 7T-C 71.4" f %TN ITT kITiq "a't q,s t 
7i-4" 77 fer qtair 

TrT WTI 24 4, kTR "q7 71•7 FT" eIT9' 97 UK "4'1 71•T 
f44 7744 

4--17 arrt9 	tART 25 4, ucfETTV ( 2) 4, s77 HeRT 214" 	gT9* Eft 
7F,D-q "CiWRT 714" KCI Ike:1[4;i I 

5--137 aTrEffirrzMTt WTI 26 if, 3crgITT ( 1) 	UuU (U) 11:  UE4 it et wil" 

	

-,rT7 cr7 krra.  "cri7 	7q4" 77.  fait .1101ii 

artin-444 try" 	cf 27 4, 7fr,  "e17 TATT VTir* -1•T9' 47 707Z "cflq 

	

p'17 wit" 77 fait vl 	144 

7--1F KM-97M M7T 29 if, 	prt 	T MT9' LIZ 	"thq piT 
viti" 77 fait 71.44 	• 

8--17 8lliTf94if TeT 917T 30Th *7,54' "T q•I'T 	 trt Thq 
(74"77.fa.4 .1144 

9--117 arfaf9'grf r TRT 30* iii fkiffie-kffzguqTe tt writ, aTtliaL-- 

"30—TI-TTf 	Erff45', f74 Erry 24, ER 1T71 25 T.) ULTATTT (1), ZIT 
EIRT 26 T.T UrfEITKI (1) * WIarg ( ) , tfT MU 27, 

	

rei 	(7717, tru 717T 29, aTT tiftl 30 *BT4T9' q13341-4 FC:ft aNTTET 
qit flglirtcf 	 f‘747-?Er 3v.iffT TRT 'et 3-th 3747-ET 

	

T7t-tf Rwr-t BTERT=T TT c19': eft cffiTi 	iiq,  
SItiTT 977-f aTTULT * f**4, 4i,T 71-W5T if 3TIAtzT6' TTZT4Tti q!'ert .414 Tit 
t,* afrcifigff, 76914, t44 ‘14.1,7 4 7tafF77. 7,-17Nr wet 79-717 qcr 

719.T ef 9'TM t, TiUttf tITT I" 

	srku alf7- 
fffa7 #77 28 

1979 T't 
TTRT 12 TT 
thrIER 

ErT7T 24 Tr 
tteittrff 

EITTT 25 TT 
#711t.R 

WITT 26 TT 
thit79.  

WV 27 TT 
tigitER 

ETT7T 29 TT 
fftlitrff 

EMI 30 TT 
ER 

971.1 ErT7T 30-T 
q717IT 7T9T 

VITT 4, 

MO 79.0 174T 
Trfaa 

No. 1677 (2)/XVII-V-1-1(KA)-35-1985 

Dated Lucknow September 17, 1985 

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution o 
India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following Englinh translation 
of the Uttar Pradesh Amod Aur Pankar (Sanshodan) Adhiniyam, 1985 (Uttar pradesh 
Adhiniyam Sankhya-29 of 1985), as passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature and assented to 
by the Governor on September 17, 1985: 

THE UTTAR PRADESH ENTERTAINMENTS AND BETTING TAX 
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 1985 

(U. P. ACT nO. 29 of 1985) 
(As passed by the U. P. Legislature) 

AN 
ACT 

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Entertainments and Betting Tax Act, 1979 
IT is HEREBY enacted in the Thirty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as 

follows :- 
1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Entertainments and 	Short title and 

Betting Tax (Amendment) Act, 1985. 	 commencement. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government 
may, by notification, appoint in this behalf. 



?at 31k4T arffiqttal 11'4E, 1 7 fkiffg47, 1985 	 3 

,. 2 	In section 12 of the Uttar Pradesh Entertainments and Betting Tax 
*?Act, 1979, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for 
..;:ihe words "one thousani rupees" the words"two thousand rupees" shall be 
.'iubstituted. • 

In section 24 of the principal Act, for the words "one.thousand 
rupees" the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

In section 25 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words 
-"twenty times" the words "fifty times" shall be substituted. 

In section 26 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (b) 
for the words "two hundred rupees" the words "five hundred rupees" shall 
be substituted. 

In section 27 of the principal Actoror the words "three thousand 
upees" the words "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 
section 12 of 
U. P. Act no. 28 
of 1979. 

Amendment of 
section 24. 

Amendment of 
section 25. 

Amendment of 
section 26. 

Amendment of 
section 27. 

In section 29 of the principal Act, for the words "two 	thousand 	Amendment of 
:rupees" the words "three thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 	 section 29. 

In section 30 of the principal Act, for the words "one thousand 
:rupees" the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

After section 30 of the principal Act, the following section shall be 
inserted, namely :— 	• 

"30-A. Whoever having been convicted of an offence punishable 
under section 24, orsub-section(1) of section 25 or 

Enhanced penalty clause (a) of sub-section (I) of section 26, or section 
after previous 	27, or section 29 or section 30 is again found guilty conviction, 

of an offence punishable under the same provision, 
shall be subject for every such subsequent offence, 

to a fine which may extend to one and half times of the amount of 
fine provided in such provision, besides the sentence of imprisonment 
if any, provided in such provision." 

By order 

B. L. LOOMBA, 
Sachiv. 

Amendment of 
section 30. 

Insertion 	of 
new section 30-A 

410 cf.! tPIO tI07.—g 0 cit0 161 ITT ( kali)) —( 1923)---1 985-7 85 0 (*WO) 1 


	00000001
	00000002
	00000003

