IR TRR-THoTHoW o / Uefo—
5o / UoWle—91 / 2008-10
AZHH ¢ U VT T Eniel Y

HERT TAE, AT q29T

T W9l TR W amiaT|
STHTROT
faurft aRfdre

HA—1, G (D)
(IR waw Irafew)
AEES, IHAR, 14 A4, 2008

WIATT 24, 1929 & W4

H-E&R-108

TR TR PR
faaml ST~

e 519 / 79-fd-1-08-1()-12-2008
TEAE, 14 WG, 2008

ST

fafeer

IR @ CAGRUET @ AgEET 200 @ M UWIUTE HEIRd 7 9RR Wew TR e
(woire) R, 2008 R fRATG 14 A4, 2008 @ AR WET @ IR ¥ WOy aEfrem
e 12 9 2008 @ WO ¥ GHERRY B G $9 SFRRLE g1 ghM A S 2

TR WY R Frm (FeeE) afifgE, 2008
(ST yew A | 12 W 2008)
[ ST SRR ARE fT Wred gRT 9 g |

SR uSw R A e, 1959 @ AR WIS &V @ fog

' srferfam

YRT VRIS @ aved o9 ¥ fa=ikiRee S s9mm omar © -

1—wa®ﬁwwmwmwﬁuﬂ)aﬁﬁw,zooaw e Am

ATOT |



2

ITT AR IATRY TAT, 14 HY, 2008

T WS

o w2

. 2-FR WY TR fFrm aftfwm, 1059 A AR et @ alRfium s

W 1950 A URT AT 8/, YWT 132 H—

132 H
Litilae]

€ 135 &

HY 136 @1

(@) Swum (3) ¥ U UE W@ TUY B WHE W E CUwE e
T T R U ARY Y B WM W IR 9N oE eI v

. &0 Sty

(@) Suur (3-%) A wE RN T T B W W AR T Ay
TOY© AT VR AR ARG TR D WA R UK TRE S 9L T
fod s

(1) SUERT (4) ¥ W= A8 @ WU B WM W IE 9N«
T g A aE |

(@) ST (5) ¥ T UH oG T B W W YE UG o
FOA" QU TR T T TUL7 B WM W AR I o vl w2
T |

(g) Sw (7) ¥ v VWK (3) B WM W Wk YW (3) A
JWR (3-3)" @ Ry Wt |
375 Ao B a1 135 -

(@) orvd e & g o TE TR B WM R K W AW
A @ RA Wl

(@ SR (1) # 7 B A T @ WA W AR T o

v v R A

(1) STRT (1-%) ¥ T IR G U B W R TR TRE
s U W ol s

(@) IR (2) ¥ I U AW FU” B W W wE CNR T
wa- wg R ST '

(%) SN (2) & wvarq Frafafes swurr @@ € @, sfq-

(3) ¥u BN SN (1) W SR (2) F RAffEe afidfe

Wl A orma # gfE @ F1d 9 smaravgea ok e @ gEa

H gfe ¥ e gy, Toe ¥ aftgEe g Suria S) weal |
4—a Jffrm & e 136 W

(@) wred e ¥ vy I8 FE IO B WA W R 4N A
TR vy ey 9|

(@) SUERT (1} ® = 35 OF T D WH R & NG AGE
T v Ry S|

M SR 2) ¥ v Her a9 T B WH W R WY
o vey @ A W |

(@) Swr (2) @ uwErg efafaa g ggr @ S, sl -

(3) wvu WveR Sw (1) W Iww (2) ¥ RAffde affe
Al A wa ¥ gy o wrd B sErgEa i o B e
3 gRe & 3EW g, e ¥ JRgEEr g Sula R gadl 8]



FEN VST WY TN, 14 WTE, 2008 3

TEeY AR FRO

T WV TR e sfRfrE, 1950 (IR WRW ey W 2 w9 1950) 9wy 132
e @ PR ¥ Wi sy o R T § ok e 135 0@ 136 F s Ao o B0l
Q 3% AR e o v W@ ofe TR @ aEin @ W § 9uew ) T §) 9w awed A
At oI & e Syay wageg Aol @ frraa & fie wata 78§ adam # Pt
arafrat @ @rra § gy @ R ek o Pt e @ ) a8 TR € v oRRefea
¥ NG GRER. g faauitg sfowy geel deEet @ farer @ fay o gl g @
el 21 @ g8 Rfvgg fraomn € 5 gw sRfm w @R 5w dlowet @ Fare
AR TR B e D wEw § TR age, 'R, sEeRd 8k ok e aft @ i
AOER &3 B IYH DY JIRT B W |

TETER IR Wy AR A (FeE) s, 2008 QR far o R

ST |,
J0 TR AT ITE],
@ ||

No. S19(2)/1.XXIX-V-1-08-1(Ka)-12-2008
Dated Lucknow, March 14, 2008

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English tfanslatiqn of the Unar Pradesh Nagar Nigam
(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2008 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 12 of 2008) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh
Legislature and assented to by the Governor or March 14, 2008 .

THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2008
(U.P. ACT NO. 12 OF 2008)
[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legisiature]
AN
. ACT
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Aci, 195_9'. '
IT is HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:— :

1. This Act may be .called the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Shert title
(Amendment) Act, 2008.



4

Amendment of
section 132 of
U.P. Act no, 2 of
1959

Amendment of
section 135

Amendment of
section 136

TR oy ™ TN, 14 #Td, 2008

2. In section 132 of the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959

hereinafter referred to 8s the principal Act,-

{a} in sub-section (3) for the words ‘one lakh rupees’ the words fifteeq
lakh rupees’ and for the words ‘five lakh rupees’ the words ‘twenty lgkp
rupees’ shall be substituted,

(b) in sub-section (3-A) for the words ‘two lakh rupees’ the words ‘tey,
lakh rupees’ and for the words ‘four lakh rupees’ the words ‘fifteen laky
rupees’ shall be substituted.

(c} in sub-section {4) for the words ‘eight lakh rupees’ the wordg
‘twenty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted,

{d) in sub-section (5) for the words ‘one lakh rupees’ the words ‘five
lakh rupees’ and for the words ‘two lakh rupees’ the words ‘ten lakh rupces’
shall be substituted,

(e) in sub-section (7) for the words ‘sub-seciion (3)' the words “sub-
section (3) or sub-section (3-A)” shall be substituted,

3. In section 135 of the principal Act,~

{2} in the marginal heading for the words ‘eight lakh rupees’ the words
‘twenty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted,

{b) in sub-section (1) for the words ‘two lakh rupees’ the words ‘ten lakh
rupees’ shall be substituted.

{c} in sub-section (1-A) for the words ‘four lakh rupees the words
‘fifteen lakh rupees’ shall be subsrituzed.

(d} in sub-section (2) for the words ‘five lakh rupees’ the words "twenty
lakh rupees’ shall be substituied.

(e} afier sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely -

{3) The State Government may, by notification in the Gazette,
modify the monetary linuts specified in  sub-section (1) or
sub-section (2) keeping in view the risc of costs or the exigencies of the
work and efficiency of Corporation.

4. In section 136 of the principal Act,~

{a} in the marginal heading for the words ‘eight lakh rupees’ the words
‘twenty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted.

(b} in sub-section (1) jfor the words ‘eight lakh rupees’ the words
*twenty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted,

{¢} in sub-section (2), in clause (a) for the words ‘sixteen lakh rupees’
the words “thirty lakh rupees’ shall be substituted.

(d) afier sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely -

(3) The State Government may, by notification in the Garetie,
modify the monetary limits specified in sub-section (1) or
sub-section (2) keeping in view the nise of costs or the exigencies of the
work and efficiency of Corporation.



IR MY AGRIRE TOE, 14 7Y, 2008

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Section 132 of the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959 (U.P. Act no. 2 of 1959)
makes certain provisions relating to execution of contracts and sections 135 and 136 make provisions
about the estimates not exceeding eight takh rupees and exceeding eight lakh rupees respectively. The
existing provisions of limited amounts in the said sections are not sufficient for the implemention of the
time bound schemes. At present the costs of the construction materials have been increased and the rates
of the Public Works Department have been revised. Under the above circumstances more amount arc
required for the implementation of certain important schemes financed by the Government of India. It has,
therefore, been decided to amend the said Act to provide for increasing financial jurisdictions of the
Municipal Commissioner, the Mayor, the executive committee and the Corporation eltc. in rclation to the
execution of contracts and sanctions of estimates.

The Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation (Amendment) Bill, 2008 is introduced accordingly.

By order,
S.M.A. ABIDI,

Pramukh Sachiv.

flovHogoRo-Totlio 1185 ITTIH (f&e)—{2624)-2008-597 wia—(Fes / JRT) |
- flotRogofo—Todto 456 HofIETA—(2625)-2008 -850 TRITI— (T / ITHHT) |



	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	Untitled

