
m-A-vroz-lo8 -11,N .{-7:fotR1ollto / Sra-  0- 

7.5-no itffol:510-91 / 2008-10 

rItiZ te 	YI 

mcbia 414c, 39T rrnaT  
zwzg-pitzt titemt ITO imam 

317111TEuT 
lblTZtt tiRDitc 

11]r1r--1 , tq 	 () 

(.3-th -sr-a-a S) 
et tg -131, ZJ,Ø 	, 14 1TEIL 2008 

9)1 cd1-1 24, 1929 -Z1T ,t1 

	 3ittZ1 *N471'i 

fevrd't arturr—i 

'ds1 519 / 79-%1-08-1*-12-2008  

cl(1 ‘31, 14 111-4, 2008 

aa-fF9-r 

ITTR--d-  TT TifT119- 	3714e 200 	311119.  I utl LI I ci TeRZT 	\Sul 1Ta7T -14 N- .ftrict 

(34aN) 1=4-EW, 2008 ITZ f4-9i05 14 Trr4, 2008 4;1 31-11T1Pi 	1-f Thai 47 cW.  ‘3-cV ;Feta altifrz111

	 12 ill 2008 	'ink{ 	71-4-11W-TRuT Thar ,it1'112t *•43 3ari-1-497 g 	N1 MO IDI 	 fth7211 vl I Or 

AkIZT .14 1•1 f4117 (T'Arr-T9.) 3-114f4EFf, 2008 

(\61-H 34-a-4T 3IThtkZN dMH 12 d 2008) 

[thrr ‘3-ck VtT itqn Ausei gkr tirft pA 

	 vtzr  	arRrel-AA, 1959. M-1 31rd-7 TiThA <m4 

Arm- 	 ‘3-file4 	A PaZ5d atRiPH-ATT orlim vim! 	 - 

1-4 	f4fARTii 	Cfla-ZT 	 fk118 (117111-19) S, 2008 cpsi 	92Rr917 



2 	 TH.  Atli 3TRITETRuT ,h4d, 14 T1i, 2008 

TT( sr-kr 
arDflim Train 2 	 2- \ii-u1 litzT -/T7 	 3aTn774, 1959 a ca 3114 1 &RA-cm M-6T 

TI .959 et Errzr 77114 SIM 132 4,-
132 
#761.17 

317C7171 (3) 4 'VTRtl did.  .044 *3'2119 LE7 Vig 14- "g cif& 

t44 mit sz-R zim di& t},141 	 vrR 4)tr di& t444 333r 

ftt Rrt# 

(iv) zurtzr-fr (3-R) # vic4 't di& tn-y) 	vv1i4IN vuR u di& 

tn44 wzrr TTR ''r? di& tg44 	 vrR trR-  di& flo.1 

e4-z1 Ri-44 

(4) ‘3.4kric (4) # 11W -3Tra vII& V4TY 	W-IT9 uR 11W 	 di& 

ftz) .ap?izli 

M 3TE1TRT (5) 4 11W -k7W elM t94 	RIR TR.  /TR "tlfT di& 

.0441TT 71-C. -.4 oil& t“-la 	3:Q417 617 71"' 'Tff eiicPkiA 	ittl 

wir4 1 

.JLIHNE (7) 4 71." -31:ITNT (3)- 	W-TTT q 11W -317URT (3) TIT 

WERTIVT (3-)" Taf fa4 77441 

MI 135 MI 
TivrItr9 	 3-1IF 34RIMTT it TRT 135 

(Th.) 141Z4 2fItich 	71g -3TIZeU& \Ilya 	14119 q 	 elM 

211-14 723i ftt 	- 

(73) wcrtim (i) 4 11W -T1 ciit4 tai?) 	74-49 77 7TR -Tff clit4 

tAir) -zur fkz1 ‘40,11 

zzitzrzr (i-R) 4 71 "wrR did twa 	 vrR TrRg 

di& tiga Tdi 	 wer4 

070 3EITTRT (2) ti 11W qjj ctit4 t)144 	WT9 ER-71-C 4)11 mita 

tqa Ttlf itt 	 

(3') J4t4pfl (2)     ZTVRT ii 	I WT41, 3T271T- 

(3) .(ivtl litabH 311tiTT (1) IT 31-41TRT (2) 4 f4fw,d NifitT 

pir The 	 tat ' C1141C1 * rill ZIT 014 Thai 31-dITTVZTWUT 3tk Pii 	if a Tern' 

ift 4 .<tac g, ,ivid 4 aiRRT9T 	 zzwetti 

4-90 37ReaT itt URI 136 4- 

(w) zrry4 .r11447 4 71W -3TT3 Mita to44 	WM. 	11 . -411i eitt4 

TEI 	7T7:17t I 

\3LINNI 0) 4 VI-C "3ITa eu& tva *ptR 'Zig 4)t1 vIM 

t“.14 TO.  ftt uti4411 

(4) WERTRT (2) 4 11g 'i4R-6 	Via 	7419 IN vrR • ci)tr 

di& ti44 Tigt f2.4z1 wrz14 

(El) UtitTRT (2) 	TITTM ThmfaRgcr jqtnrW.dT4tWZ)41, 31T4Tf1 

(3) .<ivel itN)H UTETRT (1) ZIT 311ZIM (2) 4 faf;fate athtiii

t efilid 51Ift'a in cold ittrarratt6WdT artv ftiri ittLar-dr 

RIF cjIk 51 	 q, IulC 51 3a1709i 	w-n-ciPcf M-7iiMt ti 

ETriT 136 
11tH 



3 

WE1 3fr r:Pkur 

Si1T ATR• ThlIH SA 1959 (NitH War aariEHT tits4.11 2 WA 1959) 	UM 132 A 

ifft-cr 	Tht(414-1 	ITA4347 tRNLT 	fa,41 Trttf 3ItV UM 135 •crd 136 	MHYI: 31ThicutS•trHA 

i4 3TARW 3117 31-TU 	k1 	3tRiv 	cR.5414 	•FHti-tf A 374-4-T 1.4? Trzl t \i‘trt tl-Rra4 A 

fjffi trar fwii4 ?3E1474 tHHHieg EN-79T34 141-cro-t 	=Pim 9 t I eri -4 fWin 

itiAft14 	ervid A 	 Tit t att et 	 1244fut ftqm 	.41 T407 t 711 t ‘ichl leaved-EN 

A 1117ff ti'<cON. 	faviralfdct cpRj94ArNirf 	 fli4r-cm-r 	47 3Tli 	EI-Ta 

3-1Fa1Thdr Si 3ifi: Tit MP 	8444 Vbtir 1TZIT tTh5 'acid 31Th1tlii ffi 'di1RkI circ1 er<T3ti 	rzi4I4-1 

URPAA •el ittla 	tHrAk1 A 9-1-R 3TTEFI, Telt corclorRuil trRIZt 3117 Thirg Nit 

3aIWR 843 Thl• 401A $rznt1 wzri 

ct4T-N 

 

'ai' 3i 91R 	ij.j (t/NM) fazTT, 2008 y:7P- th-71 undf t 

armr 

9u16 374-Ri aITe 

Tip( Trka 

No. 519(2)/DOUX-V-1-08-1(1(a)-12-2008 
Dated Luclazow, March 14, 2008 

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor is 

pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Nagar .Nigam 

(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2008 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sanlchya 12 of 2008) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh 

Legislature and assented to by the Governor or March 14, 2008 . 

THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION 

(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2008 

(U.P. ACT NO, 12 OF 2008) 

[As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature] 

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959. • 

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as 

follows:- 

1, This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation 	5110110e 

(Amendment) Act, 2008. 



wffi sthr wirm 7r3z, 14 MA 2008 

2. In section  132 of the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959
,  

hereinafter referred  to  as themcm: al Act,— 

in sub-section (3)for the words 'one lakh rupees' the words 'fifteen 

lakh rupees' and for the words 'five lakh rupees' the words 'twenty lakh 

rupees' shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (3-A)for the words 'two lakh rupees' the words 'ten 

lakh rupees' and for the words 'four lakh rupees' the words 'fifteen lakh 

rupees' shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (4) for the words 'eight lakh rupees' the words 

'twenty lakh rupees' shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (5) for the words 'one latch rupees' the words 'five 

lakh rupees' and for the words 'two lakh rupees' the words 'ten lakh rupees' 

shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (7) for the words 'sub-section (3)' the words "sub-

section (3) or sub-section (3-A)" shall be substituted. 

3. In section 135 of the principal Act,— 

4 

Amendment or 
section 132 of 
U.P. Act no. 2 of 
1959 

Amendment of 
section 135 

in the marginal heading for the words 'eight lakh rupees' the words 

'twenty lakh rupees' shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (1)for the words 'two lakh rupees' the words 'ten lakh 

rupees' shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (1-A) for the words 'four lakh rupee he words 

'fifteen lakh rupees' shall be substituted. 

in sub-section (2) for the words 'five lakh rupees' the word nty 

lakh rupees' shall be substituted. 

after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted 

namely :— 

Amendment of 
section 136 

(3) The State Government may, by notification in the Gazette, 

modify the monetary limits specified in sub-section (1) or 

sub-section (2) keeping in view the rise of costs or the exigencies of the 

work and efficiency of Corporation. 

4. In section 136 of the principal Act,— 

in the marginal heading for the words 'eight lakh rupees' the words 

'twenty lakh rupees' shall be substituted 

in sub-section (1) for the words 'eight lakh rupees' the words 

'twenty lakh rupees' shall be substituted 

in sub-section (2), in clause (a) for the words 'sixteen lakh rupees' 

the words 'thirty lakh rupees' shall be substituted 

after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, 

namely :— 

(3) The State Government may, by notification in the Gazette, 

modify the monetary limits specified in sub-section (1) or 

sub-section (2) keeping in view the rise of costs or the exigencies of the 

work and efficiency of Corporation. 

 

 



‘31-1•1 Crata 34elITRu1 livid, 14 'ii t, 2008 
	

5 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

Section 132 of the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959 (UP. Act no:2 of 1959) 

makes certain provisions relating to execution of contracts and sections 135 and 136 make provisions 

about the estimates not exceeding eight lakh rupees and exceeding eight lakh rupees respectively. The 

existing provisions Of limited amounts in the said sections are not sufficient for the implcmention of the 

time bound schemes. At present the costs of the construction materials have been increased and the rates 

of the Public Works Department have been revised. Under the above circumstances more amount are 

required for the implementation of certain important schemes financed by the Govemment of India. It has, 

therefore, been decided to amend the said Act to provide for increasing financial jurisdictions of the 

Municipal Commissioner, the Mayor, the executive committee and the Corporation etc. in relation to the 

execution of contracts and sanctions of estimates. 

The Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation (Amendment) Bill, 2008 is introduced accordingly. 

By order, 

S.M.A. ABIDI, 

Promuklz Sachip. 

tfloVilolipto-Roto 1185 	 (fto)-(2624)-2008-597 uffini—(4,4•41c(lai1'sike)i 

1114ock;414—Rolito 458 F141411111-(2625)-2008 -850 gratt-(011ZECi/375-AZ) 


	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	Untitled

