GUJARAT BILL NO. 11 OF 2019.
THE GUJARAT STAMP (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2019.

ABILL

Jurther to amend the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958.

Ul 20%¢q] ofxRUd QRS suis: 14,

AAA R (YUY QRAas, 204¢.

ARl R UARAAY, 1eUc dy YuRal oitotd Qas,

e, eurdell dgREAA AAM il o Ded U@RB2ly S
A B:-

T (1) AAURRUA oA R (iRl wWRRRH, 209¢ sdadl, 54 distl wA

UL,
(R) A, AU ABR, ABUAUL WBetdll o5 5> A sy

BHAHL AL,

Wtteed 2 opepRud Ru UBRAM, Leuc (Rl w6 ugdl, “Hul p(Rlelarn ¥t reuca

yugell soul. . . - Yolgell SOML
AE GeAwW scli wel B Q)i Uy i, w Bl
q I3 2] [a_ -
(1) Aulset -4, “AsA 30 A wAA wed, “oeRl 3Reu u"i? el
YRl

A ACEl Y

(R) wUsct 3-ui, “Asdl A" A AEA e, “el 3w A

ACEL sl

(3) wlsct ¥-ui, “cla 3@au” A 2wl wed, “UAR 3au” A
AGEL Ysa;

H-218-1-(SIS-10)



(W)

(s)

(9)

(¢)

(€)

URset u-di, vis @)l “As A R’ A 2w WEQ,
QR 3R A AGEL Y5

UEse e-ul, vl (5) AR (GYU, A wUR el “Asa

M A Al UEQ, ofsN “oARN 3R 7 A e ysl;

UEset 10-1f, “As A 3R A AR Wed, “aA 3w

A 2eel ysa;

UEset 1-Hl, “AsA 3R A 26lA e, “oerRll 3R
A ALl Ysay;

AURse 13-4, “AsAW 3R A AcEA HeQ, “oleR 3
A 9c€l Yseall;

AR5t 15-Hi, “AsA 3R A 26l oled, “aRN 3R
A 2ACEl Ysa;

(10) AUECsc 1e-ui, “AsA 302" A A€l oed, “oi 3Rau”

A 6El Ysau;

(11) wsct a-ui, “AsA 3R’ A Al ¢led, “AA 30

A cEl Hsdll;

(1R) Alsct 22-ui, “AsA 30" A A6l wed, “aRiA 3R

A AGEL Yo

(13) AWRset 3-ui, “AsA 32’ A AELA e, “ARRN 3@

A el Ysay;

(1¥) AU@set u-Hi, “AsA 3R’ A 26€ld oled, “AeiA 3@

A 2loel ysa;



() AURsA 2e-ui, “AsqQ 3@?1[” A 20€l oled, “agill 3R
A Al ysay;

(15) st 32-ui, “Asq 3R A w6 Wed, “otll 3R
A AGEL Ysal;

(19) AURsc 33-1f, “Asa 3R A 268 oued, “oRiRl 3R
A 2ACEL Ysa;

(1¢) vl@set 33-ui, “AsA 3R 7 A 2368 Hed, “o 3R
A ACEl ysal;

(1¢) AUEsel 3u-ui, vis (s)ui, “AsA 3Qa” A 2w GleQ,
“ogll 3 A 2wkl ysay;

(20) BUCsct 3¢, “clu 3@2u” A 26AA wed, “wuwn 3y

A ACEL Ysel;

(R9) WRscl 3e-di, vis (@)Hl, “AsW 3" A Al WEQ,

“AQRN M A 2AGEL g

() wEset ¥a-ui, “AsA 3R A AN eled, “auid EIR

A 2ACEl ysal;

(23) ABsel ¥y-u, -

(8) uls (UL, Vet-uwis (w)ul, “AsA 3@al 7 A wedA

WeQ, “olAl 3 A ACEL ysay;

(W) uls (3)HL, Uat-uis (u)ui, “AsA 3R 7 A Al

WeQ, “olll A A ACEL Ysay;



(R¥) AUBsct ¥u-uj,

(5) Sl (5), (W), (31), (W) AR (RU)HL, “As A 3au 7 A
AsElel Gled, “ARQRA 32" A el ysa;

(W) us ()L, Qe-uis () (5)ul, “AsA 3" A A6l

GEQ, “IAQR 3RA" A 2A6El ysa;

(RW) wset ¥s-Hi, “AsA 3R A Al Hed, “agill 3(Qau”
A 2eEl ysay;

(25) Esct ¥o-ui, “AsAl 3R’ A WA Hed, “oa 3R
A 200€l Yysa;

(R9) AUEset ye-ul, “AsA 32" A A6l Ged, “oRR 3(an
A 6El Ysay;

(R¢) WEsct ¥¢-s-ui, vis (s)Ml, “AsA 30" A AN WA,

“AQR 30 A Al Ysa;

(2¢) AUEsct e, vis (5)U, “AsA 30" A WA wed, “odl

321 A 2cEl ysay

(30) AlCsct ua-uj, “AsAW 3R’ A WA ole@, “og 3@

A AGEL Ysal;

(30) wlset uu-ui, “alsdll 30" A Al e, “ARR 32

A Aol ysa;

(32) AEsc ws-ui, Visl (W), (O AR ()H], “WAsA 3R’ A

Al Gled, “AQAl 3 A 2cEl Ysal;

(33) s Uc-Hi, VSl (5) wA ()M, “AsA 3R A 2AcEla

WE, “oQl 301 A 2ACEL Ysa;



GEall A s1R00

Y5 Ul UR, JJaRAd Riu WRR2M, 1eycod] UAYR 1l ealAcl
el YAl Qauw Al B, UER AUMRYRL 1 36015l 25 clac uRell
R sYeletl (@A €2, Aot 2008l AtiRe] el adl, A ¥ ol U
AUUL U(Es g3 5128, Aastase] uBHEL uA HEL oA, Aals o1y atll
AAG B. Aell, &R wotctl B calasldl, AUl (RARAAL) AR ARAAL
clactelt qell R sydlott el el Qe €31 aY A5l olotlccllo]
%331 QU B,

AU [QRasl, Gusct GRat R s2c M2, Aol 1eUcall UERE @ Aan
YRl W .

sl@s w3,

tResla ddl Aol aie)

A [Quasell, QAN oottt Aoiudi bl Yol Auels(l
BWLAUY sAAUHL WA B:-

S -l osetell Ra-set ()l AU AR, AU
eI, UG AUEEAAN B AR M 20 A AW o158l s2cltell

Al HA B.

Guafsc tuisla Aol Wusll ulagAs WA UM Ysioll .

ARl R-% s, 204c¢. slls w2

H-218-2-(SIS-10)



yaell
ARl R ARAAH, 1eU¢ (et eUCall Yoigell

ARRUH suis souyuil Gl

UGY[R ¢

AUl BUR Ry sy2l.
(@l e 3)

Auall YsiR

ARy Ry sydl

2. ddlel@lwddl, MRdell Rl
AURRAM, 16U 60 Ul Y213
Al dls @AM, 1¢930ll 56 s
3601 AUUAL Mol YHIAL WA B,

AsA 3

3. eds U, Aed ¥ Ul exls
(Qtuotoll ol Slat wucl Fott Gurel
gtls Aclloll @SR WL 2t Al
AU A da A (Qet-
Rcuatsi) 5l Aul.

UsA 30U

¥. AdieajR(33(Qe), Adi Woie
Acll oled, yldsil Ul WAsAR
srcllefl stauelell 2 8l A AR
scll uldstt watcl As:AA 1Al
AU B,
gl

Aol AU Al ASRAR AR —
(5) c2sR AURBRAU, 1euo waudl
Quist e wRRAaH, 1euo ds0l ol
et AUcttol ARd 313 sl sl U3,
(W) S8 sleHl wudl 58 5léall
UM U 5o v Guallal
sallell dlesilds 34 uR sl A
QUR, WU

lu 3




() 88 Al S8 Vodlel WU
Auteetsll 254 Aacll od Aecu o 3q
Hie sl dla,

U 56Cld AUl So{Aldell xcldeyr
AUl dof 35§

(5) &l () XXX XXX XXX
(23) AeAUL SIS 53] o QA Al

gl

SOCld AUl 5OAldell  Exclldey
AUl Aof 35§

(5) %@ HIA HlE AUl AUReAL Hids(]
wWdlel 3 Aaiel W wydl A deitl
glal Ul Foll GUR Al wdsetoll
allt(ed), ollel(U), ollt(e9) welel
ollel (%) &850 (5Y3l) Aauuiat dlat Acll
SG{ Al AUl SO{CElldoll E3clA% ol

ulsA 3

gl mual AwBse ¥o dsa (538l
Aot sl A ALEl «f Sl q;

(W) % 88 cllot M2 wWaUdl A Aoitl
S0 URBRA UG 20520l oliell
yudl sl sl q;

¢. udl Ul sl [Augs;

Qe ot 82 Aal sl8 Auell 53l Ha,
U AsA 3
(5) elulell ysAl 32
(W) %o Al ULAR Resdstll

90, eld wdd Ad A 2@ | Asa 3
Sleoll §5H &6 5Rclle] 8l A R
oly A 52l wstzell waay
HERUSel.




| )

(5) % sRR ¥ yelisot M As o
watsRell Bl W2 sdd Aa wR
Bl sofElldal l]l wUcl  stAELsU
U ] uasiRlal Slsuel da
Hiol sclloll %32 of A2y, Q.

(W) sHlotera o1l Ay wuclell
U sAcdall HIZ wsell wwsRell
(Bud.

. AW u2llu-sls-ani 518 | AsA 3=
AU, g AUl s1H llual W2
58 Hr2Rell sld oA yiew Ay
AY(RYU, sREeL AUl A5l s3]
Aoitll ueal A Aluaal doitll Aey
ES CLWIGLAl AHLAL UL B.
Wl

? Yulust Aull 58 Al
5l ldeslAs wvtladl e wae
Aol WA AYRU 33 vl 8t Q
APl allusll Aul.

13. Yslel, Ae@ S8 elal g(aulet | AsA 3R
sleatt gsH Rat olly fd s
AMIgL(REU) GuRel (Aeuesst sctlq]
| gHldAl Yslel ot Sa vdl, sy
AlE el Hr2Au8 WA 818 Al
EECE
sl

oesAd  sLRUW@st  w@Ean,
1es3el SEM RSC UAAU  Youlsell
duRURL Qe sltedotl AR,

| L¢9¥e{l sdAn 1¢ dsnatl YSIEN,




|
15, € scllall AW- (RAUUE 53

AN 58 Aw B Gurell 2 sal Al
A Qul (@A) A A GuR ww s3] A

ddl d 12 ol A Rl sdl of
& Al

sRIAUCA (AR ¥e), cacRauua  2e
scllell AU(eiolR U-W), U wel
AUl Ealell Qu(eiolk wu), 22 2
sclloll AW (o6l Ue-u) URL AL

AsA 30

6. Udlde-uid, ded % 518 Aul 58
ERLER 531 A A2t uA R Gurall
d Welell Aeasd Aclett ABERSU
cletd dueld s3 w D wyal %
Guell A Auleetl Avusll udiaesdl
U wAUA slellses ABMA Ysaialsll
cloRUl sCUHL A B wA A
ARLER] 511 BorUs2Aell ZuRW 501
UAAl  ABAR U YyHd  Qell
ARLERl cleud uctlaat @Y %
Gurell s1A¢ B A Aut.

AsA 3

29, else LAl 6D, B wil osal
A GARl glal oled Y ¥t
wEsEl wadl Aol gsH Guaell
YRl 531 &l A Roll Gur 58
Sl Aoldl A UHA wHeHl A Add
sRLEL Yol gl Aatuat Ul o §la Q.
Hsl
(5) 88 ssll asct, ® S8 453
SAHL Aval HZ AU 518 24813
st W, 58 wesiil wBsER

AsA 3

H-218-3-(SIS-10) &




scllofl uaal el 32 B Ay
SIRAEIHL AU U 621c?) 8l Q.

() %o, GMRBU, stMsw, wulal,
@0at, £921BSL, HRQL UMYl Eot Hoitl]
58 Aol asd Ul Axiol
GllRl.

. WMl Aw uual ol dtsd, syl
A ddl A Adl uA B Aol
Al syl @il dla det Bl Awt,

sl
gl AU B A8 ugtoll sydl Hs
531 8l Aol WA Aw,

AsAl 30

3. 5RH ollos AUl ASAULBR 605,
AeA ¥ A AHA wHAMl &l Al Ay
slAElell  osolcUsU AUl seH
Wl AsUBRedl g5 ULl sy g0
HEZ AUl doll AoiuHl seU AUl
AsRABRoil 518 st N
AR AAAL U2 AUl A 2locllell
gl weslaal e HUdl da adaldl
oy 58wl wAdl dd W2
AU 518 llos.

s 3002

U, waldsl alotdel Au, AeA ¥ ¥
A GuRdl sl  cala Wl
Adstoly S A.

ElA%L Wcl- AUl W (e UR)
sl

ol atsci- A Qui(eletz 22) oyl

AsA 32

e, sl wd- seruseallu wd usAL 3au
3. oliaul uAt AsA 3Mau
33.ClLA”CY UA, A2A ARER Wicltoll | AsA 3(Qaut

10




q{l:)teu RlEre s una yell Qs |
Al Ul AQERA Aol AN QAo
HEl secl E-Al Qe WA Aol
ARLELRL o2 YA soicld.

3¥. oot ollugll AsAl 3au

U suelle Wdesu g | AsaA 3R
A QA A got-
(8) Aoll WA Sull wuARan,
1eusell st 25 350 W5t s
AWAA%A Qat A,
(W) XXX XXX XXX

il
d§l HIE RRAUAAA o 8lal A Suol]
URRAUH, 1eusel sau 24 s
AtAd &la Adl 5l AR 2oto]
NHRoSH,

3¢otledle  cug, WAed  Weell | A 3R
alalell sl astacdl aua oledAR
Ul o2l Ay stzu: A sl
502 ol 5l cAlBAR 2 wsll
Ul SEA,  BoAlERe]  YHLUA (l042
¥s) of Sl ddl sl Qw, A, R4
AW, YU HaLcll o,

W uly @d waal Ry
ol.¥5) UBl Y.

3¢. A4 waual adl, A8 ccud wuc | As 3R
Ao Wellall Yul AWAA wid «12
YHE wilel 3 auw sale Aal el
sal v WsAdl-

(5) dl (89) XXX XXX XXX

(%) US| sH{lotoll{loA,




WdlselL- Auidl wea A ad
QSR Aol W2 u»a H@AS Weo
HE driEl WEL (Ramet) wRRAN,
1euR ofl SEAM R oll uis(s) Ui cavay
sal  yololl A5 AsuUABex
(QRUR) AUl ANRAAA UiRsd
secll  Qastase] 35§ (8Asd@s
AU UcAAUL), Al UEscotl 3 HER
R4 wera €l Adisf owudl.”,

LeeR d60L elal wudl stelaudlui
A6 Sl AR;

¥ dAsl@ell MIR? s olle g | AsA 3R
Y2 - dslRlell HRRY 52l W2
(ele1R-%9) UL %A
¥y, elo(letdl
(1) XXX XXX XXX
(R)(8) XXX XXX XXX
(W) al-us (s)Hl GeAWAl s2Ql Asal 3@a
Ratatell w2 S8 S0t URLUA
HLERlell Uit g0 Aut,
(3) @leldlo] (Aot
(8) XXX XXX XXX
(w) oflest Sl Y Asl 3
’ ﬁb{c?-ll,?_;tllj QAsill ot A dd | AsA 3Mau
SAH (WML cUVAUL 5 YSLR]-
(5) As o Adstasell doluHi As
AUl dUR  Exdlldy  RABw?
sAACAL % & HI2 YUl Al As ¥
aulr  exlldw s3I AMUdAle]  50d
sclloll 3 M2 53 8L, U,
(W) YRsa{l et 51 518 WG,
AsA 3

1z




U uis (s)ul weuddl oind Raia
ollog As o Aastasui st secy W
Us U duUd AR A Gurel
AUEAsR WU At

(A5 scll dud AcsTasui uaal
UMHloAd: AsHA A5 o 54 520
MR WA sl aud o Aed
RN A Guell ARSI WUl
e, _uy;

(U) A5 sl dud  AdstasHi
AU AUHRAA: AsHA A5 o 51
SRl ME UA Al qAud upl ey
5l dUR oifd Aedl RN
Guell AU@stR wuctell S, @ud:
(89) (1) XXX XXX XXX
(R)%AH [Aesde] ARl waa
doglell Ay WA wudl 2y,
Uy R sal UAsSIR BUclol
sl R,

(5) M, M, eus, Ao, uell, u@,
Yo, Yo, A, Qoflal uuaedl A
Al

(M) XXX XXX XXX

(¥) XXX XXX XXX

(3) ollst Slsuel yid

U 520L-0 UL AUEsAeAL B W2
As 5l AU ABARA, > A5 %
Ul Sl R, As caABd 3
ST

AUEl5201-2 “RABR ot A AsMl,

AsA 3

AsA 3

AsA 30201

AsA 3=

A s 3M=20

H-218-4-(S15-10) %




ARt URRAM, 1¢0¢ dsiall
ABReletal AUNBLs €35 st
¥HLAL Ul B,

AWl50-3 s (©9) s,
HuelRellHil GUR, 532l @dl Sl ua
A Ascda cdold @AAFR wd,
HuRUReAY $R01R 5t UA Boll
AR¥QAHL A sReuMl wie] A A
RS A YulRUReAHL AU
wenl weRj Sla R, HANZR vd
Gurell s3y2l YuluRetHt Gurs(l
sydl Becll watsla MeAsdoll ootz
(Bt GuR oglddl s2ell sydl awual.

¥s. @a s W2 Al oAle g
W2, Aded ¥ [@QRAHaus uual
WA olleall votler gal W@
dledA waal A 3 sz A
sl selR olly 58 AR s2AQ
516 A As?AR.

AsAl 3021

¥9. colllell MR W3 Azd ¥
ettt [@otsll caleral Aot uaua
Rl ol Ucotl 3l AQ A
aslilell Ugell ([Qotdlell ¥ Slsuw
ASA AvAL 8l A el sl Hid
ol ABLRUL ollotcl wacll deleHial
Hl ot Gl olledd AERR AUl BA
Hd Hlsell gl d calsd (sousell)
A3g AQ @ As2A2 sAl 8l Q, wau
Aadl AsAR GUR o2l w53
Slal AUl YHIUA e At U,

AsAl 3L

1y




ABIQloll MR S oz s U2
(elolR ¥1) el AL

¥¢. A y3ell Metsdef 3@ J2uie.

AsA 3

¥¢s. AWRl wed @5 AsuAser
(RuAR)  uUdl  AARAs HR§d
secll Qastase 35§ (sAsAMs e
BoRA2),-

(5) AR ool At 2w
uAdA colg dlat, Al '

W) ol (1) XXX XXX XXX
Wlsel 1. AUBsd U waa
AUYAIL, 3¢ 3601 SYS  eRami
Al Q2 A soEtd wuc Aol 358
uAdl RE waar wél Gur,
AUEset s e sy8l Acuua yd
oi(8.

WUlSBL R uis(u) ol 3 W,
“afleto(lAA" oA, RsyIA el
(Rans) u@ER, qeus 2501
sAUML AUAAl catvel YHdal 2wl
.

AUsA 321

ve. gRoldl- NeA 3 (sa 2y ol
Aoty sal Yyl sRadl o aa
Aal) 518 AW Ul wyal e AR
53l Bscd Guall el 1€l & D A-

(5) WRUWLLA AASA WA Aol ULl
sRAAL AQu, eldl Al Eollrell ous
Al odot (Bl B EellRell
Mt Rctlott ctasl) Aetel You viae yofl
UL USAL Y] WREA Yololl Yol (WU,
[ Al UsAl He) wRet Yool Yl

AsAl 3020

iy




sl Rl saa Hicdl AUl Aot
YAl CURell Aol  slAE UL
ARYEIRAA s Sl A Aol
ARFQUHL sl WA Qs

(W) XXX XXX XXX

U, lletutcd ueal 20Aud.- A8 sl
st Al A src @A wacn Aeell
3 ¥ ol wacdl ol Aesd 1A A
(Bl 2uct QA astllotolldl a3 s
AU Sl A UYL $RAA AR ULElel
He {531 we dla a-

sl
ollos Al oflol Qut, -
(5) wMlel eclulell AU BRUAUEA
Adall sl oflst Slsuer st w2
vietd(l Gurellell wd @u@Rs wuds €2
HEA Y5 28U scdl Al AR A
el 2 ot(d Al widudl wuas 39
He 818 A3l sl S, _u;
(W) Hoo Ry wERRAH 1coe ol
SAH 95 &601 A%A U s R
Hosol sl Sl UR;
(1) wHlot YuUiRRU Aot URBRAH, 1¢¢3
360 AUl Wy Aot URR2UM, ey
gomt AR Aotk ABARIA  wual
AHetl sl uee LAl ol
Wl el Hizell Hledlldl weat sl
slal UR;
(e1) 518 &lalo] sIM A=l A eestata W2
weal A alate{l 331 @ Yl aal ol
Retsct 1A Aol 0o A Bt wua
iz ARs3l AURSFRAAD vyl Anst
w{lolA s2l 2, U,

AUsA 32

. ugl olsl Eallall ercts-

AsAL 300

1€




—

H$l
U2 8ISl Bl exlldy, wad Q gl
Gue{l sydl wis s Aa,

us. dolelel-(mAy URA wuc wdo
cPIR)
(5) XXX XXX XXX
(W) (W) ollos, olAud waar sl
Welll Gurell drel A 98 Betoll
O AsPRReR Yot AR, 1¢53
ofl sett 22 360iell 518 Retsdoll,
() As 22l wAell ol 281 waay
2@l WAl B@stAR wdr asz 52l
818 2ol Metsdodl.

wsl
AA cvlla s¥el dotélell-
(5) QRAMaun, A5 wga WA
alleol;
() @et 25 AR, elladl 2082, W
WECall k2 Wl HIA GURell 85oll
oflost AUR idell excttAeo]l;
1) el Wellalled;
(1) 506 ARSReAl A letalNAAL

AsA 3Qa
AsAl 3

AsAl 3020

uc. gre-

5. (At o QA Al S8 cvel Gursll
SAUHL AR &, AR By RAesdoll
Al A WAetl greell end2Ad.

WL S8 Aesott wacl A 2l g2 Rct
Reuatstt Asugl Au Guell 2€ 524,

AsA 3

AsA 3

H-218-5-(SIS-10) o




1e



1¢



el [Quustyen yuRwca

Rlel 201¢9) oAt [QBas suis: 14

AU R ARRAUYN, 1euc day YuRal
oot @QBas.

(2l sls w2e,
ueya wAlsll ]

(Mol 0%¢oll YAl HBollell -9 AR
YA UL AUl YR sl Yorol)

Sl A, ue,
AR,

At (Auusiueu.

HRs3 MR Yaoue, aitlaorR

RO



THE GUJARAT STAMP (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2019.
GUJARAT BILL NO. 11 OF 2019.
A BILL
Jurther to amend the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958.

[t is hereby enacted in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Gujarat Stamp (Amendment) Act,
2019.

@) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

H-215-1 (SIS-10)

Short title and
commencement.



Amendment of
Schedule I to
Bom. LX of
1958.

2. In the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958, in Schedule I,-

)

(i)

(iii)

(iv)

v)

(vi)

(vii)

(viii)

(ix)

(xi)

(xii)

(xiii)

in article 2, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 3, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 4, for the words “Twenty rupees”, the words
“Fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 5, in clause (h), for the words “One hundred rupees”, the
words “Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 9, in clauses (a) and (b), for the words “One hundred
rupees”, occurring at two places, the words “Three hundred
rupees” shall be substituted, respectively;

in article 10, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 11, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 13, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted,

in article 16, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted,

in article 19, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 21, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 22, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 23, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words

“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

Bom. LX of
1958.



(xiv)

(xv)

(xvi)

(xvii)

(xviii)

(xix)

(xx)

(xxi)

(xxii)

(xxiii)

W

in article 25, for the words “Qne hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted:

in article 29, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted:;

in article 32, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 33, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 34, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 35, in clause (a), for the words “One hundred rupees”,
the words “Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 38, for the words “Twenty rupees”, the words “Fifty
rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 39, in clause (g), for the words “One hundred rupees”,
the words “Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 41, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

in article 44,-

(2) in clause (2), in sub-clause (b), for the words “One hundred
rupees”, the words “Two  hundred rupees” shall be

substituted,

(b) in clause (3), in sub-clause (b), for the words “One hundred
rupees”, the words “Two hundred rupees” shall be

substituted;

(xxiv) in article 45,-

(a) in clauses (a),(b),(c),(d) and (e), for the words “One hundred
rupees”, the words “Three - hundred rupees” shall be

substituted,



(b) in clause (f), in item (ii), in sub-item (a), for the words “One
hundred rupees”, the words “Three hundred rupees™ shall be
substituted;

(¢) in clause (h), for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words
“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxv) in article 46, for the words “One hundred rupees™, the words

“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxvi) in article 47, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words

“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxvii) in article 48, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words

“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted,;

(xxviii) in article 48-A, in clause (a), for the words “One hundred
rupees”, the words “Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxix) in article 49, in clause (a), for the words “One hundred rupees”,
the words “Two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxx) in article 51, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words

“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxx1) in article 55, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words

“Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(xxxii) in article 56, in clauses (b),(c) and (d) for the words “One hundred
rupees”, the words “Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted,;
(xxxiii) in article 58, in clauses (a) and (b) for the words “One hundred

rupees”, the words “Three hundred rupees” shall be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Certain instruments are chargeable with duty of the amount indicated
in Schedule I to the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958. The fixed stamp duty rate on
some Articles under the said Schedule I has not been enhanced since 2014,
although the transaction volume and value both have increased many times
due to economic growth in the country and the State. It is, therefore,
considered necessary to further rationalize the various fixed stamp duty rates
in order to bring in reasonability, rationality and simplicity for the public in

general.

This Bill seeks to amend the said Act of 1958 to achieve the aforesaid
object.

KAUSHIK PATEL,

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Bill provides for delegation of legislative power in the following

respects:--

Clause 1.— Sub-clause (2) of this clause empowers the State
Government to appoint by notification in the Official Gazette, the date on

which the said Act shall come into force.

The delegation of legislative power, as aforesaid, is necessary and is
of a normal character. ‘

Dated the 2™ July, 2019. KAUSHIK PATEL.

H-215-2 (SIS-10)



ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE GUJARAT STAMP ACT, 1958.

(Bom. LX OF 1958)

SCHEDULE 1.
STAMP DUTY ON INSTRUMENTS.
(See section 3)

Description of Instrument Proper stamp-duty

2. ADMINISTRATION - BOND, One hundred rupees.
including a bond given under the Indian
Succession Act, 1925 or section 6 of the
Government Saving Banks Act, 1873.

3. ADOPTION-DEED, that is to say, any One hundred rupees.
instrument (other than a will) recording an
adoption or conferring of purporting to confer an
authority to adopt.

4. AFFIDAVIT, including an affirmation of Twenty rupees.
declaration in the case of persons by law
allowed to affirm or declare instead of swearing.

Exemptions
Affidavit to declaration in writing when made —

() as a condition of enrolment under the
Amy Act, 1950 or the Air Force Act,
1950;

() for the immediate purpose of being field
or used in any Court or before the officer
of any court; or

(©) for the sole purpose of enabling any
person to receive any pension or
charitable allowance.

S. AGREEMENT OR MEMPRANDUM OF
AN AGREEMENT OR ITS RECORDS-

(a) to (gb) XXX XXX XXX
One hundred rupees.




(h) if not otherwise provided for
Exemption

Agreement or Memorandum of Agreement or
its records,-

(a) for or relating to the purchse or sale of
goods or merchandise exclusively, not
being an agreement or memorandum of
agreement chargeable under entry (d) ,
entry (e), entry (f) or entry (g) of this article
or NOTE or memorandum chargeable
under article 40;

(b) made in the form of tenders to the Central
Government for or relating to any loan.

9. APPOINTMENT IN EXECUTION OF A
POWER;

where made by any writing not being a will-
(a) of trustees

(b) of property movable or immovable

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

10. APPRAISEMENT OR VALUATION
made otherwise than under an order of the Court
in the course of a suit.

Exemption

(a) Appraisement or valuation made for the
information of one party only, and not
being in any manner obligatory between
parties either by agreement or operation
of law.

(b) Appraisement of crops for the purpose
of ascertaining the amount to be given to
a land-, lord as rent.

One hundred rupees.

11. APPRENTICESHIP-DEED, including
every writing relating to the service or tution of

One hundred rupees.




any apprentice, clerk or servant, placed with any
master to learn any profession, trade or
employment.

Exemption
Instrument of apprenticeship by which a

person is apprenticed by or at the charge of any
public charity.

13. AWARD, that is to say, any decision in
writing by an arbitrator or umpire, not being an
award directing a partition on a reference made
otherwise than by an order of the Court in the
course of a suit.

Exemption

Award under the Gujarat Municipalities Act,
1963 section 268.

One hundred rupees.

16. CANCELLATION - Instrument of
(including any instrument by which any
instrument previously executed is cancelled), if
attested and not otherwise provided for.

See also Release (No. 49), Revocation of
Settlement (no. 52-B) , Surrender of Lease
(no. 55), Revocation of Trust (No. 58-B).

One hundred rupees.

19. COMPOSITION -DEED, that is to say,
any instrument executed by a debtor whereby he
conveys his property for the benefit of his
creditors or whereby payment of a composition
or dividend on their debts is secured to the
creditors, or whereby provision is made for the
continuance of the debtor’s business, under the
supervision of inspectors or under letters of
licence for the benefit of his creditors.

One hundred rupees.

21. COPY OF EXTRACT, certified to be a
true copy or extract by or by order of any public
officer and not chargeable under the law for the
time being in force relating to the court fees.

One hundred rupees.




Exemptions

(a) Copy of any paper which a public
officer is expressly required by law to
make or furnish for record in any public
office or for any public purpose.

(b) Copy of, or extract from any register
relating to births, baptisms, namings,
dedications, marriages, divorces, deaths
or burials.

22. COUNTERPART OR DUPLICATE of
any instrument chargeable with duty and in
respect of which the proper duty has been paid.

Exemption

Counterpart of any lease granted to cultivator
when such lease is exempted from duty.

One hundred rupees.

23. CUSTOMS BOND OR EXCISE BOND,
that is to say, any bond given pursuant to the
provisions of any law for the time being in force
or to the directions of any officer of Customs or
Excise for, or in respect of, any of the duties of
Customs or Excise or for preventing frauds or
evasions thereof or for any other matter or thing
relating thereto.

DECLARATION OF ANY TRUST , See
Trust (No. 58) )

One hundred rupees.

25. DIVORCE, Instrument of, that is to say,
any instrument by which any person effects the
dissolution of his marriage.

DOWER- Instrument of, See Settlement
(No. 52) DUPLICATE, See Counterpart
(No.22)

One hundred rupees.

29. INDEMNITY BOND

INSPECTORSHIP - DEED (See
Composition Deed (No. 19)

One hundred rupees.

32. LETTER OF GUARANTEE

One hundred rupees.

H-215-3 (SIS-10)




10

33. LETTER OF LICENCE, that is to say, any
agreement between a debtor and his creditors,
that the letter shall, for a specified time, suspend
their claims and allow the debtor to carry on
business at his own discretion.

One hundred rupees.

34. MARRIAGE REGISTRATION

One hundred rupees.

35. MEMORANDUM OF ASSOCIATION
OF A COMPANY-

(a) if accompanied by articles of association
under section 10 of the Companies Act, 2013;

(b) xxx XXX XXX
Exemption
Memorandum of any association not formed

for profit and registered under section 8 of the
Companies Act, 2013.

One hundred rupees.

38. NOTARIAL ACT, that is to say, any
instrument, endorsement, note, attestation,
certificate or entry not being a Protest (No. 46)
made or signed by a Notary in the execution of
the duties of his office, or by any other person
lawfully acting as a Notary.

see also Protest of Bill or Note (No. 46)

Twenty rupees.

39.NOTE OR MEMORANDUM, sent by a
Broker or Agent to his principal intimating the
purchase or sale on account of such principal—

(a) to (f) XXX XXX XXX
(g) of a Government security.

Explanation:.- The record of transaction
(electronic or otherwise) effected by the firm for
itself or by a proprietor for himself, who is a
trading member through stock exchange or an
association as defined in clause (a) of section 2,
of the Forward Contract (Regulation) Act, 1952,
shall deemed to be a note or memorandum for
the purpose of this Article.

One hundred rupees.




11

4. NOTE OF PROTEST BY THE
MASTER OF A SHIP-See also protest by the
Master of a ship (No-47)

One hundred rupees.

44. PARTNERSHIP

¢y XXX XXX XXX

(2)(a) XXX XXX XXX

(b) Alteration in constitution of the partnership
including, Limited Liability Partnership and
joint Venture to run a business, in consequence
of any reason other than that referred to in sub-
clause (a), Instrument of

(3) Dissolution of Partnership or retirement of
partner including, Limited Liability Partnership
and joint Venture to run a business, -

(a) XXX XXX XXX

(b) in any other case.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

45. POWER OF ATTORNEY as defined by
section 2(r), not being a proxy-

(a) when executed for the sole purpose of
procuring the registration of one or more
documents in relation to a single transaction or
for admitting execution of one or more such
documents;

(b) when required in suits or proceedings under
the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882;

(c) when authorising one person or more to act
in a single transaction other than the case
mentioned in clause (a);

(d) when authorising not more than five persons
to act jointly and severally in more than one

transaction or generlly;

(e) when authorising more than five but not

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.




12

more than ten persons to act jointly and

severally in more than one transaction or
generally;

O  xxx XXX XXX

(i) When authorizing to sell or transfer
immovable property without consideration or
without showing any consideration, as the case
may be,-

(a) if given to the father, mother, brother,
sister, wife, husband, son, daughter,
grandson, granddaughter;

(b) xxx XXX XXX

(g) XXX XXX XXX
(h) in any other case.

Explanation L.-For the purpose of this Article,
more persons than one when belonging to the
same firm shall be deemed to be one person.

Explanation II. - The term ‘registration’
includes every operation incidental to
registration under the Registration Act, 1908.

Explanation IIL.-Where, under clause (f) duty
has been paid on the power of attorney, and a
coriveyance relating to that property is
subsequently executed in pursuance of the
power of attorney between the executant of the
power of attorney and the person in whose
favour it is executed, the duty on conveyance
shall be the duty calculated on the market value
of the property reduced by duty paid on the
power of attorney.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

46. PROTEST OF BILL, OR NOTE, that is
to say, any declaration in writing made by a
Notary or other person lawfully acting as such,
attesting the dishonor of Bill of Exchange or
promissory note:

One hundred rupees.

47. PROTEST BY THE MASTER OF A
SHIP, that is to say, any declaration of the
particulars of her voyage drawn up by him

One hundred rupees.




with a view to the adjustment of losses or the
calculation of averages, and every declaration in
writing made by him against the charterers or
the consingnees for not loading or unloading the
ship when such declaration is attested or
certified by a Notary or other person lawfully
acting as such. ’

See also Note of Protest by the Master of a ship
(No. 41)

48. RECONVEYANCE OF MORTGAGED
PROPERTY-

One hundred rupees.

48A. RECORD OF TRANSACTION
(electronic or otherwise) effected by a trading
member through a stock exchange or the
association,-

(@) if relating to sale and purchase of
Government securities,
(b) to (d) xxx XXX XXX

Explanation I.- No duty shall be chargeable
under this article on agreement or its record
or note or memorandum, iof proper duty is

paid under article 5 or 39, as the case may
be.

Explanation II- For the purpose of clause
(b), securities shall have the same meaning
as define under the Securities Contract
(Regulation) Act, 1956.

One hundred rupees.

49. RELEASE, that is to say, any instrument
(not being such a release as is provided for by
section 24) whereby a person renounces a claim
upon another person or against any specified

property.-

(a) if the release deed of an ancestral property or
part thereof is executed by or in favour of
brother or sister (children of renouncer’s
parents) or son or daughter or son of
predeceased son or daughter of predeceased son
or father or mother or spouse of the renouncer
or the legal heirs of the above relations;

One hundred rupees.

H-215-4 (81S-10)




(b) XXX XXX XXX

51. SECURITY BOND OR MORTGAGE-
DEED executed by way of security for the due
execution of an office, or to account for money
or other property received by virtue thereof or
executed by a surety to secure the due
performance of a contact-

Exemptions

Bond or other instrument, when executed-

(@) by any person for the purpose of
guaranteeing that the local income derived from
private subscriptions to a charitable dispensary
or hospital or any other object of public utility
shall not be less than a specified sum per
mansen;

(b) under the rules made by the State
Government under section 76 of the Bombay
Irrigation Act, 1879,

(c) executed by persons taking advances under
the Land Improvement Loan Act, 1883, or the
Agriculturists” Loans Act, 1884 or by their
sureties as security for the repayment of such
advances;

(d) executed by officers of the Government or
their sureities to secure the due execution of an
office or the due accounting for money or other
property received by virtue thereof.

One hundred rupees.

55. SURRENDER OF LEASE-
Exemptions

Surrender of lease, when such lease is exempted
from duty.

One hundred rupees.

56. TRANSFER (whether with or without
consideration)—

@ XXX XXX XXX




15

(b) of any interest secured by bond, mortgage-
deed or policy of insurance.

(c) of any property under the Administrators
General Act, 1963 section 22.

(d) of any trust property without consideration
from one trustee to another trustee or from a
trustee to a beneficiary.

Exemptions
Transfer by endorsement-

(@ of a bill of exchange, cheque or
promissory note;

(b) of a bill of lading, delivery order,
warrant for goods or other mercantile
document of title of goods;

(c) of a policy of insurance;

(d) of securities of the Central Government.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

58. TRUST— -

(a) Declaration of-of, or concerning any
property when made by any writing not being a
Will.

(b) Revocation of-of, or concerning, any
property when made by any instrument other
than a Will.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.




16



H-215-5 (SI1S-10)

17



18

GUJARAT LEGISLATURE SECRETARIAT

GUJARAT BILL NO. 11 OF 2019.

A BILL

Sfurther to amend the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958.

[SHRI KAUSHIK PATEL,

MINISTER FOR REVENUE]

(As published in the Gujarat Government
Gazette of 2™ July, 2019)

D.M.PATEL
Secretary,

Gujarat Legislative Assembly.

Government Central Press, Gandhinagar.





