
G

THE GUJARAT STAMP (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2OIg.

A BILL

further to amend the Gujarat Sta Act, 195g.

qlt?Lct *ru lgUtrrl [dQus, Qo1c.

cJ?r?tcL *u{ r{[UQer{, reqc qg Uqr?cu otorcr [iQ?rs.

qt€II, atl?ctot Jrqt?tjrq'tt Rie{t .rd{i .ft1,n z,r[gQe{{ seqr{l
urtd. D:-

t" (t) atr rq(QRqr{ cJr?trr S:-u tqtt?t) ?l[D.Ae{{, ?ore sc\crts]. q6t {su r*i

(?) a, ?t%-e{ g1512, errqa{i qnc}e'rtqr€Il <s$t s} a.{l ar{trr 
t.,ttiat'

utltc{{i rrttqel..

n4 te{c'tl' ?" clrat.t € rrr[DQ.qr{, tc\tc (t"t]. 1,1t:1i cse qrjt, ,,trr.t rrreQ.q{,, udr reqzdr
1ic*tta1 soul' afl! gcdu stqt{i rtt.atl D L)qi, ut{ t{r,- iortl+t sout

q[QG,qr+,(i

(t) rrttlJsct ?-{i, "il.stt1 pQur" rr eto€-Ii otee, ,,2tgt+t]. pF.4t,, u-1r({-t-41

. r] ttoel r1so,, nu,,r.

(a) z'rtldset 3-:{i, "rtrsit]. 30.ut" rL gto€-Ii c{ed., "otttL 3e.qt,, il.
etoel rlsar;

(3 ) r'ttfdsct y-{i, "dltt 3Q.ut" rl etc,€-ii oted., ,,r{r{[tt 3e.att,, rL

etc-e1 1s.tt;

H-218-1_-(StS-10)



(y) r{tldsct tr-rti, rris (J6)lti "il.s nl 3e.a{t,, a etc,€-li qe0..

"agtil1 pQ.a{t" rl etael {5at;

(tt) rrtfdse e-{1, ds-l (s) ?4a (u)xl, Q qrctr?tr z{tcrcu. ,,rLsill,

pQ.att" i. et<,e-Ii oteO., rrtqsL ,,'gtttl 
30.ut " rL et<€-I {sat;

(s) r't€sct lo-:{i, ".ls til 3[i.a{t" rL eto€-Ia. oted, "agtril po.a{r,,

rl. et r[sqt;

(o) rrtt[Jsct rt-:{i, "Rgu]. 30.e{t" rl ero€-Ii ored., ,,,tqtil1 
3e.a{t,,

il. ero€-I rJ,sar;

(c) rltEse t3 -:{i, "O.guL 30.ut" r}. etoe-Ii oted., ,,:tqtfl 
3O.a{["

il etce-l {sat;

rc) r{(dsct ts-:{i, "rlsilL 3Qar[" A sr€-li ored., "1qtuL 3e.a{["

rl. ero€l {sc{.1;

(to) r,ffEse le-{t, "r}.8uf. p0.a{t" rtr etc€-li oted., ">tgtttl 3[!.e{t"

rtr eto,€-I ulsc{.t;

(rr) r'tr[tse ?r-qi, "r].s+rL 3Q.ut" A qt€-li qed, ">rgtn1 g0.a{t"

rl. eto€f er;

(r.t) rrrGSct ??-rti, "r.Lstt1 3Rut" rl Etot-Ii oreO., ">tgtttl 3Q.41"

rl etoe-I r[sqt;

(e.s) qt[Esct ?3-rti, "rLsul 3[!.a{t" rtr eto€-Ia. <{ed., "agru1 pQ.a{t"

rl" ero€-I :_lsat;

(q.x) ?lt[Jsct rtt-:{i, "r}.s+tf. g0.e{t" rtr etr,c-Ii ote,Q, ">tglttl 3Q.e{t"

rL eto€-l r(sat;



(tu) t-4@sa ee-ql, "rl.sitf. 3&.art,, rtr eto€-Ii ored., ,,>tgtttL 
3[!.a{[,,

rl. eto€]. {sar;

(ts1 z4(3se 3?-:{i, "il.su1 3eut" a eto€-Ii oted., ,,>tgtil). 
3[e4t,,

A ero€-I rlsat;

(to) ?{(Ugct 3g-rti, "rl.sitl. 30.a{t" A. eto€-Ii ot€,d., ,,aqtfl. 
30.art,,

rL ero€,] r[sat;

(tcy u11gsct 3N-:{i, "rLs+tL iea{t " rL Qto€-li. c,red.,,,otitL 3[!.ut,,
rtr ero€l {sar;

(ta) ?{tEsc4 3q-:+[, rris (s){1, ,,rl.Ett]. 
3e.elt,, rl eto€-li qed.

":tqtu1 3Q.e{t" rl. etoe-I {sat;

(?o) q(dget 3 c-:{i, "dlil 3Q.a{t" il er€-Ia. oreQ., ,,.r{q[tr 
3[!.a{t,,

rl etG€,-I {5ar;

(et) r,t€se 3c-:{i, rri.s (r)lri, "rtrsilL 30.a{t" A ero€-Ia. qed.

">tgtttl 3Relt" rL ero€-I r(sat;

(te) urtEsct xr.-:{i, "rLsilL 3o.at" r}. eto€-Ii c{ed., ">tgttt1 3o.a{t,,

rl. etoc-I rlsar;

(es ) qt[dsct xx-{i.-

(s) uls (a){i, Qat-rris (u)l+i, "rtrs+tl 3Q.ut " A etc,€-Ia.

cted, "otilf. 30.a{t" rL etoe-I rlsat;

(tli) r'is (: )Hi, Qat-rris (u):+i, "rl"sttL 3Q.ut " +L ero€-Ia.

c{eO., "otuL 3Q.ut" rL etc,t-I {sat;



(t x) r'ttldsct xtr-rri,

(s) is-l (s), (lrr), (rr), fq) r.,ti (?r){i, ,,rl.s ilf. 30ut ,, i.
etoc-Ii. oted, ,,:tgtil1 

3[eal[" rl etG€-I {sat;

(rrt) rris (U),{1, Qat-rriS (?) (S){i, ,,rl.sttl. 
3e.4t,, rl efo€-Ii

oted., "a.qLil1 30.a{t" rl et<,e-I {sat;

(eq) rrrtEsct xs-'t[, "rl.sttL 3Q.a{t" rl eto€-Ii oted., ":tgr.il1 3e.alt,,

r]. eroeL rlsat;

(eE) r,tt[dsct xo-{i, "r.l.gu]. 3o.a{t" rL etc'€-Ii qgd, ">tgtttl. 3o.a{t"

rL erc,e-I {sar;

(to). qfdsct xc-{i, "rl.silL 30.a{t" rL ero€-Ia. oted., ":tgttrl 3Q.a{t"

rl grocL {sar;

(ac) rlfdScr X6-s-r-ti, rris (s):-ti, "i.sul. 3Q.a{t" il ero€-Ii r4ed,

">LgLttl 30.e{t" tl. etce-I {5at;

(ec) rrtfdset xc-qi, uis (s){i, "rLsttL 3Q.et[" rl eto,€Ii qed., "ottt].

30.etr" rtr etoel. rlsat;

(:o) r,ttEse qr-qi, "rLsf,.3Q.4L" f, et€-Ii oreO., ">tgtttl 3Q.e{t"

tl etotL {scL;

(g t) urt[dsct tt\t-{i, "rL8+{.]. 30.a{t" rl ero€-la. <led., "2.q[+t1 3Q.4t"

il. eto€-l r[sar;

(ge) ?A(esct tts-:{1, rris-I (rrt), (cr) rqi. (t{)}rl, "rLsttl.3Q.qr,'r}.

sro€-Ii qed, "aqt$l 3[Qa{t" rL eto€-I {sa[;

(33)qtEsa qc-qi, rrisl (s) ?.{a (u)r{i, "r}.s+tL 3[!.4t" a ero€]i

o{gd., ">tgtil1 3[!.4t" rl etc,€I {sat;



. Gtql r,ri sreqit

ttls ua1 q?, cJv?tcr *,n{ q[qG.q{, reqc,ft q{+1e 1{i esflec{l
esq'ft sgdl druqra €l.al D. ueeg q{+(-{ r .tsotn,ft z{us ..trfrrr q?dr
*ru sgfl'tt Retc e?, uat eoq.yell qtt?ctr{i ?,l.cal. ,tell, rl } t,etqi r4i
rt*?r}ti ttrus .lc,a steg1, d+st,cs.j uR:_ttgr r.,ri c,it, r,ti.g crqj +tll
ctlcj D. As{l, qncle qr'rat {r} carecstalct, ct8rictaat (al.cqat) uri. uacn.tt
C.ttqqtatt .1d{ €r-u sgdtarl Ve[ Ve[ Rqa erli cg cti+icrct a,ttccu{
4fl rgu D.

r'tt [dQqse{I, Gu{s'.t dAet Rs^ sr.rt qt}, il.t r.crtc"r]. *te?g r,reRqq
Ut{t?cL ut{ E.

slGls ulcr,

trter4l?r ttrtr ttlqqt,0 etdl

u{r A.i{a.spll, .{{.fl qroral,rt tic-i.r{}ri ttet$te{

21c1.116 stqt{l r.,ttQ. B,-

tt.u'ft u]uqft"{l

5ct{ t.- u{. sa:t.ft Qat-scr{ (?)€II, ?t%-q ileStti., ttrqa:{i
u.tst'tL{ts{1, ile?g r't[QRar{ * ctrflQ r{{cr]ri r{r.tef R crflu .t#[ stqr.ft
urtt {4. D"

GuaJsa qtat4ta{ +trtr.ft ulugft t,,1tqaats r,ri. ut:-rt,q Usrr,ft D.

atflu' r-3l Ecttt!, ?orc.

H-218-2-(StS-1-0)

slFls qlet.



u?c{q[t
qr?tct *:-1t ulQhqq, tctt4 (nd laq6ar iottl+r

rrrQQar:{ sl1ls so:1ryulell Garrt

urq+({ r

Q.ul Gur * sg4.

1Errtl sct:+ ry

duEL usre ulcu *,:-u sgdl

e. q.{qd[-rrta:{, cu.?dcu. cil.?tu.

at[0G.qq, rc?rt .]oq qEqt uestfl
ilQcu ds rrr(QRer{, Lcos,{l sa{ s

.tsoq rrtrQctr ua"i. u:tra.er ertq D.

rlsul 3Qur

3" erts u2r, ilad b *{i eds

Aqt"t.ft 'tltr (sLar qprql t,tr Gqe€II

ertS A.tt'tl rrfQ.Ste rrtturL e-lq qef.tt

rrttratt"j r,t@l.t .tfar rl.rr ([dA-

R.rrar,t) s-IO 0.u.

flsttl i0.qr

x. ttlcieErt(il[t3[ia), il"]ri uLcie

d.tti qea, uRflr qerqr rLEare

srqt'[i sra{erpll Ea cslu I .artRrrrfil

stc{l uR.flt r4€rqt rtrsatt"tl ilrrtQ.sr

P{re{ D"

,+r$l

ulcie"ttti uetqt d0'.t rLsrra t.eut -
(s) eres? a{[0R?rq, rcrro ?lstql

[d.qL-t en ?a[qG.qq, e"c\ro .lsur -ttrt
Etuct €{qr.{i err.r. afl} sarT.s-Iq €{.r};

(u) s-Io sl3{i qaqr sl.u s-I8.u

ut[Qstfl ur+&r 5trjc-r ?A€{qr 6qar].cr

5?ctto-tt cttcslGls .tsd rtt] sail .;l?t

crtl. u€{qr

dl+t 3Qar



(rt) s-Io .rr(R s-Itr t"er+ urEcrr

ur,t.ra'ft rs{ iltndl er} a.aat r .ts{

{t} sqJ €fer, drt}
tt. golcil.ct I't€lc{t sclettaal eutdqr
?4erq[ l"j ]sS

(s) €Il (?ru) xxx xxx xxx
(:'l) tt"qqt vlct.ttt, sfl ,t .slq, .tL

{rfl
5olcu.ct ?4Ec{. solctta.il evttdqt
r{EcL l"j }sS

Qsul 3Qur

e. +tru. .uueli stcft G.rtels;

[Qet .t .s-Ia{ Aqr s-Io Qrrte{l sfl .s]q,

eui

ts) e+dtrrtl.ft

(u) rct{ ut€{cL +e{tct? 0.cts.t,u.

rlEul gQa{r

rlsul 30.ur

to. erqL

s13<r gsu

o{iu fla
leuisa"

utetctf .sla{ a etRur't
.Born st.rti .t1.{ i. Rqrq
slc{l utstrqft ?4srctr

zlstil iQ.ar



]{rfl

(s) * ur.sreqft ! 1c-eris't lrra As ?t

uaste.0 {rG.0 lrr} s}ct .sLq uti
*a sqctrai. c.{lA ?4erc{r srqetau.

r,t{ct4. c{lA qasre-Ii slttuqr fla
{t.'q s?qt'{l r4e 't .51q, a..

(rrt) rdl'tetti crqita a{} rrtqqr,[l

?slt 6?tctcu ur) uts.ft r'rtsttc{l

Gi:ra.

Lr. rl.lR+te0q-$[s-i]ri slo

.a{q+(tar, gd.? ut€{ctt strt e0uqt l+t}

s-Io rttta?"tt (sreL "{ll $ctr sl.tJ

fl!.Rtt, sL?gct 14Ectt aLse'ft "1ls{
{c'it{l ?lEcL li. eftr.,t.r.tr ric,it{l il.rr
els cturqr"tL n:-tra.er qrer D.

{r{
* rtrlRueftqar duell sfo .artRi
s-Io +ttdrG.s uur.r.cft +it€rrA ur€{cu

i,u u{ f,lRu afl} rrr.,{l .sL?r i
rtrlQtteftu-tL 0.u.

ilsttl ?Q.a{r

13. gsre1, ilaQ ilo erqr eeF.ut+

s-I8'tt Ss,{ R.u4 o{lV {a s}ctr

atrltqt(l 5?at) 6urell [d attr't sectt'j

Fa{tqaL lste-I or .=lar rlqL, sLo

ct.rtt ur€rcL 4t:.r?€1. rrrtQaL slO dQa
Rqlar.

:{tfl
cJY?tct 'tcttut@.st ur[uaar{,

tcs:".ft sar{ ?sc ?{elc.rt iotO.tt
.ietqiurt €-Iqr otorcrqu ur[QRer,r.

c.cox-ft sctrt rc clorn.tL lsrel.

ilsttl 30.ur



1S. ?€,5?cil."t]. du_ lrrcrtG s{t
tuQel s-Io Qr,t * 6qe€ll ae sqJ eLa{

R dra u[d.t) r] il 6qr iltr,r sfl .slq

ctqt i qr) dlU fli vfcr.uo E{ ,t
elq al.

5Ltc1q{11"i*? xe ), a{qNltU2t ?e

Etqt,tl Qrrt("to,tt rt?-lrt), qtl Uttg-I

tt]r{I b.rt'tf drrr(<qe qq), ?re ?e

se.tt"il du ('lqt qc-ur) Ugt 3rur1.

rlsul lQqr

te. qdlcta-urct, rtrad * E-IO d.u s-IO

t,qetl s{ rrtreL .slar ?rri * Gqtell

a qlcr'ft 0.esa qlat4r d.grerr+r

atatt{ aqdla s{ rlrQ D r,ta.rt *
6qr€II R Qqretal,u Qqu,ft qdtqa,ft

?srt r{€{cu fldls-s irrrli r1scct,ft

ce{q?et[ Er.rt{i rrttQ D ?{slcu. a
dgtett'j st{ rj"rQrae-I.ft bq}rrt ctsoq

qqqt C-ittjit'+{. 1t2t Uqtql" i..tt
dgrerel<r erau{ ?{flLqqr Rq I
6qt€llserQ(Didu.

+l.sul. 3Q.ut

?r. otsc{ utEc{. 6ate-1, * ufl asct
?rt€{ctt 6Ate-I cslqr otEe SfO UeStfl

rrr[0stfl ?4€{cl. i..tt gs}t 6qae]l

u,{tQL.t sfl .sLa{ ori *'ft Gqr s-It

fli. etctat i. ttrtil. rrrqcrxl <sLq a"qi

srqet t%ct fl 0.qrqta ad E .rlar R.

qrfl

(s) dltl sretar.0 45cr, * s-Io nrsrfl
slfl{i ?l.rrtc{t {t} q€rqt s-Iti utEtfl
srq ru), sltl aa stfl u[Usrflt

rtrsul 3Q.ur

H-218-3-(StS-10)



s?c{.t'ft uetcu. I'{.qqt,[l rc? D rtrq
staret{i +ueug1 orrqi .slat t.
(ut) Itor{, d.Q:,lr{, otp{8?qt, or{qt,

ctc't, tpatDst, r{?gt ut€lcL eg"t tioit{l
slo eRteeqi..ft 4sc-r q€{q[ i.]ri"rl.
Gctte-I"

rr. upil d.u r{€{.rr c,(lu +set, stldl

Qqrqta q.ft .slq rlqt rri * i,ioit{l

aitcu sgdl c{fl .sl?r l.u s-Io d.rrt.

,+{t

Q1a1i r'uQcu * sLo rrtt.ft szgdl :t5
sfl .s-lar i.'tf ttr:l du.

?3. g€l{ qL's r,ter.t rLs+tttJu ql.os,

rtrad 3 I u:+tr r,{.lre{i .sl?r tdl slo

Stetet'ft rLct.ftOrrtl utp{c{t S€r{
qelql rl.s.urou.ft srrf Q4 sl.o 5er
ltt) rltprqt i.'tt tir,it{{i S??}t ut€tcL

ds'+tttluq.r s-IU r,rQstfl'tt rrtrt,eit

ut{ttt? }t€{ctt sqe ui€lctt i. atn.tt-tt

gerl uasr.r.rr rtr} r'taql i.i" ctcrcft

r,{lU s-Itl oLotct ?rtsl.ctl qirJ :tt}
rrtQct s-Io c'tL.s.

rtrsill ?Rau

eu. EatEst ottqa.tl. du, rl.ad ! I
Au 6uee{l s-Io fA Lrfarqr

aod{c'it{ al3 l.
€,[et?rt uct- ce{qNlt uct (.lcte qt)

f?41.

<,{lU dscr- ttpl. Au(.ic,rr tr) ErrrL.

ilsul :Qau

QG. csldl ua- d"+il.sasftu r,ta zLsuL ?O.qr

s e. qia{qfl ua il.suf 3Q.ur

33"ctL?tttott qa, O.aa. dqteri qlatdt a].sul. 30ar

1"O



rtlc1q11 Rlde slet u{a{ Urll ,{ffrg
?rr,rcu ?44 Qgterei a"{l lh iql
dQl seqr bql-Qdt t,gretrl r{i. i..,tr
dqrerel .ruf €{lc{l so{cucr.

ilsul tQqt3Y. ct "rltlq0
3tt. su"tl"j lull"s{ qlS

tl.+t]t{lf,st"r-

(s) a"{l tud 3q-ft r,r[QRq,r,

tc,tso(I 5at:{ ?s cBoq r,tfds rrrlg

Atrldlrlet't cslq al;

('JT) XXX XXX XXX

:{r$[

".tgt :rt) tqtilct .t ..fat rrti sq.0
q[QQ.qr{, q.c,ts,ft sa{ ?tt .\or[

'rlqra.e .sler Aqr s-lo rtruldliler.t,j

lqll.s:r.

rlsttl ?Qerr

u.{t s}ctl", z'tarer,j uqtqtq:t("ior?
Xs) -t .sfq lql s-IO Qut, ?[, Qdt,

tturt, UqtqtU2{. ?4etqt .tftf.

U-l)+a urfl @ct ursrc{t Qdl"f'rlt{

"i.xE) uqr Eu1.

dlu 3[Qar

ge" Qd[ q€lcrt aufl, s-I6 ectrQ u{s{cL

ti.qr") riL.tr.tr 1ua Qurfli url "ftil
uurql uflfl 3 d urgr sui4 i"i rnqr

srqr {r} }rfsdc{i-

(s) €Il (u) xxx xxx xxx
(Y) uastfl udl'tcftfl,tl.

alsul afiur



+udtsaqt.- di{rfl u(Rr .tl,{ a.tt
qAA R'u {t} uraqr {r(a} qlar,u

{t} qtarer uler (Rar{-r) ur[QRer,{,

tcrt? 'ft sct{ e ,tt rris(s) l1l cqt\rr{t

sql U?totou. te-ls rLsul.O"ry

(eLeottre) rrtstqr rlulRilet+ :{r?5cr

slcft d.csts,+s,j tsS (6esa_lRs

Et), ?,{t r,tEsetqt .ts.1 ut}
utdl .s1ar,j crqrrel.", 

i

Yt. ecstBr"u urut sle afa aitg

ul)te - ecsrgt'u. {r+al stet ul.}r?

("iqt-Yo) uqt Errr1.

ilsul gQ.ur

xv. ettc0erfl

(t) XXX XXX XXX

(?)(5) XXX XXX XXX

(u) !.at-r.'is (s)lri Gcdrlcu sr?qr

R.rrq't uoer 5io sr?qtdr qRguil

qtofterfl'ft tq'uul !egrr.rL a.u.

(: ) oucflerfl"j Quda-
(5 ) XXX XXX XXX

(u) o{lq( slouqt u{c-I

rtrsuf gfi.au

rLEttl sQqr

urt" Uudrt?'ttU U15{l ot .tlat Rg

sctu Q(tt)lti ca{luett sta Usrt"j-
(5) fls % d.tsbqs'tt +lr'itrqi il.s
?,t€lctl. .rt{t} et ttd.V tRter
s?tctc4.att qr ctsd l1t) ?4et.tt il.Lt rtrs 3

.rt1t eurQ.v sfl uru.rr.'j sqc-r

5?c{.-tt .tsq ut} s{ .s1u, ert};

(r't) lRs"t{l +iiLa s-I:n s-I2 r,r[QRa{q,

t c c ? .\oon gtcu. rrtp{c{t sralqt.qrti

rtoq .sfa{ ,qtt;

Qsul eF.a{r

rlsuf ?Qau



(ct) us (s)Lri rquQc{l orrorcr (il.qrq

u{lU .ls v Q..rst,qs{l srq stqr ,tr} lAsul iQqr
ils rqaqt qtul er(Rrrrfi i Gqreli
r'tlQsre uttqqta]. .sLq .e{t},

(q)rtrs seai qtul dqslq u{e{qr larnf s6.e{r
illH.t,qct: r].sp{a. rls % sr.rr I

{t} qi{ 5?cu qtut qtd rlac{l
.ar(Rrrrli i Gqeell rrr[Qsra uuqqra]

.s].q, c{tl,
(?{) il.s s?cu. crtul e.rse,qs{ i 

asul aQ'qt

q€{qt ilt{loetd: il.stqL rls .r st{
s?qr rtr) qlrr 5?cu. crqrl qqr E+t

5?cu. qt{r} {[$ rlacil .artRr,ili a
Gqeeli q(Qstt r'1qqr"tL .sLq, c1l;
(re) (r) xxx xxx xxx
(e )rcrr+ Rctsa-j Qurgr ?rr€{crt

.tqflc{l rrtdqr urO. z,rqqr arerru+lor,

uQ.r qrt? se.tt urQ.stt z,rtqqt,tf

Ola{ ,e{t},

(5) [Qett, ]Lctt, etlr,, Qot, q-0, .,R, 
I r].sul ?e.ett

Y2., gdi, u1a, uldli rrtqqt,{l .sl.a{

.tf;

(I'T) XXX XXX XXX

(V) XXX XXX XXX

(o) o{lqfl slougt v+ic-\ rtrsuL 3[Qur

+udlstgt-q- ?at ?r{t[dsct-tt .\drrtf ,{t}

tls srai .rtlrl .et&ctutf, r?ti ils v
afl'ft .s-Iat ,qr}, il.s G.t afl}
ctquef.

+uldlsrqt-r "r[*Qerd" A. {€rr}ri,

H-218-4-(StS-10) t3



aRQett UtQ.G.q:{, reo c .Boq,tt

eRQetqi uuqui6ls els sral,rl

tt:-ttd.et e{t?d D.

+udlstgr-: r,ls (u1 .1661,

Uirrqtt'tt{l 6q?, Sqdt Atfl .s]ef r,ti.

i (ilsctai actd utG.4!r ua,
guarttati s?'rt? .arfRcra rrri 8,0
cttlgtui I seq.r:{i r{rqi .rl4 I
.arl3a q tr{dr[?ou.{t u{ilt?
"r{tucn€il ?Arqi .slq .qrt, l1rQfl}e ua
Gqe'0 sqfl luerl?ou.qt Gqr.[l

salJt *ac{l qar{ti lilesa,ft or%r?

G{a 6ua c1g1qt{t s}e0 sgdl c1g11e].

xs" @ct orll ritlre utEqt "tLa ql5

uLlc, tlad 3 [QR{e{qa 4€{cu.

ulldufl '1].aal" utotte? €rql t.tr}

'tlaflrl usrqr i afl! sr?rt,ur {a
s[r{ s?6u.? o{lU s-IO .arGctrl. s}a].

dlo QQa rLsrn"

el.sul 3Q.ur

uo. 4csLt3t'u. :{t€t"tL Ul}+a ilad }
ctLatqt GUtc,f'ft catqN{l ptc.t[ctt ?rt€{ctt

uterer-ft crgrafl e{qrqr .tsd{ i.gl R

acsrBt'{l +t5r-ft fdcra].aL * slouqt

rlsrta er,€n .sl?r i qi. q.srgt{l :trcr

o't U6tce{[ otl.o{ct lrtsLctt ctcstBtAls{l

rrtct qt Gatarl c{torct ur8ea usrqr *i
:{tct ,tfscql. ,.s-Ia{ R .erGa (s.qt6-ft)

[dfs le] * rtrstrt s?rT.sl.at 1., rqr]
rL.tr el"srra 6qr .tlaflrtr grtrrt sfl
..lar qprqt Ulttqtq>t ?rttEl .sfa{ .qtt,

Qsul a0.qr

9.7



ctcstBt.tt r{r+at stct .lla r,tfS Uf}ra
('ion ut) qgt 

V?r{].
yc. cft1-l r1!e0 Qctsai }e,{regt h,,r.t- rlstrl 3Qurv6. dqrfl ucri. e-ls esultl"ry
(efeo{%rr) qqql rlil]Riletd {t?scr
slc{i dqs}cs"j }sS (odsafRs ?4erqt

?'toqEl.),-

(s) utsrfl cfl{l,rc0{{ Q.urqr r,ri
ut{tfli ctcrcJ csler, al
('JT) €II (q) XXX XXX XXX

${\dts?qt r. r,r€se q ?Aqqr
qsLtudct, 3e .Botn sgA c{rqr{i
r'ttc{l csLat, .iL solctt.t .{erq[ I,tt ]sS
q€{qr Afl uEqr audt 6qr, ut
.{[d5cr .loq s-I6 sgJ[ dcuql.:t ere]

,rtB.

+utdtsegt e uis(rrr) cL .td rtrb,

"qnr{l.tcft{rrrl" otL, Rsqfldt ttle,t

(Rq{'t) r,tQ.G.a{,{, rcrrs Botn

s?qrqi t,ttdc{l a{rur{[ Ulrrq],rL qel

ereL.

rlsuf ?Qqt

ve. grarrd"- rlactr ! (sa{ ?x €II

tLctqtd sa{ u{rqL"ft grrcr.ft ,t .sl?i

rL.l.t) sltl du Gqr,rL ur€{cu. slo Rt'de
slc{i [ilsaa 6ur.t] erqf uffl t, E a.-

(s) qrautcta F.ctsa ?Jterql i..tt cttct,t]

5nctd drrt, e,tql. u-l{t bare.tt arto
qqqt r,tc\oi (etql ul$ t,.ttt.rt
qtat(latdt qrns-I) ?4erq[ ja r,ru<r gdl
?4€{qr q.}er }t€J rrtilcr r1aa1 y>t(q1a),
q€{qrqctsc-u 1€ urDct lrr.0 Udtfqldtt

flsul ?0.au



rle{ql (ilat r,tetql :rr.cr.r. ut€{cL er,tattrfl
q€{q[ 6qa,tt +i<,itr].,tt stqt,ut,tt
qtruerr-lrl sla el?r u{€rqr l{,ft
atlqt{ srqr{l qrd.ct el?r .e{r};

('}I) XXX XXX XXX

qr. tt{l4uct urEcrt cfta-Il,ta.- sltl e1ar.j

sru alrer fll srqt [dQ4t ?4€{q[ e]qt.ft

iA I atgrl rrucr.t c,{lu Resa {Ar ia].
[Euq qrqqr tde],ft qadlacft{ .t{t} sfl
uttqi .s1u i ut€{.tt s?t?att ql.cq qret,l

{r} tti{li sfl urqi €lq R-

,+t{
r,tl'S rrtq.tt dlrl d.rrt,-

(s) tr{et eqtqtdt utp{cu. 0Fqatct
qerql et]s'lqqfcft r,ilca sl.rJ.{qt st:+ ur}
r'uacft Gqrrqfts{l erilc{i +cuRs qrqs E?

u[Ei. r,r1s rs{ seai tut]dl ere] ?,,itdt

r,rLdl e{q]" 4tb rldl c{i.ctst{{ qraet,u. c}cl

ur) sfo .arBail sql el.a{, .qr};

(rlt) tqo H?ito r,r[Q[ie{,{ \coe "{i
5ar{ os &ocn rrrq tttsr} stcrt F.4}rl

5rc't sUT .slq .attl;

(cr) rr{iq Ut{r?q11 ct]'t r,r[ilR?{}r, rac3

&oq r{€rqt D.1a ctf"t ur[DRerq, rccu

.3oq t{lerqr darr .rrBar,rlQ r,tqql

L:{ar rnr{laLrL uE?g t{iarqrai arqtl

tu.ut z,tqqt ur)'ft rtr{l-tcftfl c{ea se[

e-Ia .qt);
(q) Ad ..slat'j stu arfeat fli arttq.u }t)
?,,{etqr i .sLqr.{l ?il * Qltr q€{qt G{lu

(lctsa qd l"it ulca 111 Gutel U{tqqr

r{t} ursrfl r,r[0srflur]fl ?lqqr l.{.u
udl'tlA satJ .sla{, ,r{ti,

A.sirl r[i.a{r

,{r't. utf ulfl t..t-rl e+.ttQ.r- il.suL 3Qur

9€



qel. ulfl t,qr"tl er<tQ.qr, rqtt i *r,
6qt.ft sgdl ,rt5 s{ e].q, .qrl
It9. .tctflc{1.-Grtd.r u[Ba .rtrrqr .,ra,
qct? 

)

(5) XXX XXX XXX

(trt) (rrr) otl"-s, cfta-Irrt.t q€rql dl}tt,ft
qlc0rit 6qr€ll .trrqr r,rtQa sltl l.{.t.ft
(ct) rlsF.RQar nata r,r[QG.ar:{, i.csE

"ft sctq ?e (i6e,{l s-ltl D.esa,0.
(q) Qs Adt qtilell o{ltn aufla ?4erqr

aC|. qrilell Gar[0sr{i r,rQqr qcrr slc{i
s1o qre'{l 0.ctsa,ft.

{r{t
c}-I ar,{li s}c{l aotdtc{i-

(s) [d.R,{qqa, ils ?4qqr u]tdu{t

'ila'ft;
(ut) (Qct r,il.g ABct, Stctlq{t r,rlSr, qtct

o{ect.tt qlia qetql {tat 6qaat €s,tt
o{lcrt Qqta dc-I'tt et ttd.cr,ft;

(cr) dlqr.ft qlc{lt{I.ft;

(t{) }'( tttstr'{l K{l'tc[t{?a].0.

rlsill iQ.art

rtrsirf 3Qur

qc" ?$a.-

s. ldct d e]ar ll.qt s-Io ctul.gt Gurpli

srqt{[ rltqi .rfu, ctl s-Io F.ctsa,tt
?Aetql i utc-l"tt ?€,ft ttc]rta.
r.,r. sltl F.esa,rt r{€rq[ i r,rclq p+a ldcr

Rqrq.t slouqt d.t,r Gqrell te srgi.

rlEnl ?Qarr

rtrsuf 3Q.ur

H-218-s-(StS-10)





1-C



{%?Lct fdtrt"tUett uQ.qtctq

lttdt ?orai cJ?r?l.cr ldlqs suis: tr.1

cJ%?Lct *u{ r{CI.0.4{, rcrrc ctg Utrt?ctr
ou.otct fiQqs.

t r{l slFlg q}et,

ucl+(a ridlr{I.1

(+r"r ?oreor[ rerd {[d4t,ft e-u atflrl
cJqr?l.cr ttesrfl etqrqa4l uRs sul 5rot1

fl. Alr. u}ct,

ufi.q,

cJ%?Lct fitrt.t+tctt.

?o

ntstfl ltt2{+€r t(qttct?{, ctltft,tctt



THE GUJARAT STAMP (AMENDMENT) BILL,2019.

GUJARAT BILL NO. 11 OF 2019.

A BILL

further to amend the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958.

It is hereby enacted in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

l. (l) This Act may be called the Gujarat Stamp (Amendment) Act, Shorttiueand
2019. commencement.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government mav.
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

H-zrs-r (srs-10)



Amendment of 2. In the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958, in Schedule I,-
Schedule I to

Bom. LX of
1958' (i) in article 2, for the words "one hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(ii) in article 3, for the words "One hundred rupees,,, the words

"Two hundred rupees" shall be sdbstituted;

(iii) in article 4, for the words "Twenty rupees", the words

"Fifty rupees" shall be substituted;

(iv) in article 5, in clause (h), for the words "One hundred rupees", the

words "Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(v) in article 9, in clauses (a) and (b), for the words "One hundred

rupees", occuning at two places, the words "Three hundred

rupees" shall be substituted, respectively;

("D in article 10, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(vii) in article 11, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(viii) in article 13, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(ix) in article 16, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(x) in article 19, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xi) in article 2I, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xii) in article 22, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xiii) in article 23, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

Bom. LX of
1958.



j

(xiv) in article 25, for the words "Qne hundred rupees',, the words

"Three hundred rupees,' shall be substituted;

(xv) in article 29, for the words "one hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees', shall be substituted;

(xvi) in article 32, for the words "one hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees,'shall be substituted;

(xvii) in article 33, for the words "one hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xviii) in article 34, for the words "one hundred rupees", the words

"Two hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xix) in article 35, in clause (a), for the words ..One hundred rupees,,,

the words "Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(x,x) in article 38, for the words "Twent5l rupees,', the words ,,Fifty

rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxi) in article 39, in clause (g), for the words ,.One hundred rupees',,

the words "Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxiD in article 41, for the words "One hundred rupees,', the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxiii) in article 44,-

(a) in clause (2), in sub-clause (b), for the words "One hundred

rupees", the words "Two hundred rupees" shall be

substituted.

(b) in clause (3), in sub-clause (b), for the words "One hundred

rupees", the words "Two hundred rupees" shall be

substituted:

(xxiv) in article 45,-

(a) in clauses (a),(b),(c),(d) and (e), foi the words "One hundred

rupees", the words "Three hundred rupees" shall be

substituted.



4

(b) in clause (f, in item (ii), in sub-item (a), for the words ..One

hundred rupees", the words ',Three hundred rupees,, shall be

substituted;

(c) in clause (h), for the words "One hundred rupees,', the words

"Three hundred rqpees" shall be substituted;

(xxv) in article 46, for the words "One hundred rupees',, the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxvi) in article 47, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxvii) in article 48, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxviii) in article 48-A, in clause (a), for the words "One hundred

rupees", the.words "Th,ree hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxix) in article 49, in clause (a), for the words "One hundred rupees",

the words "Two hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xx,x) in article 51, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(y-rxi) in article 55, for the words "One hundred rupees", the words

"Three hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxxii) in article 56, in clauses (b),(c) and (d) for the words "One hundred

rupees", the words "Thriee hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(xxxiii) in article 58, in clauses (a) and (b) for the words "One hundred

rupees", the words "Thlee hundred rupees" shall be substituted.



\

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

certain instruments are charggable with duty of the amount indicated
in Schedule I to the Gujarat Stamp Act, 195g. The fixed stamp duty rate on

some Articles under the said Schedule I has not been enhanced since 2014,

although the transaction volume and value both have increased many times

due to economic growth in the country and the State. It is, therefore,

considered necessary to further rationalize the various fixed stamp duty rates

in order to bring in reasonability, rationality and simplicity for the public in

general.

This Bill seeks to amend the said Act of 1958 to achieve the aforesaid

object.

KAUSHIK PATEL.

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Bill provides for delegation of legislative power in the foflowing

respects:--

Clause 7.- Sub-clause (2) of this clause empowers the State

Government to appoint by notification in the Official Gazette, the date on

which the said Act shall come into fdrce.

The delegation of legislative power, as aforesaid, is necessary and is

of a normal character.

Dated the 2no July,20l9.

H-21s-2 (SrS-10)

KAUSHIK PATEL.



6

ANNEXURE

EXTRACT FROM THE GUJARAT STAMP ACT. 1958.

(Bom. LX OF 1958)

SCHEDULE I.
Sr.{N{p Durv ON INSTRUMENTS.

(,See section 3)

Description of Instrument Proper stamp-duty
2. ADMINISTRATION - BOI\D,
including a bond given under the Indian
Succession Act, L925 or section 6 of the
Governmefit Saving Banks Act, 1873.

One hundred rupees.

3. ADOPTION-DEED, that is to say, any
instrument (other than a will) recording an
adoption or conferring ofpurporting to confer an
authority to adopt.

One hundred rupees.

4. AFFIDAVIT, including an affirmation of
declaration in the case of persons by law
allowed to affirm or declare instead of swearins.

Exemptions

Affidavit to declaration in writins when made -
(a)

(b)

(c)

as a condition of enrolment under the
Army Act, 1950 or the Air Force Act,
1950;
for the immediate purpose of being field
or used in any Court or before the officer
ofany court; or
for the sole purpose of enabling any
person to receive any pension or
charitable allowance.

Twenty rupees.

5. AGREEMENT OR MEMPRANDUM OF
AI\ AGREEMENT OR ITS RECORDS-

(a) to (gb)
One hundred rupees.



(h) if not otherwise provided for

Exemption

Agreement or Memorandum of Agreement or
its records,-

(a) for or relating to the purchse or sale of
goods or merchandise exclusively, not
being an agreement or memorandum of
agreement chargeable under entry (d) ,
entry (e), entry (f or entry (g) ofthis article
or NOTE or memorandum chargeable
under article 40;

(b) made in the form of tenders to the Central
Government for or relating to any loan.

9. APPOINTMENT IN EXECUTION OF A
POWER;

where made by any writing not being a will-

(a) oftrustees

(b) of property movable or immovable

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

10. APPRAISEMENT OR VALUATION
made otherwise than under an order of the Court
in the course of a suit.

Exemption

(a) Appraisement or valuation made for the
information of one party only, and not
being in any manner obligatory between
parties either by agreement or operation
of law.

(b) Appraisement of crops for the purpose
of ascertainingthe amountto be givento
a land-, lord as rent.

One hundred rupees.

11. APPRENTICESHIP-DEED, including
every writing relating to the service or tution of

One hundred rupees.



any apprentice, clerk or servant, placed with any
master to leam any profession, trade or
employment.

Exemption

Instrument of apprenticeship by which a
person is apprenticed by or at the charge ofany
public charity.

13. AWARD, that is to say, any decision in
writing by an arbitrator or umpire, not being an
award directing a partition on a reference made
otherwise than by an order of the Court in the
course of a suit.

Exemption

Award under the Gujarat Municipalities Act,
1963 section 268.

One hundred rupees.

16. CAI\CELLATION Instrument of
(including any instrument by which any
instrument previously executed is cancelled), if
attested and not otherwise provided for.

See also Release (No. 49), Revocation of
Settlement (no. 52-B) , Surrender of Lease
(no. 55). Revocation of Trust CNo. 58-B).

One hundred rupees.

19. COMPOSITION -DEED, that is to say,
any instrument executed by a debtor whereby he
conveys his propefty for the benefit of his
creditors or whereby payment of a composition
or dividend on their debts is secured to the
creditors, or whereby provision is made for the
continuance ofthe debtor's business, under the

supervision of inspectors or under letters of
licence for the benefit of his creditors.

One hundred rupees.

21. COPY OF EXTRACT, certified to be a
true copy or extract by or by order ofany public
officer and not chargeable under the law for the
time beins in force relatine to the court fees.

One hundred rupees.



Exemptions

(a) Copy of any paper which a public
officer is expressly required by law to
make or furnish for record in any public
office or for any public purpose.

(b) Copy of, or extract from any register
relating to births, baptisms, namings,
dedications, marriages, divorces, deaths
or burials.

22. COUNTERPART OR DUPLICATE of
any instrument chargeable with duty and in
respect of which the proper duty has been paid.

Exemption

Counterpart of any lease granted to cultivator
when such lease is exempted from duW.

One hundred rupees.

23. CUSTOMS BOND OR EXCISE BOND,
that is to say, any bond given pursuant to the
provisions of any law for the time being in force
or to the directions of any officer of Customs or
Excise for, or in respect of, any of the duties of
Customs or Excise or for preventing frauds or
evasions thereof or for any other matter or thing
relating thereto.

DECLARATION OF AIYY TRUST , See
Trust (No. 58)

One hundred rupees.

25. DMRCE, Instrument of, that is to say,
any instrument by which any person effects the
dissolution of his marriaee.

DOWER- Instrument of, See Settlement
(No. 52) DUPLICATE, See Counterpart
CNo.22)

One hundred rupees.

29. INDEMNITY BOND

INSPECTORSHIP - DEED (See
Composition Deed Q.Io. 19)

One hundred rupees.

32. LETTER OF GUARAI{TEE One hundred rupees.

H-2rs-3 (SrS-10)



10

33. LETTER OF LICENCE, that is to say, any
agreement between a debtor and his creditors,
that the letter shall, for a specified time, suspend
their claims and allow the debtor to carry on
business at his own discretion.

One hundred rupees.

34. MARRIAGE REGISTRATION One hundred rupees.
35. MEMORANDUM OF ASSOCIATION
OF A COMPANY-

(a) if accompanied by articles of association
under section l0 of the Companies Act,20131'

(b) xxx xxx xxx

Exemption

Memorandum of any association not formed
for profit and registered under section 8 ofthe
Companies Act,2013.

One hundred rupees.

38. NOTARIAL ACT, that is to say, any
instrument, endorsement, note, attestation,
certificate or entry not being a Protest (No. 46)
made or signed by a Notary in the execution of
the duties ofhis office, or by any other person
lawfully acting as a Notary.

see also Protest of Bill or Note (No. 46)

Twenty rupees.

39.NOTE OR MEMORANDUM, sent by a
Broker or Agent to his principal intimating the
purchase or sale on account ofsuch principal-

(a) to (f) xxx xxx xxx

(g) of a Govemment security.

Explanation:.- The record of transaction
(electronic or otherwise) effected by the firm for
itself or by a proprietor for himself, who is a
trading member through stock exchange or an
association as defined in clause (a) ofsection 2,
ofthe Forward Contract (Regulation) Act, 1952,
shall deemed to be a note or memorandum for
the purpose of this Article.

One hundred rupees.



t1

41. NOTE OF PROTEST BY THE
-See also protest by the

)

One hundred rupees.

44. PARTNERSHIP

(l)

(2)(a)

XXX

XXX

XXX

xxx

(b) Alteration in constitution of the partnership
including, Limited Liability partnership and
joint Venture to run a business, in consequence
ofany reason other than that referred to in sub-
clause (a), Instrument of

(3) Dissolution of Partnership or retirement of
partner including, Limited Liability partnership
and joint Venture to run a business,

(a) XXX

(b) in any other case.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

45. POWER OF ATTORNEY as defined bv
section 2(r), not being a proxy-

(a) when executed for the sole purpose of
procuring the registration of one or more
documents in relation to a single transaction or
for admitting execution of one or more such
documents;

(b) when required in suits or proceedings under
the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882;

(c) when authorising one person or more to act
in a single transaction other than the case
mentioned in clause (a);

(d) when authorising not more than five persons
to act jointly and severally in more than one
transaction or generlly;

(e) when authorising more than five but not

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.



t2

more than ten persons
severally in more than
generally;

(D(D xxx xxx

to act jointly and

one transaction or

xxx

(e)

(iD When authorizing to sell or transfer
immovable propefty without consideration or
without showing any consideration, as the case
may be,-

(a) if given to the father, mother, brother,
sister, wife, husband, son, daughter,
grandson, granddaughter;

(b) xxx xxx xxx

(h) in any other case.

Explanation I.-For the purpose of this Article,
more persons than one when belonging to the
same firm shall be deemed to be one person.

Explanatfron II. - The term 'registration'
includes every operation incidental to
registration under the Registration Act, 1908.

Explanatfion III.-Where, under clause (D duty
has been paid on the power of attorney, and a
coriveyance relating to that property is
subsequently executed in pursuance of the
power of attorney between the executant of the
power of attorney and the person in whose
favour it is executed, the duty on conveyance
shall be the duty calculated on the market value
of the pioperty reduced by duty paid on the
power of attorney.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

46. PROTEST OF BILL, OR NOTE, that is
to say, any declaration in writing made by a
Notary or other person lawfully acting as such,
attesting the dishonor of Bill of Exchange or
nromissorv note:

One hundred rupees.

47. PROTEST BY THE MASTER OF A
SHIP, that is to say, any declaration of the
particulars of her voyage drawn up bv him

One hundred rupees.



t3

with a view to the adjustment of losses or th"
calculation ofaverages, and every declaration in
writing made by him against the charterers or
the consingnees for not loading or unloading the
ship when such declaration is attested or
certified by a Notary or other person lawfully
acting as such.
See also Note of Protest by the Master of a ship

48. RECOI\-VEYAI\CE OF MORTGAGED
PROPERTY.

One hundred rupees.

48A. RECORD OF' TRANSACTION
(electronic or otherwise) effected by a trading
member through a stock exchange or the
association,-

(a) if relating to sale and purchase of
Government securities,

(b) to (d) xxx xxx xxx

Explanation,L- No duty shall be chargeable
under this article on agreement or its record
or note or memorandum, iof proper duty is
paid under article 5 or 39, as the case may
be.

Explanation II.- For the purpose of clause
(b), securities shall have the same meaning
as define under the Securities Contract
(Regulation) Act, 1956.

One hundred rupees.

49. RELEASE, that is to say, any instrument
(not being such a release as is provided for by
section 24) whereby a person renounces a claim
upon another person or against any specified
property.-

(a) ifthe release deed ofan ancestral property or
part thereof is executed by or in favour of
brpther or sister (children of renouncer's
parents) or son or daughter or son of
predeceased son or daughter ofpredeceased son
or father or mother or spouse ofthe renouncer
or the legal heirs of the above relations;

One hundred rupees.

H-2t5-4 (SrS-10)



I4

(b) XXX XXX XXX

51. SECURITY BOND OR MORTGAGE-
DEED executed by way of security for the due
execution of an office, or to account for money
or other propefty received by virtue thereof or
executed by a surety to secure the due
performance of a contact-

Exemptions

Bond or other instrument, when executed-
(a) by any person for the purpose of
guaranteeing that the local income derived from
private subscriptions to a charitable dispensary
or hospital or any other object of public utility
shall not be less than a specified sum per
mansen;

(b) under the rules made by the State
Government under section 76 of the Bombay
Irrigation Act,1879;

(c) executed by persons taking advances under
the Land Improvement Loan Act, 1883, or the
Agriculturists" Loans Act, 1884 or by their
sureties as security for the repayment of such
advances;
(d) executed by officers of the Govemment or
their sureities to secure the due execution ofan
office or the due accounting for money or other
orooertv received bv virtue thereof.

One hundred rupees.

55. SURRENDER OF LEASE.

Exemptions

Surrender of lease, when such lease is exempted
from dutv.

One hundred rupees.

56. TRAI\SFER (whether with or without
considerationF

(a)



l5

(b) of any interest secured by bond, mortguge-
deed or policy of insurance.

(c) of any properqy under the Administrators
General Act, 1963 section 22.

(d) of any trust property without consideration
from one trustee to another trustee or from a
trustee to a beneficiarv.

Exemptions

Transfer by endorsement-

(a) of a bill of exchange, cheque or
promissory note;

(b) of a bill of lading delivery order,
warrant for goods or other mercahtile
document of title of goods;

(c) of a policy of insurance;
(d) of securities ofthe Central Government.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.

58. TRUST_

(a) Declaration of-of, or conceming any
propedy when made by any writing not being a
will.

(b) Revocation of-of, or conceming, any
propqrty when made by any instrument other
than a Will.

One hundred rupees.

One hundred rupees.



l6



I7

H-2ls-s (srs-10)



l8

GUJARAT LEGISLATURE SECRETARIAT

GUJARAT BILL NO. 11 OF 2019.

A BILL

further to amend the Gujarat Stamp Act, 1958.

ISHRI KAUSHIK PATEL,

MINISTER FOR REVET.ITJE]

(As published in the Gujarat Government
Gtzette of 2"d July,2019)

D.M.PATEL

Secretary,

Guj arat Legislative Aspembly.

Government Central Press, Gandhinagar.




