GUJARAT BILL NO. 23 OF 2023.

THE GUJARAT LOCAL AUTHORITIES LAWS
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023.

A BILL

further to amend the Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the Gujarat
Municipalities Act, 1963 and the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993.

Ul 20234] I%Ad Qs sHis: 23.

A UBS Udlsn slAEL (JYulRl) [QRas, 2023.

o)A WALAAA »ARUA SR AR [AAN, 1e¥e, %2
doRU@sL AR AAH, 1¢53 Aal A UALRAA
URRAAU, 1ee3 dy JuRdl slled (QRas.

WL, URctoll ARRAAL Y ARML i Hl oAl MARAUH UL WA B:-

Loo(1) AR IR aUlls utHs o slAEL (YHURL) ARRA§M, 2023 34 wisu
sdcllal. A BL2eL

(), AxA AR, AW UAHL WdUHLYL, otssl 52 Al AR AUHAHL

LA,
et . 9ld WNALAAA »jARuUA sluRalel AB(AAM, 1eyeHl, SAH U-H, V- ¥t 1eset
1e¥eall sCL (9)u Yolgell UeHl
Jogell ’ U
uel. (1) “As8lell gt 2vllell As €2l A5 A AL HeQ, “Asfloll 5 Wl
YRl

s Avloll Urllcflu 25t Assl” A ALl Hsa;

()  ollAcll URds GARAL:-



“UR UL adlefl calsaall Hizell Guaed Aatitd, AsSlell st
Auaulell AR 251 A BollHcdal Aot 233",

el esyell 3. XA dRUASL URAAUH, 1eS3-H, sAM §-H, el-5cAH (3)Hi, uis

o RUctell (QUHL, -
3yl

ARR2AA (1) “Qsslol st Avausll As gl A5 AW ALl HeQ, “AsSlall
se sell s Avloll Allcfl 25t Assl” A ALl ysau;
YRl

()  olAell URdSl GRRaL:-

“URe UBL cdlofl calsall HiRell Guaed Aatitd, AsSloll s
Auaulell AR 251 A BoltHdal Aot 233

Ayl AH 9, UgYRA (A A BofRA Aot colsll
csAulloll crel, st clrellott el estell ay dlat, R Asslall
s Avlell As ealial Ass|, Ul adlefl calsAN HIZ WellHd
AUl A8 wal wall adl HRell Assl GURell uis (5)ell
oLl SHL AR WollHct Avcllo(l 33",

aet wcesar . Rl WAl AU, 1¢e3 (Bl wHL s ugdl, “Uulad wRBEAaW

9¥RUdsll A3 GeAw sAl B AU, SAH ¢-Hi, Vel-sAH (WHL, uls (5)Hl, Qal-uls
UCHL .

URRaHA (R)ML-

se el (1)  “Asslell st Avallell Ws 212l A5 A A€l UEA, “A65loll
YURl.

s Avloll Allcfl 25t Ass" A AGEL Ysal;
()  ollAell URdS GRRal:-

U AMU®s wal Aal@ls A usld adlell calsaxll el
Buded ollHd, Assloll sA Avalell UAU 251 §EH BollH ol
Wt 233

Ayl A 9dl, WojyRd A Ul WofyRA 2Est(Aail cololl
clsalloll ardl, sct arcllott lellu estell ay 8, IR Asslell
s dvallell As eaiel Ass, AHURS w Ae@s A usid

2

Yol
1e5¥oll
s clell
3¥u.

Yol
1¢e30ll
s cloll
enl.



adlofl calsaull HI2 Aot AWl A wWal el adll Hizell
A651 BURell Vel-us (1 )ell oLelleBll WafAIR WatlHd Avcllall
B

u. AR WERQUHHL, sAH 10-H, el-sEAH (W)HL, uls (5)HL, Vel-us (R)HI,-

(1)

(R)

“A65loll $A AvAlell s 22l &5 A 2AEl HEQ, “As5lell
§A AvAloll Arllcfl 25t A5 A AGEL HYsal;

o{lAell UGSl GARAl:-

U AHUBs ol Ae@ls A usld cdloll caulsall el
Guce Ualtid, Asslell gt Avloll UUX 281 $A oMol
wutllat 23

Ayl AH O, YR (A ua AgYRd 2R (Astl colell
(sl cell, A acllott ol estell ay dlat, R Asslell
s dvallell As eaial Ass, WHURs wa Aat@s AA usid
Adloll caulsetl MR WoltHd AUl M8 wal Bilell adll 1ol

A58l GURell Val-uis (1 )oll oLelle WofAIR WatlHd Avcllall
0’

S. AR AM@QQaHHL, seH 19-HE, Val-5EAH (W)HL, Uis (5)HL, Vel-uis ()HI,-

(1)

(R)

“A65loll sA AvUlell Ws alial Ass” A 2AcElal WEQ, “As5lell
§A Avloll Allcfl 25t A5 A AGEL Ysal;

o{lAell UGSl GARAL:-

U AMURs wal Aaldls A usld adlell calsaxll el
BuAed ollHd, Assloll A Avale(l UAU 251 §EH WMol dal
wlot 232

Ayl AH O, BofYRd A Ul MgYRct 2R (Astl cololl
c(sAlloll cell, s arclott wollu estell ay dlat, R Asslell
s dvallell As eaiel Ass, WHURS w Ae@ds A usid

3

Aol 1¢E30ll
o)A ctall
eul
RETE
$AU 100l
YRl

Aol 1¢E30ll
o)A ctall
cul
UM
$AH 140l
YRl



ol 1eE30ll
s clell
Leul
REEE
AU Yol
YRl

ol 1¢E30ll
9JfActall
LML

R RAaHA
$AH §30ll
YR,

adlofl calsaull HI2 Aot AWl A wWal el adll Hizell
A651 BURell Vel-us (1 )ell oLelleBll WafAIR WatlHd Avcllall
B

9. dlAd @RAaHH], sAH ua-H, Val-sAHH ()L, WS (8)H-

(1)

(R)

“Slaloll €U 25l Slal” A AcElA HeQ, “ Slaloll Al est Q&L
A AGEL Hsa;

o{lAsll URdSl GARAl:-

U AMURs wal Aalls A usld adlell calsaxll el
GuAed Aolldd, Assloll sA Avauloll UUWRA 251 A WallH ol
wtllot 23

Ayl AH 9, UgYRA (A A BofR A R Astl colsll
sl cirell, s arcdlott ol estell ay 8lat, R el
S5C Avlell As eial dlal, AHBs wa 2al@ls A usid
Aololl sl MR ottt Al BB Aol Bdlcll cdll Holl
A65L L ViSall Sl WofAIR WollHct Avclloll 33",

¢. UuRld AEQaHH, seH $3-Hl, Vel-5EH (R)HL, WS (5)Hl,-

()

(R)

“Saloll €1 25l 8lal” A AcElA WEQ, “Slaloll Al esl alal”
A AGEL Hsa;

o{lAsll UGSl GARAl:-

U AUMURs wal Aaldls A usld adlell calsaxll el
GuAed Aolldd, Assloll sA Avaloll UUR 251 A WallHdal
wtllot 23

Ayl AH 9, WogYRd (A A BgYRd s Astl colsll
csAloll ciRell, st arcdlott ol estell ay dlat, R alelell
A AvAlell As eial dlal, AHBs wa 2a@ls A usid



c.

cololl cAlsAR HIZ WollHd Al A S wal dladl ol Hizo(l
A65L L ViSall Sl WofRAIR WollHct Avcllofl 33",

AR A@AAHHL, sEH 99-H, Vel-sAAH (R)HL, WS (5)Hl,-

(1)

(R)

“Slaloll €1 25l Slal” A AcEl HEQ, “Slaloll Al esl Q&
A AGEL Hsa;

o{lAsll UGSl GARAl:-

U AHRBs wal Ael@s A usild adlefl calsall ol
BUAeA AollHd, A65lell st Avale(l U 25l §EH BotlHddal
et 232

Ay Hl AH i, YR A ual AgYR A 2R (Astl colell
clsAulloll arcll, &t arcllott ol estell ay dlat, R Slalell
A Avlell As eial dlal, AHBs wal 2Aal@ls A usid
Adloll calsall M2 WotllHd AWl BB M el adll Hidall
A65L L ViSall Sl WofAIR WollHct Avclloll 33",

Yol 1¢C30ll
aJosRActall
Leul
wuRRaus{l
SAU 9ol
YRl



G&all dal stel

Udd [QQasell oxpAd WAGAaA »ARUA sWURAA uURA2H, 1eye,
At 1RARUA sluRaet WERAUH, 1653 WA %A VAR wU@RAUN,
1ee3oll uys olalsAl, Aolld wWERANHT A wYs olledlotl AGiUH
ASIUcl clalall HI2 ual eUAs Hselletl adlaeal Y0 scll HI2 Julal Ul B.

(2020) © WAL 202 Ui AwWAA, ¥. (5xy(d (SL.) U U Q6 Rl
AU U W, (024) & AU W3 ui AwAd, [@Asin Bwria suadl @3«
USRI RA%A ol W, 202 WUR{R{l wotcisat AU uceul aAlwdd, Y2
Holoot (Agg Htal YR 2l A% ol Wol-oll FAHL alHER ekl YH sléatl wug el
UfAUR ol Y2 Helxot ([Ag HLAYR I AU Bl Bol-all FAUHL Aol 02 ol Jle
URY sHIS RVCHL dl. 1¢Hl R, 022 oll [ALal UajUIR, JYxRAc AU, dl. ¢Hl
LS, 2022 oll U], “oJ%Uclall eUAs HSOUHL Wl UL collotl MatlHcd HIall
UHA AR oll wtuet d31E WRRAUL sl8sléall (g v cuauelel, cuatlal
5. AA.BA3N [AHgs 531 ocll. ol wal 2330 wilads Hsel MR el UL ddllo]
YHIRL Al Aol UBLA clOll HIZoll AetiHcloll A8l otssl sal HIZ  UHA 0L
GRL dEajUR HAMRL sl 4l B.

UL AoluHl, AHMA MUERNI Y SRAL Bl Al WeALR HIZ, UHU(Bs
oA ol AAsiRclt [Aewdt gt 3otz Vat-uRAAl 20t saul wuell el ueRe
UAEAR Dlell daHel % sl B wal GURell etctHel dollld, (@2 g1l
AUAA [ALlA WfUIR, RULLS cl-RAx2U(l A2WBNML Wod UBLA Allell ABSL Wal
lel M2 33| Aolcllesl scll U2, A AURA2NML AUy s HISUHL JUIRL SRl
HER, opsAd WAGAaA »ARudA sluRalet wEAaUM, 1c¥esll s u-Hi, oA
ORUIASL U@[AAH, 1es3ell seAH sHL Bal ol %A AR wR([A2N,
1ee3all sl ¢, 10, 19, U, $3 ol VIHL JUIRL $Rclloll @ B.

Ul QRasl Gusct GRall Rg scll HIR2 e wEA2UH YruRew W B,

BRI e,



sl Al Wuae(l ai€l

L QRasHL, o{lAell cllotdlott Aol ulat Uctiell Auell 12 Wl 53l
-

SAM .- L setoll Vat-set ()AL AU AR, AXUAHL WU, UERW
WEAAAH B AR WHAHL AN A dAlFlH oissl salell Ul HA B.

BUsct Ul Arlloll WUR uLcUs Wl UHLIA YsIRall 8,

ARlut: 1l 1R,2023. A3 UA.



SR aetedl
UL

slolRUll@st
Jelde
516RAAA
oll watd.

yagll

9% WALAAA 1RARUA S\URAA URERAH, 1e¥e (Aol LeY el Yusoll
weHl) Higl Gt

w.o(a) ol () xxx XXX XXX

(s) €35 slURAML el 2yepllell erasll Asslell sa vl As ealial Ass),
uoldaolell calsaill 2 Matitcd AU S8 M usLdcdl W A I el
ANAl Assloll As qcdlatial Assl, usLdcadloll BlA 1 Wttt AWl H183,

(9) A (¢) XXX XXX XXX

yael

A stdRULASL AURRAUH, 1ESY (Aol 1S ¥all I%Adall 3¥HL) Higll Gl

G. (1) Aol (R) XXX XXX XXX

(3) 818 sdRUIAsMisll SIGRAAAA Assloll gt Avaumiell, wofyRd (A,
YRt e, ustdaol wal dl U@ oA Yyudl Assl woltdd Awcll
A3~

(5) Wal (W) XXX XXX XXX

(A1) €35 sRU@sHL AL Yeullell eRaell Assloll st Avauell Ws-gaial AsS|,
usld clofl caEA R Aottt AW A8, wal wcdl A usld aol ue@
Ui AN Asslell As dlAauial Ass, usidadlell Blvll W2 Wl AWl
RS, vl Assl el el HAelR HsoUML 6AAC A sl stacll asial.

(W) Aol (A) XXX XXX XXX

(¥) Al (¢) XXX XXX XXX



yagll

oA UARAA ERAAH, 1¢e3 (Mol 1ee30ll AsAdall LeH)HIE Gl

e. (1) dl (¥) Xxx XXX XXX
(1) (5) (1) XXX XXX XXX

(R) AU USRell A@YLaA Yosol, dUHHUL AHBs ua Ae@ls A usid colsll
ducdl 8l U, AU UsR, AHUIBs wad Aal@ds A usidaol H2, A
AAdHiell Assloll st dAvaulell Ws €201 A8, WollHd AVl A e vl
A6l A dUHMisll, el el Sl sAAC A clRiscl A2 erl sMatst glRy
staacll e,

(W) Aal (A1) XXX XXX XXX
Q0. (1) Aol (¥) XXX XXX XXX
(M) (5) (1) XXX XXX XXX

(R) AU ABR, AHURSs wA Ae@dls A usid ol 12 dlggst Udladell Asslsll
SCA AvAlall As €22 A5 S|, Mottt AVl BB Wal wLcl AsS A Al sLHisll, %EL
€l WE[RlS HAElR HsAla 6AA A A Yeurll sMatstal cRigdl iRl st
e

(W) Aol (3) XXX XXX XXX
(s) XXX XXX XXX
9. (1) Al (¥) XXX XXX XXX
(W) (5) () XXX XXX XXX

(?) [(Bectt duadHioll Asslell et dvausl vs eaial AsS), AU USSR, UHULS
A el@ls A ustdaol HIZ wettHd AWl 8. A Ul Assl A (FectHislL,
o€l el YRRLS UAER Hstlal 6AA A aRgcl A% erll sPaal sl
S &53\.

UM
qaadel
Ul

dlgst
qadel
Yol

(ecl
qauadlell
UL



yaade(l
wdcl Ass
Ual

GuARU Ul

Jeull.

Yol
udcl Ass
el Yy
Ual
Guyyue(l
Jeall.

el
Yol
wdcl Ass
el Yy
dat
Guyyua(l
Jeqll.

(u) el (A1) XXX XXX XXX
(s) XXX XXX XXX
uq. (1) XXX XXX XXX

() (5) A%&Aell MM UM YARIAAL AU UL &L, Boff (At wRstlAD 12 AL
AR BallHd AWl SIS,

AUNL50L- AL ViSall Al HI2, “OlH Ul Ble@ UM WAL, Boll UMY
(AR, wYRd [@ArctiRall talAl Sl

(W) XXX XXX XXX
3) Al (¢) XXX XXX XXX
$3. (1) XXX XXX XXX

(R) (5) AUl AHIM Algsl UARUAAL Yol M Slal, Aoyt uleastfd ue
AU AR WollHcl Al S183.

AUNL50L- AL Visell gl M2 “dlgsl UAAA” A2 dlggsl vulAd, Boll
AHY UL AR, AR A [QArcllRA WA &L,

(W) XXX XXX XXX
(3) ol (¢) Xxx XXX XXX
99. (1) XXX XXX XXX

(R) (5) A%l AHIM (Rl VAol Yyuloll 8lal, wajyRAd wRxstld H2 Ax
USR AollHd Al A8

AUNL50L- Ul Visell gl M2 “(Bectl WAlAA” ded [Beal vAad, Boll
AU UL QAR WgYRA QrdRA caA &l

(W) XXX XXX XXX

3) ol (¢) xxx XXX XXX

10



11



s [Qutstyen ARaa

[Mel 20234] %RUcl ([ABAs sUis : 23]

A WALAAA RARUA sIURast wRERAUN,
1e¥e, AsRld dRU@ASsL AU[AAN, 1¢53 Ul
opsAd UARAA AREAH, 1ee3 day YuRdl
olold [@QRas.

sl B3 w2,
A {8l

(Aol 20?3 ell ARW1R H3atloll 121l ARIN dpes2Ad
ARsIEL A WAL URs sl Yrw)

S RETRTRRVEICH
AR«
g2 (Auuletyet.

12



THE GUJARAT LOCAL AUTHORITIES LAWS
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023.

GUJARAT BILL NO. 23 OF 2023.

A BILL

further to amend the Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporations Act,
1949, the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 and the Gujarat
Panchayats Act, 1993.

It is hereby enacted in the Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic
of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws Short title and
(Amendment) Act, 2023. commencement.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.



Amendment 5 In the Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, in
of section 5 of

Bom.LIX of  section 5, in sub-section (6), -
1949.

(1) for the words “One —tenth of the total number of seats”,
the words “Twenty-seven per cent. of the total number
of seats” shall be substituted;

(1) the following proviso shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the Backward Classes shall be subject to
aggregate reservation of fifty per cent. of the total
number of seats.”.

Amendment of 3, In the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963, in section 6, in sub-
section 6 of

Guj. 34 0of1964.  gection (3), in clause (¢), -

(1) for the words “One —tenth of the total number of seats”,
the words “Twenty-seven per cent. of the total number

of seats” shall be substituted;

(1) the following provisos shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the Backward Classes shall be subject to
aggregate reservation of fifty per cent. of the total

number of seats:

Provided however that one-tenth of the total number of
seats shall be reserved for the persons belonging to the
Backward Classes, where the population of the persons
belonging to the Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes
categories exceeds forty per cent. of the total population
and the seats for such categories shall be required to be

reserved in accordance with the provisions of clause (a)

above.”.
Amendment of 4 In the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993 (hereinafter referred to as
tion 9 of . . . . . .
Guj_sle; ;(}1199(;. “the Panchayats Act”), in section 9, in sub-section (5), in clause (a), in

sub-clause (ii), -

Bom. LIX
of 1949.

Guj. 34
of 1964.

Guj. 18 of
1993.



5.

(1) for the words “one tenth of the total number of seats”, the

words “twenty-seven per cent. of the total number of seats”

shall be substituted;

(i1) the following provisos shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the socially and educationally backward
classes shall be subject to aggregate reservation of fifty per
cent. of the total number of seats:

Provided however that one tenth of the total number of
seats shall be reserved for the persons belonging to the
socially and educationally backward classes, where the
population of the persons belonging to the Scheduled
Castes and Scheduled Tribes categories exceeds forty per
cent. of the total population and the seats for such
categories shall be required to be reserved in accordance

with the provisions of sub-clause (i) above.”.

In the Panchayats Act, in section 10, in sub-section (5), in

clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), -

(1) for the words “One tenth of the total number of seats”, the

words “Twenty-seven per cent. of the total number of seats”

shall be substituted;

(i1) the following provisos shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the socially and educationally backward
classes shall be subject to aggregate reservation of fifty per
cent. of the total number of seats:

Provided however that one tenth of the total number of
seats shall be reserved for the persons belonging to the
socially and educationally backward classes, where the
population of the persons belonging to the Scheduled
Castes and Scheduled Tribes categories exceeds forty per
cent. of the total population and the seats for such
categories shall be required to be reserved in accordance

with the provisions of sub-clause (i) above.”.

Amendment of
section 10 of
Guj. 18 of 1993.



Amendment of  0° In the Panchayats Act, in section 11, in sub-section (5), in

section 11 of

Guij. 18 of 1993, clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), -

(1) for the words “One tenth of the total number of seats”, the
words “Twenty-seven per cent. of the total number of seats”
shall be substituted;

(i1) the following provisos shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the socially and educationally backward
classes shall be subject to aggregate reservation of fifty per
cent. of the total number of seats:

Provided however that one tenth of the total number of
seats shall be reserved for the persons belonging to the
socially and educationally backward classes, where the
population of the persons belonging the Scheduled Castes
and Scheduled Tribes categories exceeds forty per cent. of
the total population and the seats for such categories shall
be required to be reserved in accordance with the provisions

of sub-clause (i) above.”.

Amendmentof 7, In the Panchayats Act, in section 51, in sub-section (2), in
section 51 of

Guj. 180f1993.  (lause (a), -

(1) for the words “ten percent of the offices”, the words
“twenty-seven per cent. of the offices” shall be substituted;

(i1) the following provisos shall be added, namely:-
“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the socially and educationally backward
classes shall be subject to aggregate reservation of fifty per
cent. of the total number of seats:
Provided however that one tenth of the total number of
offices shall be reserved for the persons belonging to the
socially and educationally backward classes, where the
population of the persons belonging to the Scheduled
Castes and Scheduled Tribes categories exceeds forty per

cent. of the total population and the seats for such



categories shall be required to be reserved in accordance

with the provisions of this clause.”.

8. In the Panchayats Act, in section 63, in sub-section (2), in Amendment of
section 63 of
clause (a), - Guj. 18 of 1993.

(1) for the words “ten percent of the offices”, the words
“twenty-seven per cent. of the offices” shall be substituted,;

(i1) the following provisos shall be added, namely:-
“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the socially and educationally backward
classes shall be subject to aggregate reservation of fifty per
cent. of the total number of seats.”.
Provided however that one tenth of the total number of
offices shall be reserved for the persons belonging to the
socially and educationally backward classes, where the
population of the persons belonging to the Scheduled
Castes and Scheduled Tribes categories exceeds forty per
cent. of the total population and the seats for such
categories shall be required to be reserved in accordance

with the provisions of this clause.”.

0. In the Panchayats Act, in section 77, in sub-section (2), in Amendment of
section 77 of
clause (a), - Guj. 18 of 1993.

(1) for the words “ten percent of the offices”, the words
“twenty-seven per cent. of the offices” shall be substituted;
(1) the following provisos shall be added, namely:-
“Provided that the reservation available to the persons
belonging to the socially and educationally backward
classes shall be subject to aggregate reservation of fifty per
cent. of the total number of seats:
Provided however that one tenth of the total number of
offices shall be reserved for the persons belonging to the
socially and educationally backward classes, where the
population of the persons belonging to the Scheduled

Castes and Scheduled Tribes categories exceeds forty per



cent. of the total population and the seats for such
categories shall be required to be reserved in accordance

with the provisions of this clause.”.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The present Bill seeks to amend certain provisions of the
Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporation Act, 1949, the Gujarat
Municipal Corporation Act, 1963 and the Gujarat Panchayat Act, 1993,
so as to bring uniformity in respect of certain matters contained in the

respective Acts and to facilitate the administration of local bodies.

As Per the direction of the Hon'ble Supreme Court of India in
the cases of K. Krishnamurthy (Dr.) and others vs. Union of India and
another, reported in (2010) 7 SCC 202; Vikas Kishanrao Gawali vs.
State of Maharashtra and others, reported in (2021 6 SCC 73; Suresh
Mabhajan vs. State of Madhya Pradesh and another, reported in 2022
SCC Online SC 589 and the decision dated 18th May 2022 in Writ
Petition No.278 of 2022 in the case of Suresh Mahajan vs. The State of
Madhya Pradesh and anr., the State of Gujarat, by resolution dated 8th
July 2022, appointed retired Chief Justice of Orissa High Court, Justice
K.S. Jhaveri as Chairman of the "Dedicated Commission for
Reservation of Other Backward Classes in Local Bodies of Gujarat."
To determine the proportion of Other Backward Classes for rural and
urban local bodies and reservation seats for Other Backward Classes

have been recommended accordingly by the Dedicated Commission.

In this regard, to further study of the report submitted by the
Dedicated Commission, the Cabinet Sub-Committee was constituted
by the Social Justice and Empowerment Department. The said
committee has submitted its recommendations, and as per the decision
taken by the Cabinet regarding the above recommendations, the
necessary amendments are to be made in the section 5 of the Gujarat
Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, section 6 of the Gujarat
Municipalities Act, 1963 and sections 9, 10, 11, 51, 63 and 77 of the
Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993, to make necessary provisions for seats
and posts of other backward classes in local self-government bodies, to
envisages making certain quantitative amendments in the relevant

Acts.



This Bill seeks to amend the said Act to achieve the aforesaid

objects.

RUSHIKESH PATEL,

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

This Bill provides for delegation of legislative powers in the

following respects:-

Clause 1. -  Sub-clause (2) of this clause empowers the State
Government to appoint by notification in the Official Gazette,

the date on which the Act shall come into force.

The delegation of legislative powers as aforesaid is necessary

and is of a normal character.

Dated the 11™ September, 2023. RUSHIKESH PATEL.



ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE GUJARAT PROVINCIAL MUNICIPAL
CORPORATIONS ACT, 1949.

( Bom. LIX of 1949 )

5. (1) to (5) XXX XXX XXX

(6) One-tenth of the total number of seats to be filled by direct
election in every corporation shall be reserved for persons belonging to
backward classes and as nearly as may be one-half of the seats so
reserve for backward classes shall be reserved for women belonging to

the Backward Classes.

(7) and (8) XXX XXX XXX
ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE GUJARAT MUNICIPALITIES ACT,
1964.
( Guj. 34 OF 1964 )
6. (1) and (2) XXX XXX XXX

(3) Out of the total number of seats of councilors in a municipality,
there shall be reserved seats for Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes,

Backward Classes and Women as follows namely:-
(a) and (b) XXX XXX XXX

(c) One-tenth of the total number of seats to be filled by direct election
in every municipality shall be reserved for persons belonging to
Backward Classes and as nearly as may be one-half of the seats so
reserved for Backward Classes shall be reserved for women belonging
to the Backward Classes. Such seats may be allotted by rotation to

different constituencies in the prescribed manner.
(d) and (e) XXX XXX XXX

(4) to (8) XXX XXX XXX

Constitution of
Corporation

Municipalities
to consist of
elected
councilors.



Constitution of
Village
Panchayats.

Constitution of
Taluka
Panchayats

Constitution of
District
Panchayats

10

ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE GUJARAT PANCHAYATS ACT, 1993.
(Guj. 18 OF 1993 )

9. (1)and (4)
(3) (@) (@)

(i) Where in a village there is in the opinion of the State Government

XXX
XXX

XXX
XXX

XXX
XXX

population of socially and educationally backward classes, there shall
be reserved by the State Government for the socially and educationally
backward classes one tenth of the total number of seats in a village
panchayat and such seats shall be allotted by the State Election

Commission by rotation to different wards in that village in the

prescribed manner.

(b) and (c) XXX XXX XXX
10.(1) and (4) XXX XXX XXX
(5) (@) (1) XXX XXX XXX

(i1) One tenth of the total number of seats in a taluka panchayat shall be
reserved by the State Government for socially and educationally
backward classes and such seats shall be allotted by the State Election
Commission by rotation to different territorial constituencies in that

taluka in the prescribed manner.

(b) and (c) XXX XXX XXX
(6) XXX XXX XXX
11. (1) and (4) XXX XXX XXX
(5) (a) (i) XXX XXX XXX

(i1) One tenth of the total number of seats in a district panchayat shall
be reserved by the State Government for socially and educationally
backward classes and such seats shall be allotted by the State Election
Commission by rotation to different territorial constituencies in that
district in the prescribed manner.
(b) and (c) XXX

XXX XXX



11

XXX XXX XXX

(6)

51. (1) XXX XXX XXX
(2) (a) All offices of sarpanch of village panchayats in the State shall
be reserved by the State Government for the Scheduled Tribes.
Explanation - For the purposes of this clause, "village
panchayat" means the village panchayat, the whole local area of which

comprises of the Scheduled Areas.

(b) XXX XXX XXX
(3) to (8) XXX XXX XXX
63. (1) XXX XXX XXX

(2) (a) All offices of the President of the taluka panchayats in the State
shall be reserved by the State Government for the Scheduled Tribes.

Explanation-For the purposes of this clause, "taluka panchayat'

means the taluka panchayat, the whole local area of which comprise of

the Scheduled Areas.

(b) XXX XXX XXX
(3) to (8) XXX XXX XXX
77. (1) XXX XXX XXX

(2) (a) All offices of the President of the district panchayats in the
State shall be reserved by the State Government for the Scheduled
Tribes.

Explanation- For the purposes of this clause, "district
panchayat" means the district panchayat, the whole local area of which
comprises of the Scheduled Areas.
(b) XXX
(3) to (8) XXX

XXX
XXX

XXX
XXX

First meeting
of panchayat
and election of
Sarpanch and
Upa- Sarpanch

First meeting
of panchayat
and election of
President and
Vice-President.

First meeting
of district
panchayat and
election of
President and
Vice-President.



12



13



14

GUJARAT LEGISLATURE SECRETARIAT

GUJARAT BILL NO. 23 OF 2023.
A BILL

further to amend the Gujarat Provincial
Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the Gujarat
Municipalities Act, 1963 and the Gujarat
Panchayats Act, 1993.

[ SHRI RUSHIKESH PATEL,
MINISTER FOR HEALTH]

(As published in the Gujarat Government Gazette
of 11" September, 2023)

D.M.Patel,
Secretary,

Gujarat Legislative Assembly.



	363,DBPL.pdf (p.1-12)
	363,BDP.pdf (p.13-26)

