GUJARAT BILL NO. 25 OF 2020.

THE CHILD AND ADOLESCENT LABOUR (PROHIBITION AND
REGULATION) (GUJARAT AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2020.
A BILL

further to amend the Child and Adolescent Labour (Prohibition and
Regulation) Act, 1986 in its application to the State of Gujarat.

ol 0004 %3l [AR2Us sHis: U

Gl Aol (390R s (uloitl A [AAMat) (A YuiRl) [@QBas, R0%0.

9ol AU G USAl A A2A Yl sl Aal (320R s (yldoit wual
[Raunet) wAAH, 1ecs ay YuRal oot [QRas.

], MRdoll dRR%AUAL RS ARHL A HT oA WAA2AH scUHL A B:-

L@ A ARRAH i w (AR U (ylQeiu wA RaMel) (9
YURL) w@(AaM, 2020 sdcul,

() A, AU AR, AWUAHL H3UHL atssl 52 Acll AW WHAHL
ulcl9l,

el R, AR AU @ld] Uscl 8l de@ Yl sl wal (320 st (uldoitl ua
el [aHet) WRERAH, s (Ball wWHL sA UYl, “Yua @21 4313 GecAu sl

L . )
s ® )i, sAH VUi -

(1) Vel-5eH (VHL, “UAA %R 3’ A Acfla Wed, “As Alw
320 A AGEL Ysal;

g4l dsu
Ua
YREL

Aol el
LRl
vRRnA
$EH ol
JURL



() Wel-5¢H (-5)Hl, “UAMA &% 3’ A Al Ged, “As cw
3020 A ALl Ysall.

trecsal 3 yu ARAAMHL, seAH W-U-HL Vel-sAH (O, “(Real AR A
SUHL

uRRandl  ACElA HEQ, “(Bectl AP, RARUA sMAAR, M [AAHS Ml AUYRIDL,
SEH L¥-u-oll

yuidl ORUW(ASIeI YE[@As sMaletr” A 2A6El Ysal,

wtaccsat Y. Hul W@[AAHH], sAH 19-5-Hi,-
su @)  “(ectt ARR2” A At wed, ‘el ARRe, wARUA

R RAuHCA
S 19-5-0l sMocr, M [auds wAdl AAYAOL,  ddRU@slel  yltlls
YuR s@aet” A AL Ysall;

(R)  slRAl Alunl, “(Bectl A" A Acklal e, “(Vectl ABe,
RARUA sMaetz, s [QaHs wadl oPRU@slell Yit[ls
s(Ralelr” A 2AcEl Ysel.



@&l A sRel

Wl Aol (320R sH (UlQoit wal [Rarat) u@AauH, wecs-2l, uys AU
WSl st AMal UR Yldold Hizell wal wys oflast AxoUHL sllnsletl siHsll
ARAle] [AauHat sall Hizell Holals 52 .

AHIH cAaARAML clln AR UR Yol Ysal HR2 A ollsloll U
U sABAUA Qe @R W@A2H, 00¢-o{l HotcsA Lol dAtal
AORAHL AHell ot olluell AN clattaaltoll Ylsal sal Hizell dqll sl st
(UlQoltl ua [Aamet) YRl URE@AH, 035 (Aot 035-0ll 3UHLYUL UERS Fodla
wURRAUUA [@Qarmet sAr 3 YuRaml Bl sl wa (B2 (V¥ il YU a2l A
W ¢ ad Y Al ot A Al cabal)al AuHl cldulHl JAUR UR
Yol Ysal 1R wal (3206l Actloll 2RAle] [RauHet sal MRall Slolaus s,
Ul 09501l UERS Bodll YR U1 set 3-5 Ul el saMl Ll
sl [Aanat s yoll Vat-ser (1) Aol (5)-Al AofsH, ARG SEHL 3 Aol
35-ofl HolaUsuoll Gecitlol olec €5 HZoll Wty 831 8. €soll e UARA
&R 3l aula As cw 3l sl %331 ey B. [Qhasel sau -,
d Heell Hotas s3l ©.

UERS Bodl @AMl sen wyoll Val-scnt (3) d6¢, ([Aetmiot setm y-
t-2l yar daud =Ad dallell Hiscln scll M2 (Becll AP Al HA B. 89,
UERS & HR RARUA sMask uual 1R @uHs wgdl RW@stel
Y @ls sMalolral Al Aluclle] Ul %330 xR 8. [QRasedl scu 3-el, a uRel
Slae 53| B.

[Qaust set 9-s-2dl  A%A UBWRA, UERS  Bodld  A@(A2mo{l
Rl ssHoll AR d WHA U 6N © Aol Wil sal 12, Uldlal %33 seu
Acl Al (Rectt Alea viucl H2 A Adl $% dAHell UR cleal HI2 Aal
Bl Ul AHIH AUl 518 Arlloll GUADL scllall sl weal L Il wwAdl
wdcl AElAAl Acl i waal 518 $9 olxstalcloll dla Ual AU USSR S
Q200 wofz, ¥ w3 R euls Haleoll e vl Al Wa $%lall
WHA scloll 8, Adl AHell (Becll ABReall) dlollell H(@sII A€ sa

3



Hizoll Al (Becatl Aol HA B, UERG SEH 19-5 Hl wRURU YHIReAl Sl
HER, ARUA sMaeik waadl HyR [auds wadl «dRw@slel yitldls
s[R2letal AUl WlUClo] URL A% URSIRA %33 WU B. [ABasell s ¥-el, a
HR2all Sotae 53l .

AU (QBasdl, Gudst GRAl Rg sal HER2, UERS dodlal ullAaun
JuRal w .

RelluguiR 61812,



tRusla Al Aol ael

wl @QBasHl, (Aol cledclotl doiuni, wRisla ucloll Wuell H2-A
AHLAL ALA D:-

SCM .- ul sAHo(l Vel-scH ()AL, AU USRA, AWUAHL detHL,
WRApHA SotasHA B AT AUHAML A A ARl oissl sclell Ul HA
R}

GUsc RS2 Aol AuRl wcUs e AMLA YsiRedl B.

Al acHl AR R, 20%0. RllugiR sislR.



yaell
Wl el (3202 s (Uloit e [AauMet) Wl A2AM, 2ees (et wcsall
gl Ml GellL.

3. (1) SlsuURL olltsal, S8 Al A YBAMHL dAlsIHl AHA A8 oll@
wcll AHl stH scllell URalatoll audl A8 «(s.

R) S8 olas,- (5) AUgYRUL [Qad sl 518 Aull cudua uaa
YAl Ratdotl sla dal, Wdlell Rk ugdl URdlRetl Galol-AsyH, Wdloll
AlOUatl AU Ul Al Ad2lol eM2Alol, HEE 53; (W) sl wA Al 2RAl
U AAM Aol HUESA uellot 8L, 32U, (5e, 2(A[QR3 RRAA wacl A
518 Wod HollRuot Ucl A5 Rclaoll M- doll UG AR suca-a22
(RASA-(AoRmct) HollRyet GEloML sAsR d3ld sl 52, R da, Val-5AH

()Mol 818 HwE Aol UsA oil8:

U Ul SAM &60l] A S8 sIH, GlOisell A0USIA WEARAA MU 5]
8lg Red (3.

AU 501~ Al SAHoAl S 12, -

(5)  cllasell doludl “URaR” A AceyAdl Aed Aol Hidl, Qdl, ey, tdel
A Acloll tdol Wl U W Hicloll tdal ol ells; (W) “URclell GeloL-
ASA” A Ace YAl AeA oA clscillal allsIHl Avllal uRclRell UeD gl
s Blald 518 512, A, GAUlEat wedl AUR; (A1) “SEASIR” AeA wl(elaldl,
ouas, MAlsl a3y weal Yal-sed (R)ell WS (W) 3601 Aladl HollRsl Wl
- doll YygRa cdolddl, sgceui 2w aAdl e ygRui Wa yeuat 3ld
AAA USal MW Al cddAd d3F S8 sl 5 dla AUl doll AeUU S

sla dd olms.

88

e U
ol
yGauul
ol
A%¥dURal
ylAoit,



UYS
Sl
calaall
U
yBGauul
R L
AWdUR
URell
ylAoiyu.

Qe

3-5. 818 (320R4, Uy RAul Rad sl SuHl caal wal Ylsad Ul sleul

AlsIAHL AW MBS oA(d wecll AHL 511 scllell URaletd(l Ul s «i(3:

URd Sost ARBLR, wEwtHlell, wl ARAaM ds1 ¥ stAMl (BARA 51U

scllo{l URalotoll Ul astal dal ([QAot-uwal ustzell sl [Ewe s3l asal.

. (1) sAM 3¢l FolausBle] Geciuot s3lal, slouel cllsa sl UR AW
AUl ol s scllol URallotoll W, A b, © UEoell W) oild vl A
ay Ylloll yedoll deoll waual flu sxell Wl o3 uel uAu™ %2 3
Yellotl £soll watal A vl [@Qetal wat gl

U Alall clasloll Hlcdl-dl Al alcdl dal dasa sau 3¢l
SLlasHls] Gecdot s3lal cAll@PAs dqull U@ uRdlstdl W A R, dxal

Qletl sRaHl WA (3.

(15) 5AM 3-50{l WlolcusBle] Gecltot s3a, slouLl (5206 olls3 UR AW MUl
(3olRaA std sRclloll URcllotoll W, A caulse, © HEouell WL ol uel A
Ylloll Yectoll Feoll uaal lu el AL olld ULl v %12 3R Yol
£soll wecl A el (et Wt adl.

Ud dllall (BolRall M-t weal adl el (3R sad 3-50(l
SLlasHls] Gecdot s3lal cAll@PAs dqull U@ uRdlstdl WA A R, dxal
[Qew sReuMl wad 3.

(aw) ol (3) XXX XXX XXX



3yeitell
HisaLn
sl
ollod.

-t (1) SIXELRl sRRlA WREAH, 1693 (Mol 1e9¥all -%1)HL A A HHER
Sl AH 9di, Cectt AR e, AURUL calsd gll 1R sdell, sAH 1ol Vel-sen
(3) 3601, AQl YU ducd $EL 518 dolloll waall Hicdl-MAcl Aeal aidl sla adl
518 WRAU calAA sl 58 datlell, sAcctdl wA Al A wal AYRA
URsRa Acll 2suoll Ysarll sAell, ofettell Hisalmn 53l as.

) ol (¥) XXX XXX XXX

9-5. AYRd URsR, L W(AAMel Rotcue2all olcpll A0 Aa aes Q| B
ad YR sal HR, [(Becll ARea, w331 sl dcll Al ua Adl g wdll
ASA WA (Feell ABRe, Aol dloll 360l A#@s13 AEe s3] s, Rl Al
A ducHl waal cteatHl Al L wgal slguel el Gullol 3l
ASA Ul dAHIH AUl SluRl $2% ol AsA A A AURsE sl B B
SElo{l 2ieR sl WA Al A Uil cWURAUHT A AUl $% GtAAH
AU A wWAs s€l RlEw 3l aAs.

Rreall
AR
gloLclLeSul
BHAH

ysal
oLl






oA [Qtueidel AR

[*ol 0200] 9[RUd [ABas suis: uU.]

IRl A% Y] uscll §la ded Yl oua
Ul (3202 81 (Uldoitt Aal [AAHet) W@ AN,
©es dy YuRal ollold [QRus.

[30l RcllugriR 61812,
AU Aol AouR HAls.]

(Aol 20200ll UARMAR HBollell el adln
oAt ARSI A UAML YRG sl Yoy

Sl AH. ud,
AR,

oAl (Atlotuedl.

10



THE CHILD AND ADOLESCENT LABOUR (PROHIBITION AND
REGULATION) (GUJARAT AMENDMENT) BILL, 2020.

GUJARAT BILL NO. 25 OF 2020.

A BILL

further to amend the Child and Adolescent Labour (Prohibition and
Regulation) Act, 1986 in its application to the State of Gujarat.

It is hereby enacted in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Child and Adolescent Labour
(Prohibition and Regulation) (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 2020.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

Short title and
commencement.



Amendment
of section 14
of 61 of
1986.

Amendment
of section
14D of 61 of
1986.

Amendment
of section
17A of 61 of
1986.

2. In the Child and Adolescent Labour (Prohibition and Regulation) Act,
1986, in its application to the State of Gujarat (hereinafter referred to as “the
principal Act”), in section 14, -

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words
“one lakh rupees” shall be substituted,

(i) in sub-section (1A), for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the
words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Act, in section 14D, in sub-section (1), for the words
“District Magistrate”, the words “District Magistrate, Municipal
Commissioner, Director of Labour or, as the case may be, the Regional
Commissioner of Municipalities” shall be substituted.

4, In the principal Act, in section 17A, -

(i) for the words “District Magistrate”, the words “District Magistrate,
Municipal Commissioner, Director of Labour or, as the case may
be, the Regional Commissioner of Municipalities” shall be
substituted,

(ii) in the marginal note, for the word “District Magistrate”, the words
“District Magistrate, Municipal Commissioner, Director of Labour
or Regional Commissioner of Municipalities” shall be substituted.

61 of 1986.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Child and Adolescent Labour (Prohibition and Regulation) Act,
1986 provides for prohibition of the engagement of children in certain
employments and for regulating the conditions of work of children in certain
other employments.

Existing section 3 of the said Central Act was amended vide the Child
Labour (Prohibition and Regulation) Amendment Act, 2016 (35 of 2016) with
a view to prohibiting employment of children in all occupations and processes
to facilitate their enrolment in schools in view of the provisions of the Right of
Children to Free and Compulsory Education Act, 2009 as also section 3A was
inserted vide the said Central Amending Act of 2016 to provide for prohibition
of employment of adolescents (persons who have completed fourteenth year of
age but have not completed eighteenth year) in hazardous occupations and
processes and to regulate the conditions of service of adolescents. Sub-section
(1) and (1A) of existing section 14 respectively provides for the penalty for
contravention of the provisions of said sections 3 and 3A. It is considered
necessary to enhance the amount of fine from fifty thousand rupees to one lakh
rupees. Clause 2 of the Bill provides for the same.

Existing section 14D empowers the District Magistrate to compound
the offences committed for the first time, under sub-section (3) of section 14 of
the said Central Act. Now, it is considered necessary also to empower the
Municipal Commissioner or Director of Labour or Regional Commissioner of
Municipalities for the said purpose. Clause 3 of the Bill provides for the same.

Existing section 17A empowers the State Government to confer such
powers and impose such duties on a District Magistrate as may be necessary to
ensure that the provisions of the said central Act are properly carried out and to
empower the District Magistrate to specify the officer subordinate to him who
shall exercise all or any of the powers and perform all or any of the duties so
conferred or imposed and the local limits within which such powers or duties
shall be carried out by the officer in accordance with the rules made by the
State Government. The State Government considers it necessary also to
empower the Municipal Commissioner or Director of Labour or Regional
Commissioner of Municipalities for the purposes as mentioned in the said
section 17A. Clause 4 of the Bill provides for the same.

This Bill seeks to amend the said Central Act to achieve the aforesaid

objects.

DILIPKUMAR THAKOR,



MEMORENDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

This Bill involves the delegation of legislative power in the following
respect:-

Clause 1.- Sub-clause (2) of this clause empowers the State Government,
by notification in the Official Gazette, to appoint the date on which the
Act shall come into force.

The delegation of power as aforesaid is necessary and is in normal
character.

Dated the 18" September, 2020. DILIPKUMAR THAKOR.



Prohibition
of
employment
of children in
any
occupation
and process.

Prohibition
of
employment
of
adolescents
in certain
hazardous
occupations
and
processes.

Penalties.

ANNEXURE

EXTRACT FROM THE CHILD AND ADOLESCENT LABOUR
(PROHIBITION AND REGULATION) ACT, 1986.

( 61 of 1986)

3. (1) No child shall be employed or permitted to work in any occupation
Or process.

(2) Nothing in sub-section (1) shall apply where the child, — (a) helps his
family or family enterprise, which is other than any hazardous occupations or
processes set forth in the Schedule, after his school hours or during vacations;
(b) works as an artist in an audio-visual entertainment industry, including
advertisement, films, television serials or any such other entertainment or
sports activities except the circus, subject to such conditions and safety
measures, as may be prescribed: Provided that no such work under this clause
shall effect the school education of the child.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section, the expression,

(a) “family” in relation to a child, means his mother, father, brother, sister and
father’s sister and brother and mother’s sister and brother; (b) “family
enterprises” means any work, profession, manufacture or business which is
performed by the members of the family with the engagement of other persons;
(c) “artist” means a child who performs or practices any work as a hobby or
profession directly involving him as an actor, singer, sports person or in such
other activity as may be prescribed relating to the entertainment or sports
activities falling under clause (b) of sub-section (2).

3A.  No adolescent shall be employed or permitted to work in any of the
hazardous occupations or processes set forth in the Schedule: Provided that the
Central Government may, by notification, specify the nature of the non-
hazardous work to which an adolescent may be permitted to work under this
Act.

14. (1) Whoever employs any child or permits any child to work in
contravention of the provisions of section 3 shall be punishable with
imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months but which
may extend to two years, or with fine which shall not be less than twenty
thousand rupees but which may extend to fifty thousand rupees, or with both:

Provided that the parents or guardians of such children shall not be
punished unless they permit such child for commercial purposes in
contravention of the provisions of section 3.



Compounding
of offences.

District
Magistrate
to
implement
the
provisions.

(1A) Whoever employs any adolescent or permits any adolescent to work in
contravention of the provisions of section 3A shall be punishable with
imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months but which
may extend to two years or with fine which shall not be less than twenty
thousand rupees but which may extend to fifty thousand rupees, or with both:

Provided that the parents or guardians of such adolescent shall not be
punished unless they permit such adolescent to work in contravention of the
provisions of section 3A.

(1B)to (3) XXX XXX XXX

14D. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 (2 of 1974), the District Magistrate may, on the application of
the accused person, compound any offence committed for the first time by
him, under sub-section (3) of section 14 or any offence committed by an
accused person being parent or a guardian, in such manner and on payment of
such amount to the appropriate Government, as may be prescribed.

(@ to@) XXX XXX XXX

17A. The appropriate Government may confer such powers and impose such
duties on a District Magistrate as may be necessary, to ensure that the
provisions of this Act are properly carried out and the District Magistrate may
specify the officer, subordinate to him, who shall exercise all or any of the
powers, and perform all or any of the duties, so conferred or imposed and the
local limits within which such powers or duties shall be carried out by the
officer as may be prescribed.



GUJARAT LEGISLATURE SECRETARIAT

GUJARAT BILL NO. 25 OF 2020.

A BILL

further to amend the Child and Adolescent Labour
(Prohibition and Regulation) Act, 1986 in its
application to the State of Gujarat.

[ SHRI DILIPKUMAR THAKOR,
MINISTER FOR LABOUR AND
EMPLOYMENT ]

( As published in the Gujarat Government
Gazette of 19" September, 2020)

D.M.PATEL,
Secretary,

Gujarat Legislative Assembly.





