GUJARAT BILL NO. 6 OF 2020.

THE SMALL CAUSE COURTS LAWS (GUJARAT AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2020.

A BILL

further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 in its
application to the City of Ahmedabad and the Provincial Small Cause Courts
Act, 1887 in its application to the State of Gujarat.

Uol 20200] %A [@QBaus sHis: s.

JA 5l 518 slaAEL (A%RUc YuiRl) (s, 20%0.

UHELALE 2AdRa o] Usl 8l d2A Yl YRASA 3 sl 518 u@Aam, 1¢¢?
el A AU Ad] Usl la d2@ Yl WAkAac A sl 518 u@Aan,
LCCY dy YulRal oltolc [@QRas.

A, MRl dRREsUAl ASARHL Ml (A U@ [A2H sRcUHl 2uQ
&: -

1. (1) Wl AR 2N 5103 818 SIAEL (%A JulRL) UR[A2UH, 2020 &8l st

ol AR,
soall.

() Q, AU ISR, AXUAHL A o UHIUL atssl 52 Acl AR wUHAHL

ULl



Aol 1CCRell
uuL
R
SAU 1¢all
YUl

Aol 1CCRell
uuL
wRRAaM{
$AH 00l
YUl

Aol 1¢CRell
uuL
wRRaM{
$AU 0l
YRl

Aol 1CCRell
uuL
wRRaM{
SN ¥l
YRl

Aol 1CCYoll
Ml

T RETEl
$AH Yol
YUl

Qs
ousl
3l
duéldl.

2. UWHELAE A ] UsAl da ded YUl YRS ¥t sl 818

UM, 1¢cR (Bl vl A Ul “YRSEA A 513 518 A2
33 GeAw s B A)HI, SEH VCHL, “ed cllw 30 A ACEL UL U
AUA B Al dxl ded, “UAl clw 3R A sl Ysal.

YRS A 81 & AARAUHHL, sEAH 0L, “ed el 32 A AsEL

o2l %l AUA B Al dal Gled, “UAlA Alw 32 A AGEL Ysall.

YRS WA S 81 wERAHH], SEHH UL, WS (W)HE, “EM W

32 A AsElA e, “UAlA Al 3R A sl Ysal.

YRS A 81 8lE wBRAaHH, sed ¥aul, e i 3ar A

AGElA HEQ, “Ul cliwt 3R A AcEL Ysal.

. IR RAAA APl UsAl A ded Yl WAlAad 3 sl 518

UORAAUH, 1cc9Hl, sEH UM, Vel-5dAH (3)HI, “ed cw 3Rar A
AGElA e, “UAl ctw 32 AW AGEL Ysall.

A 81 818 slAEL (%A JUIRL) WU, 202001l Rl dRd

USAL WHElAE AR glallell SleHl waual aauyqol, 518 Bkese 518
(el sARLAJUHD)HL st oSl aa Aat €laiell UslRell B Elciill AR
stlatglaloll [@Anaddell 54 WUl dg] e e el 32 5l dy

Ul
¢ ¢Rell
ul.

ol
¢ CYall
eHl.



ala, uel uAld cwt 3l sl dy ol &l Al dHIH ElclA wal
sllall@lal, dlall wReL ugl, a0, ¥ 5105 5l WUl AUYUL, A
5198 Sleoll wxoll UHA s5HAl A5 EMHL AMal doleladt U al
Aoll [Bslet salell 8.



Ggall Aal stel

ot 200U-¢l, YRS ¥t 81 51& wEARaH, 1¢eR wua WAl
a5 s wBEAaAM, 1ccosl [Qamiet olasl 60, A Sl Sléqll
gslAmas sgHd e Al 3l B. Aol 00HL, WA 5% Sleall w%-oll Acdlell
ol Aot Aadlotl €latoll el €slAmas sgidHl UAlM clit 30020 Yelloadl Al
scUML el B, L WAlal ([QARRUML Adl AU 326l Wile Yol dalsl U
AlBARetl AHAUL AR Adsdoll YeaHl UAAl luual duRla et Avla,
A 5% sleoll el egHc e ctw 3Rl awdla uAla ctw 3R s:clq]

o331 Rl 8. [ARasell sctl 2,3,5,4, 5 vl 9-2l A el Rolaus 531 B.

AL QBasel, Gusl G Rg sall HIR Uee oA AU Yual wf

yelus e,
aiRisla Al Auetell a€l

wl QAasHL, o{lAell cllotdleatt Aoluni wReslal Aol Ul
AHLAel AlA B:-

SAH 9.- Ul sAHo(l Vel-sAd  (R)YUl, AU UISIRA,  AWUAHL

3 HL, MO AUH B AN WHAHL A A ARl otssl scell Ul

HA B,

GUsc wRslal Aol WURl ulc2Us WA U HIA YslRaAl B,

ARl 1eHl 1R, R0%0. yeluRls 3.



sAL sl
elelte{l
sléa
e5Mcl B
a.

yael

YRsA 20et 8l 818 wWREAAH, 1¢¢R (Mol 1¢¢all WUH)HIY Gl

¢, $AH LeHioll AUALElA Aot 81, B 81 5l8al €lalloll UslRell dHIH

elalllloll Bolls sclloll sgHA 3-
g [An2-cadell 28U watall Bud 3R A Al duR o §lat, wUa-

(5) W 8l Sléoll egucoll ulls seoll iR, Yolct: waual B elcld
51201 GURALA 23) 8lal Al Ll Hiscll udal 1ol uRclstoll Holl slat wal

A HER s1RE1{l AMA ol 53 slal UR; WUl

(W) el HisAl ara dxiH U@QaElRA WRWR el A9l Al s sl
R Sl AUl Y 5l 8l WUl sHIAL HI2 WA sIH $dl sl RUR;

AL

U el Hisdl aud yldaglalMiol s18 yldatel wawR ual @9l Al
WS seMl Rl 8la WUl ULl Uclaldl Sl WAl sHicl H2 Wa siH
sl &l ol el Hiscl Udcl Sléoll urclatdll Holl 8la waal GuR
oRULcAL YHIBL &l of Slad WA LUl ALl ot Slal AU SHIC HIS sl

s 5l ot 8l Aall YQat€lRA A el HisaAHl AHQ Ul sl UR;

Elaloll UstRell dHiH elaAloll ol sclloll s5HA B



U Elclef 8120l Guscl ells &elofl 2ieR Yulct GURUA 43 Sl A
glall Hisall M2 uRalled(l ductsll s1é oit wd, U2 Adl Al ot wsaletl

Aotl 51200 Al wRlclclstl 33\,

AURLS0 1.~ 58 elallHl olal UasRA MR WAl 25U Adle] cllsty] dlau A
sU WlE scll 32l A Al auR o 8o, IR JA 513 5léa Adl

elclloll Bolls Sclloll e5H A 83\

AWl50 2.~ 518 cAldcoll stal auale s @UA A Ul $5cd souHl & HR
ollost UA GAR 8l RUR Acll SIHUALG GAlRUoll 2UA GURAUA AUl Elclell

518 51R0e{l ol A oial RUA WA Slalla] dual.

AUls0 3.4 slURA Ul SUoll, ellRcdHioll Aoll AWsHIAL Maal Huau 5AIA
waall wAl Aol dlottell 5AI UGl Sla A WA GURYUA Udl 518 Elcllall

$10loll BLUHl Vlal U Yl UA & AH U

0. [Ava-ardgell 2sM waal (Bud 3R A ctwell aurR o 8la, A A 5%
sl& dletoll 2¥ Aol elctotl uatsRA Al A sojclld s3L Sl & AeRp
glall Actaaloll et 510 SlEal egHd W¥A RUR UG Elcllell [Anal-ardoll
sH WAl (U 302 A ctwell R s, Al uBl Adl elal Uctietcltsdl

WA 512 Sl sgH @3

Al €35 sojcllc A 510 SleHl s18ct sl ABA wal Al Ad sect
soUML WA Aot uasR A sléall sgical utllol 2BA Aol Aal el

Aol FUA AHA citlolsdl 33

REL
sllRusgla
egHctoll
Halel
ool
Ul
elal sl
Aulasl
yadl
As.



ald Ao 2%
s1é ietoll

A% Aa

ol i

al€l

UUELCALE

A Rl (5)
sleul el

HS &R
Wl oltold. (W)

el ¥q.
@t

Aeasd

SO1%

AwallR

(5d GUR
AU,

Bl sAH 1 @] Ul &l Aall elall Reuael, uuelae R RQa sléul
HisclHl AL 818 elallHl oSl s Actdollr AL A @yl

AL 5 A elcll FHA 51 SIEHL ELHA $A ASA &cll, Al-
XXX XXX XXX

atel 30 A il Yl sM wUaAl (BHdoll SlBUL clold HER2 §sHolly

AN, dl Aol 59 WL wUUHL wdd «l(3.

2 5103 5leoll sgicoll eUlAs seoll viER WA AURMUL AR eitsl YHIA
Boll s (uc A ctw 3auell auR of sla Adl eUcR AAsdAl sl
SIURL cA(Scoll WA Mo caUlSctoll ity 313 waal defl asieledl, ueal
A e A5 Boll HIRgA €l 5cll 8lal A caldcotl g 313 uaal Aol

1sEledl 8l
U WA Alg-65 YA Al sla wal ualsdll wedl W 8,

ol Acll ellgd MUl LAl sl WAl Aol dRgdl ¥ QB A 53|
Ul A RAsd URldellr S (B AHL 8 Ul “elolall 561" 58l
8 A), Wl RABANA L AT Aal 53 (Aol 2[5t A RAetsc AU Eaedl

ol ULy,

Al A Wl RABA (B WML 6 Ul “WRHWER" s8l B A) Rasd A

gcloll Aol 5% ¥ of Wscl Ao sREL AHl [ad s (Ead ealdcld]



ellolalRl R0l $RHIAA UHoU Aol UR slacll H2 WA 51 Slea WR%)

531 as.
yrael

YAAaud 3 d 819 818 wRAAM, 1¢¢9 (Mol 1¢ el eHHHI GdlRL.

A sl

Qu. (1) Wal (R) XXX XXX XXX 81 st
glaltefl

(Qaureu
QAcll olLold.

3)  Guscl oot utllot Wl AL AR, A ML gsH s3lal, wE 531
s ¥ Elalloll YsRoll ¥ elcllle] HeAU €U cllw 3L sl AY ot sl

Aol i el gsHHL wRUAC et 8193 518 gl [AARRUMHL ¢E ausldl.






aesAd [Quistuet ARcuaA

[Uel 2020¢] Jf2Ad [ARAS sUis : S. ]

UHELAE ARA o] Uscl 8la ded Yl YRsEA
A 8% 818 wRAAM, 1 Ul IYARAA AUA
Al usdl la dzd Yl WAlAad ¥ 5 s1é
LA, 1¢c9 dy YuRal oliold @QRas.

30l WEluRls o3,
opealsll)

(Aot 202001l HIA HBeltoll el ARl e
ARsL3L A UAHL YR sAl Yo

Sl AN, wdd,
AR,

st [Qustuell.

10



THE SMALL CAUSE COURTS LAWS
(GUJARAT AMENDMENT) BILL, 2020.

GUJARAT BILL NO. 6 OF 2020.
ABILL
further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882 in its
application to the City of Ahmedabad and the Provincial small Cause Courts

Act, 1887 in its application to the State of Gujarat.

It is hereby enacted in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Small Cause Courts Laws (Gujarat
Amendment) Act, 2020.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

Short title and
commencement.



Amendment
of section 18
of XV of
1882.

Amendment
of section 20
of XV of
1882.

Amendment
of section 22
of XV of
1882.

Amendment
of section
41 of XV

of 1882.

Amendment
of section 15
of IX of
1887.

Transfer of
pending
cases.

2. In the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its application to the
City of Ahmedabad (hereinafter referred to as "the Presidency Small Cause
Courts Act"), in section 18, for the words "ten lacs rupees” wherever they occur,

the words “twenty-five lacs rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, in section 20, for the words
“ten lacs rupees” wherever they occur, the words "twenty-five lacs rupees™ shall
be substituted.

4. In the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, in section 22, in clause (b),
for the words “ten lacs rupees”, the words “twenty-five lacs rupees” shall be
substituted.

5. In the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, in section 41, for the words

“ten lacs rupees”, the words “twenty-five lacs rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In the Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887, in its application to the
State of Gujarat, in section 15, in sub-section (3), for the words “ten lacs rupees”,

the words “twenty-five lacs rupees” shall be substituted.

7. All suits and applications of a civil nature wherein the subject matter
exceeds in amount or value ten lacs rupees but does not exceed twenty-five lacs
rupees pending in the Courts of City Civil, Ahmedabad or, as the case may be,
in any district court immediately before the commencement of the Small Cause
Courts Laws (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 2020 shall after such commencement,
stand transferred to and be disposed of by the Judge, Court of Small Cause,
Ahmedabad or, as the case may be, Judge, Small Cause Court, within the local

limit of his ordinary jurisdiction.

XV of 1882.

IX of 1887.

Guj. ....of
2020.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Under the existing provisions of the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act,
1882 and the Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887, the pecuniary
jurisdiction of the Small Cause Court is rupees ten lacs since 2015. The
pecuniary jurisdiction of Civil Judge whose cadre is lower than that of the Judge
of the Small Cause Court has been raised upto rupees twenty-five lacs in 2020.
Considering this aspect and in view of the fall in the purchase value of the rupee
and the substantial appreciation in value of immovable property in the recent
time, it is considered necessary to raise such jurisdiction of the Small Cause
Courts from ten lacs rupees to twenty-five lacs rupees. Clauses 2, 3,4,5,6 and 7

of the Bill provide for the same.
This Bill seeks to amend both the said Acts to achieve the aforesaid
object.

PRADEEPSINH JADEJA,

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

This Bill involves delegation of legislative power in the following

respect:-

Clause 1.- Sub-clause (2) of this clause empowers the State
Government to appoint, by notification in the Official Gazette, the date on which

the Act shall come into force.

The delegation of legislative power, as aforesaid, is necessary and is of
a normal character.

Dated the 19" March, 2020. PRADEEPSINH JADEJA.



Suitsin
which Court
has
jurisdiction.

ANNEXURE

EXTRACT FROM THE PRESIDENCY SMALL CAUSE COURTS ACT,
1882.

(XV OF 1882)

18. Subject to the exceptions in section 19, the Small Cause Court shall have

jurisdiction to try all suits of a civil nature-

when the amount or value of the subject-matter does not exceed ten lacs
rupees; and -

(a) the cause of action has arisen, either wholly or in part, within the local
limits of the jurisdiction of the Small Cause Court, and the leave of the
Court has, for reasons to be recorded by it in writing, been given before

the institution of the suit; or

(b) all the defendants, at the time of the institution of me suit, actually
and voluntarily reside, or carry on business or personally work for gain,

within such local limits; or

(c) any of the defendants at the time of the institution of the suit, actually
and voluntarily resides, or carries on business or personally works for
gain, within such local limits, and either the leave of the Court has been
given before the institution of the suit, or the defendants who do not
reside, or carry on business, or personally work for gain, as aforesaid,

acquiesce in such institution:

Provided that where the cause of action has arisen wholly within
the local limits aforesaid, and the Court refuses to give leave for the
institution of the suit, it shall record in writing its reasons for such

refusal.


about://3027/303203.adf

Explanation 1.- When in any suit the sum claimed is, by a set-off
admitted by both parties, reduced to a balance not exceeding "ten lacs

rupees”, the Small Cause Court shall have jurisdiction to try such suit.

Explanation I1.- Where a person has a permanent dwelling at one place
and also a lodging at another place for a temporary purpose only, he shall
be deemed to reside at both places in respect of any cause of action

arising at the place where he has such temporary lodging.

Explanation I11.- A Corporation or Company shall be deemed to carry
on business at its sole or principal office in India, or, in respect of any
cause of action arising at any place where it has also a subordinate office,

at such place.

20. When the parties to a suit, which, if the amount or value of the subject-matter
thereof did not exceed ten lacs rupees, would be cognizable by the Small Cause
Court, have entered into an agreement in writing that the Small Cause Court,
shall have jurisdiction to try such suit, the Court shall have jurisdiction to try the
same, although the amount or value of the subject-matter thereof may exceed

ten lacs rupees.

Every such agreement shall be filed in the Small Cause Court, and, when
so filed, the parties to it shall be subject to the jurisdiction of the Court, and shall

be bound by its decision in such suit.

22. In any suit instituted in the Ahmedabad City Civil Court, other than a suit to
which section 21 applies, if the Judge who tries it is of opinion that it ought to

have been instituted in the Small Cause Court, then-

@) XXX XXX XXX

(b) if the plaintiff obtains a decree for any matter of an amount or value

less than ten lacs rupees no costs shall be allowed to the plaintiff.

Court may by
consent try
suits beyond
pecuniary
limits of
jurisdiction.

Costs when
plaintiff sues
in
Ahmedabad
City Civil
Court in other
cases
cognizable by
Small Cause
Court.


about://3027/303206.adf

Summons
against
person
occupying
property
without
leave.

Cognizance
of suits by
Courts of
Small
Causes.

41. When any person has had possession of any immovable property situate
within the local limits of the Small Cause Court's jurisdiction and of which the

annual value at a rack-rent does not exceed ten lacs rupees,

as the tenant, or by permission, or another person, or of some person through
whom such other person claims, and such tenancy or permission has determined

or been withdrawn,

and such tenant or occupier or any person holding under or by assignment from
him (hereinafter called the occupant) refuses to deliver up such property in
compliance with a request made to him in this behalf by such other person,

such other person (hereinafter called the applicant) may apply to the Small
Causes Court for a summons against the occupant, calling upon him to show
cause, on a day therein appointed, why he should not be compelled to deliver up

the property.

ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE PROVINCIAL SMALL CAUSE COURTS ACT,
1887.
(IX OF 1887)
15. (1) and (2) XXX XXX XXX

(3) Subject as aforesaid, the State Government may, by order in writing, direct
that all suits of a civil nature of which the value does not exceed ten lacs rupees
shall be cognizable by a Court of Small Causes mentioned in the order.



GUJARAT LEGISLATURE SECRETARIAT

GUJARAT BILL NO. 6 OF 2020.

A BILL

further to amend the Presidency Small
Cause Courts Act, 1882 in its application to the
City of Ahmedabad and the Provincial small
Cause Courts Act, 1887 in its application to the
State of Gujarat.

[SHRI PRADEEPSINH JADEJA,
MINISTER OF STATE FOR LAW]

( As published in the Gujarat Government
Gazette of the 19" March, 2020)

D.M.Patel,
Secretary,
Gujarat Legislative Assembly.





