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To complete the pending works under HRDF

7 	Sh. INDU RAJ (Baroda) : 
	Will the Chief Minister be pleased to state :-
a) the number of works announced by the Government under the HRDF C.M. code 25284 for the Baroda Assembly Constituency togetherwith the work-wise details of the amount released for it alongwith the number of works which have been completed;
b) the number of works which are lying pending so far togetherwith the reasons thereof;
c) the details of the action being taken by the Government in this regard; and
d) the time by which the pending works are likely to be completed togetherwith the details thereof?


MANOHAR LAL, CHIEF MINISTER 
a, b & c) Sir, a sum of Rs.5,06,11,000/- (Rs. Five Crore Six Lakh Eleven Thousand only) was released for 51 works announced under the HRDF C.M. code 25284 for the Baroda Assembly Constituency from Haryana Gramin Vikas Yojana. Out of 51 works, 14 works are complete, 17 are in progress, 18 are yet to be started and 2 works have been declared not feasible due to non-availability of site. Tender have been floated multiple times for works which are yet to be started. Efforts are being made to complete the in progress works & to start the not started works by completing the tendering process. The details of 51 works are annexed at Annexure-1. 
d) 35 (17 in progress + 18 yet to be started) works are likely to be completed by 31.08.2024. 




,p-vkj-Mh-,Q- ds varxZr yafcr dk;Z iwjk djuk 


7. 	Jh bUnq jkt ¼cM+kSnk½%  	
	D;k eq[;ea=h d`i;k crk,axs fd %
¼d½ 	cjkSnk fo/kkulHkk fuokZpu{ks= ds fy, ,p-vkj-Mh-,Q- lh-,e- dksM 25284 ds varxZr ljdkj }kjk ?kksf’kr dk;ksaZ dh la[;k fdruh gS rFkk muds fy, tkjh jkf”k dk dk;Z okj C;kSjk D;k gS rFkk iwjs fd, x, dk;ksaZ dh la[;k fdruh gS;
¼[k½	vc rd yafcr iMs+ dk;ksaZ dh la[;k fdruh gSa rFkk muds dkj.k D;k gSa;
¼x½	bl laca/k esa ljdkj }kjk dh xbZ dk;ZokbZ dk C;kSjk D;k gS; rFkk
¼?k½	yafcr dk;ksaZ dks dc rd iwjk fd, tkus dh laHkkouk gS rFkk mldk C;kSjk D;k gS\

 		euksgj yky] eq[;ea=h
	¼d½] ¼[k½ o ¼x½ Jheku~ th] eq0 5]06]11]000@& ¼ikap djksM+ Ng yk[k X;kjg gtkj ek=½ dh jkf”k dks ,p-vkj-Mh-,Q- lh-,e- dksM 25284 ds rgr gfj;k.kk xzkeh.k fodkl ;kstuk ds ctV ls cjksnk fo/kkulHkk {ks= ds varxZr ?kksf"kr 51 dk;ksaZ gsrq tkjh dh x;hA Lohd`r 51 dk;ksaZ esa ls 14 dk;Z iw.kZ gks pqds gSa] 17 dk;Z çxfr/khu gSa] 18 vHkh 'kq: ugha fd;s tk lds gSa rFkk 2 dk;ksaZ dks tehau miyC/k uk gksus ds dkj.k ugha djok;k tk ldrkA tks dk;Z vHkh 'kq: ugha gq,] muds fy, dbZ ckj VsaMj tkjh fd;s tk pqds gSaA çxfr/khu dk;ksaZ dks iwjk djus vkSj VsaMj çfØ;k iwjh dj “kq: ugha gq, dk;ksaZ dks 'kq: djokus dk ç;kl fd;k tk jgk gSA 51 dk;ksaZ dk fooj.k vuqyXud&1 ij layXu gSA  
		¼?k½ 35 ¼17 çxfr/khu + 18 'kq: ugha gq,½ dk;Z fnukad 31-08-2024 rd iw.kZ gksus dh 			laHkkouk gSA	
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	Annexure-1

	Details of 51 works for the Baroda Assembly Constituency under CM Announcement 25284

	S.No.
	Name of CONSTITUENCY
	Name of Block
	Name of Village
	NAME OF WORK
	SANCTIONED AMOUNT
	RELEASED AMOUNT
	LETTER NO.
	DATE
	Physical status
	Executing Agency
(XEN/GP)
	Remarks

	1
	BARODA
	GOHANA
	KAILANA KHAS
	Const.of IPB Phirni GP School to Mundala PWD road
	944000
	944000
	1551
	2-Apr-21
	Completed
	GP
	 

	2
	BARODA
	Gohana
	KAILANA KHAS
	Const. of B.O.E. Rasta from Mundlana road to Ram Narayan S/o Hajari
	457000
	457000
	2220
	6-Jul-23
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	3
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	BANWASA
	Const. of IPB Streets from H/o Ram kanwar nai upto shiv mandir.
	600000
	600000
	526
	19-Feb-23
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	4
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	KATHURA
	Const Balmiki Chaupal
	152000
	152000
	2009
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	5
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	MADINA
	Const of IPB Strets from H/o Rammehar S/o Bhagwan to PWD Road
	839000
	839000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	6
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	MADINA
	Const of Community Center
	1772000
	1772000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	7
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	BARODA MOR
	Const of IPB Streets from Gohana Maham Road to Metal Road Kohla
	1727000
	1727000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	8
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	BARODA THUTHAN
	Const of Parjapat Chaupal
	1042000
	1042000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	9
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	BUSANA
	Completion of Sheraya pana Gen Chaupal
	1018000
	1018000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	Work complete in other scheme

	10
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	CHIRANA
	Completion of Ved pana Chaupal
	830000
	830000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	11
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	MUNDLANA
	Const. of R/wall of Pond
	994000
	994000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	GP
	 

	12
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	MUNDLANA
	Const. of IPB Street from PWD road Siwanka to Sirshad
	1835000
	1835000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	13
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	NURAN KHERA
	Re-Construction of Balmiki Chaupal
	1528000
	1528000
	2009
	17-May-21
	Completed
	XEN
	 

	14
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	SHAMRI LOCHAB BARREN
	Completion of Gen Chaupal
	612000
	612000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Completed
	GP
	 

	15
	BARODA
	GOHANA
	ANWALI
	Const of IPB Streets from Nai Chaupal to School Wali Gali
	1990000
	1990000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	GP
	In progress (50%). 
Work stopped due to encroachment in street.

	16
	BARODA
	GOHANA
	JASRANA
	Const of SC Chaupal
	982000
	982000
	2009
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	GP
	Work order issued to agency on 09.08.2023.
Dismentaling work of old building is under progress after auction by Gram Panchayat.

	17
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	CHHAPRA
	Const of IPB Streets from Main Road to H/o Dharmender
	615000
	615000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (10%)
Delayed due to earth work and dispute at site.

	18
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	KATHURA
	Const. of Kalyana wali Choupal
	834000
	834000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (10%)
Funds release to GP. Transferred to XEN PR on 02.05.2022. After many times tender floated. No bid received. Now work order issued, work in progress.

	19
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	KATHURA
	Const of Mirashi Chaupal
	1000000
	1000000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (30%)
Funds release to GP. Transferred to XEN PR on 02.05.2022. After many times tender floated. No bid received. Now work order issued on 24.11.2022. Delayed due to encroachment at site.

	20
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	BARODA MOR
	Const of R/wall of Ansar Pond
	492000
	492000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (40%)
Delayed due to clear site not available

	21
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	BUSANA
	Re-Const. of Singhmar General Chaupal
	715000
	715000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (5%)
Funds release to GP. Transferred to XEN PR on 13.05.2022. After many times tender floated. No bid received. Now work order issued to agency on 15.02.2024.

	22
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	BUTANA KUNDU
	Completion of Gen New Chaupal
	297000
	297000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (10%) 
Work is being executed Departmentally

	23
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	GANGANA TANDIA PANA
	Const of Community Center
	1600000
	1600000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	GP
	In progress (60%)

	24
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	ISSAPUR KHERI
	Const of Gen Community Center
	1692000
	1692000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (20%)

	25
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	JAGSI SOHRAWAT
	Const. of IPB Streets Dholi Choupal to Bhaiya Khera
	724000
	724000
	3255
	19-Sep-23
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (15%)

	26
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	MUNDLANA
	Const. of hall in vyayamshala behind in police choki
	2151000
	2151000
	1599
	15-May-23
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (5%)
Work order issued to agency on 06.12.2023.

	27
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	SHAMRI BURAN
	Comp. of BC chaupal.
	400000
	400000
	526
	19-Feb-23
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (80%)
Work is being executed Departmentally 

	28
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	SHAMRI BURAN
	Comp. of BC chaupal.
	537000
	537000
	526
	19-Feb-23
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (70%)

	29
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	SHAMRI BURAN
	Const. of welcome gate 11 no. shaheed numberdar.
	1087000
	1087000
	526
	19-Feb-23
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (40%)
Work order issued to agency vide 28938 dated 05.12.2023.

	30
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	SHAMRI SISAN
	Const of Baddi Chaupal Gen
	1900000
	1900000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (60%)

	31
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	SIWANKA
	Const of Badi Chaupal
	943000
	943000
	2011
	17-May-21
	In Progress
	XEN
	In progress (60%)

	32
	BARODA
	GOHANA
	KAILANA KHAS
	Const. of B/wall in kabristan
	386000
	386000
	1890
	15-Jun-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender re-floated and to be received on 30.01.2024, 06.02.2024, 13.02.2024, but no bid received.
Again tender re-floated 4th time and to be received on 22.02.2024.

	33
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	BANWASA
	Const. of Bramada on Badwala Pond
	729000
	729000
	3018
	31-Aug-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	34
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	BHANDERI
	Const. of Nala alongwith Phiri
	2039000
	2039000
	3255
	19-Sep-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	35
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	BHAWAR KALI RAMAN
	Pavement of IPB Street from Shamshan Ghat to Shiv Mandir
	858000
	858000
	3255
	19-Sep-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	36
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	DHANANA
	Const. of R/Wall near Govt. School Pond
	1581000
	1581000
	3255
	19-Sep-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	37
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	DHANANA
	CONST. OF WELCOME GATE
	1098000
	1098000
	4165
	22-Dec-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	38
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	MADINA
	Const. of cow ghat of balmati wala pond.
	583000
	583000
	526
	19-Feb-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 05.12.2023, 12.12.2023, 19.12.2023, but no bid received.
Again tender re-floated 4th time and to be received on 29.12.2023. Bid received. 
Work order issued to agency vide 28150 dated 22.01.2024. 
Work not start due to water at site

	39
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	MADINA
	Const. of veranda near Barambhi wala pond.
	729000
	729000
	526
	19-Feb-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 05.12.2023, 12.12.2023, 19.12.2023, 29.12.2023, 03.01.2024, 09.01.2024, 16.01.2024, 23.01.2024, 30.01.2024, 06.02.2024, 16.02..2024, but no bid received.
Again tender re-floated 12th time and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	40
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	MADINA
	Const. of Bramada on Dada Sad Pond
	729000
	729000
	3018
	31-Aug-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	41
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	MIRJAPUR KHERI
	Const. of IPB Rasta from Dada Makhat wala to PWD Road
	1180000
	1180000
	3255
	19-Sep-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	42
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	RINDHANA
	CONST. OF WELCOME GATE
	1098000
	1098000
	4165
	22-Dec-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 01.02.2024, 08.02.2024, but no bid received.
Again tender re-floated 3rd time and to be received on 19.02.2024.

	43
	BARODA
	KATHURA
	RINDHANA JISARTHAN PANA
	CONST. OF WELCOME GATE
	1098000
	1098000
	4165
	22-Dec-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 01.02.2024, 08.02.2024, but no bid received.
Again tender re-floated 3rd time and to be received on 19.02.2024.

	44
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	AHMADPUR MAJRA
	Const. of Room in Sawran Jayanti Park 
	514000
	514000
	3255
	19-Sep-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 02.02.2024, 09.02.2024, 16.02.2024, but no bid received.
Again tender re-floated 4th time and to be received on 23.02.2024.

	45
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	BICHPARI
	Const. of Street from House of Karam Chand to Butana PWD Road
	832000
	832000
	3255
	19-Sep-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 23.01.2024. Bid received, pending at negotiation level.

	46
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	CHIRANA
	Const. of General Chaupal in dhasu pana.
	1236000
	1236000
	526
	19-Feb-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 06.12.2023, 19.12.2023, 28.12.2023, 04.01.2024, 12.01.2024, 19.01.2024, 30.01.2024, 06.02.2024, 13.02.2024, but no bid received. 
Again tender re-floated 10th time and to be received on 20.02.2024.

	47
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	ISSAPUR KHERI
	Re-Construction of Dhumra wali Chaupal
	800000
	800000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Structure work completed in other scheme. Balance work tender floated and to be received on 13.02.2024, but no bid received.
Again tender re- floated 2nd time and to be received on 20.02.2024.

	48
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	RANA KHERI
	Completion of BC Chaupal
	792000
	792000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 22.12.2023, 28.12.2023, 04.01.2024, 12.01.2024, 19.01.2024, 30.01.2024, 06.02.2024, 13.02.2024, but no bid received.
Again tender floated 9th time and to be received on 20.02.2024.

	49
	BARODA
	MUNDLANA
	MUNDLANA
	CONST. OF SHAHEED BITU S/O RAM SINGH DELHI POLICE GATE
	751000
	751000
	4165
	22-Dec-23
	Yet to be Started
	XEN
	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

	50
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	CHHATERA
	Const of IPB Streets from H/o Pandit Mukesh to Shiv Mandir
	279000
	279000
	162
	21-Jan-22
	Not Feasible
	XEN
	Not feasible due to street does not exist in village.

	51
	BARODA
	MUNDALANA
	JAGSI SOHRAWAT
	Completion of Gen Chaupal Dholi wali
	990000
	990000
	2011
	17-May-21
	Not Feasible
	GP
	Not Feasible - Chaupal is very old and not repairable

	Total
	50611000
	50611000
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Assembly Business
Un-Starred Assembly Question No. 7

From

The Additional Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana,
Development and Panchayats Department, Chandigarh.

To

The Secretary, Haryana Vidhan Sabha,
Chandigarh

Memo No. PRC/2024/ 1379 dated 19-02-2024

Subject Un-Starred Assembly Question No. 7 asked by the Sh. Indu Raj, MLA:-
Baroda

Please find enclosed 10 copies of reply (both in English & Hindi) to
the Un-Starred Assembly Question No. 7 asked by Sh. Indu Raj, MLA: Baroda. This

question is listed on 21.02.2024

DA/As Above. Sup(rm(u)dcnt (PR)
fop /\ddmom\ Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana,
y \Dgyelcpment & Panchayats Department, Chandigarh.

Endst No.PRC/2024/ 1380- 88 dated 19-02-2024

The copies of above reply as mentioned against each are forwarded
to the following for information and necessary action please:-

- The Private Secretary to Hon’ble Chief Minister, Haryana 15 Copies
2. The Private Secretary to Dev. & Panchayats Minister Haryana 10 Copies
3. The Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana (Pol. Branch). 6 Copies
4. The Secretary to Governor of Haryana, Chandigarh. 2 Copies
b The Private Secretary to Chief Secretary Haryana, Chandigarh 2 Copies
6. The Director, Public Relation Department Haryana, Chandigarh. 5 Copies
7. The Private Secretary to Additional Chief Secretary to Government

of Haryana, Development and Panchayats Department. 1 Copies
8. The Deputy Director, Legal H.Q 1 Copies
Bl PS to Director General, Dev. & Panchayats, Haryana, Chd 1Copies

> I
_— AL
DA/As Above. SupeHARdeAt (PR)
Additional Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana,
/ Development & Panchayats Department, Chandigarh.





