Assembly Business Un-Starred Assembly Question No. 7

From

The Additional Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana, Development and Panchayats Department, Chandigarh.

To

The Secretary, Haryana Vidhan Sabha,

Chandigarh.

Memo No. PRC/2024/ 1379

dated 19-02-2024

Subject:

Un-Starred Assembly Question No. 7 asked by the Sh. Indu Raj, MLA:-

Baroda.

Please find enclosed 10 copies of reply (both in English & Hindi) to the Un-Starred Assembly Question No. 7 asked by Sh. Indu Raj, MLA: Baroda. This question is listed on 21.02.2024.

DA/As Above.

Superintendent (PR)

for Additional Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana, Development & Panchayats Department, Chandigarh.

Endst No.PRC/2024/

1380-88

dated 19-02-2024

The copies of above reply as mentioned against each are forwarded to the following for information and necessary action please:-

1.	The Private Secretary to Hon'ble Chief Minister, Haryana.	15 Copies
-	The Firede Secretary to Hon ble Chief Willister, Haryana.	15 Copies
0.20		

The Private Secretary to Dev. & Panchayats Minister Haryana.
 The Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana (Pol. Branch).
 6 Copies

4. The Secretary to Governor of Haryana, Chandigarh. 2 Copies

The Private Secretary to Chief Secretary Haryana, Chandigarh. 2 Copies

6. The Director, Public Relation Department Haryana, Chandigarh. 5 Copies

7. The Private Secretary to Additional Chief Secretary to Government

of Haryana, Development and Panchayats Department. 1 Copies
8. The Deputy Director, Legal H.Q. 1 Copies

9. PS to Director General, Dev. & Panchayats, Haryana, Chd. 1Copies

DA/As Above.

Superintendent (PR)

for Additional Chief Secretary to Government of Haryana, Development & Panchayats Department, Chandigarh.

To complete the pending works under HRDF

7 Sh. INDU RAJ (Baroda):

Will the Chief Minister be pleased to state :-

- a) the number of works announced by the Government under the HRDF C.M. code 25284 for the Baroda Assembly Constituency togetherwith the workwise details of the amount released for it alongwith the number of works which have been completed;
- b) the number of works which are lying pending so far togetherwith the reasons thereof;
- c) the details of the action being taken by the Government in this regard; and
- d) the time by which the pending works are likely to be completed togetherwith the details thereof?

MANOHAR LAL, CHIEF MINISTER

- a, b & c) Sir, a sum of Rs.5,06,11,000/- (Rs. Five Crore Six Lakh Eleven Thousand only) was released for 51 works announced under the HRDF C.M. code 25284 for the Baroda Assembly Constituency from Haryana Gramin Vikas Yojana. Out of 51 works, 14 works are complete, 17 are in progress, 18 are yet to be started and 2 works have been declared not feasible due to non-availability of site. Tender have been floated multiple times for works which are yet to be started. Efforts are being made to complete the in progress works & to start the not started works by completing the tendering process. The details of 51 works are annexed at **Annexure-1**.
- d) 35 (17 in progress + 18 yet to be started) works are likely to be completed by 31.08.2024.

एच.आर.डी.एफ. के अंतर्गत लंबित कार्य पूरा करना

7. श्री इन्दु राज (बड़ौदा):

क्या मुख्यमंत्री कृपया बताएंगे कि :

- (क) बरौदा विधानसभा निर्वाचनक्षेत्र के लिए एच.आर.डी.एफ. सी.एम. कोड 25284 के अंतर्गत सरकार द्वारा घोषित कार्यों की संख्या कितनी है तथा उनके लिए जारी राशि का कार्य वार ब्यौरा क्या है तथा पूरे किए गए कार्यों की संख्या कितनी है;
- (ख) अब तक लंबित पड़े कार्यों की संख्या कितनी हैं तथा उनके कारण क्या हैं;
- (ग) इस संबंध में सरकार द्वारा की गई कार्यवाई का ब्यौरा क्या है; तथा
- (घ) लंबित कार्यों को कब तक पूरा किए जाने की संभावना है तथा उसका ब्यौरा क्या है?

मनोहर लाल, मुख्यमंत्री

- (क), (ख) व (ग) श्रीमान् जी, मु0 5,06,11,000 / (पांच करोड़ छह लाख ग्यारह हजार मात्र) की राशि को एच.आर.डी.एफ. सी.एम. कोड 25284 के तहत हरियाणा ग्रामीण विकास योजना के बजट से बरोदा विधानसभा क्षेत्र के अंतर्गत घोषित 51 कार्यों हेतु जारी की गयी। स्वीकृत 51 कार्यों में से 14 कार्य पूर्ण हो चुके हैं, 17 कार्य प्रगतिधीन हैं, 18 अभी शुरू नहीं किये जा सके हैं तथा 2 कार्यों को जमींन उपलब्ध ना होने के कारण नहीं करवाया जा सकता। जो कार्य अभी शुरू नहीं हुए, उनके लिए कई बार टेंडर जारी किये जा चुके हैं। प्रगतिधीन कार्यों को पूरा करने और टेंडर प्रक्रिया पूरी कर शुरू नहीं हुए कार्यों को शुरू करवाने का प्रयास किया जा रहा है। 51 कार्यों का विवरण अनुलग्नक—1 पर संलग्न है।
- (घ) 35 (17 प्रगतिधीन + 18 शुरू नहीं हुए) कार्य दिनांक 31.08.2024 तक पूर्ण होने की संभावना है।

Annexure-1

Details of 51 works for the Baroda Assembly Constituency under CM Announcement 25284

S.No.	Name of CONSTITUENCY	Name of Block	Name of Village	NAME OF WORK	SANCTIONED AMOUNT	RELEASED AMOUNT	LETTER NO.	DATE	Physical status	Executing Agency (XEN/GP)	Remarks
1	BARODA	GOHANA	KAILANA KHAS	Const.of IPB Phirni GP School to Mundala PWD road	944000	944000	1551	2-Apr-21	Completed	GP	
2	BARODA	Gohana	KAILANA KHAS	Const. of B.O.E. Rasta from Mundlana road to Ram Narayan S/o Hajari	457000	457000	2220	6-Jul-23	Completed	XEN	
3	BARODA	KATHURA	BANWASA	Const. of IPB Streets from H/o Ram kanwar nai upto shiv mandir.	600000	600000	526	19-Feb-23	Completed	XEN	
4	BARODA	KATHURA	KATHURA	Const Balmiki Chaupal	152000	152000	2009	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
5	BARODA	KATHURA	MADINA	Const of IPB Strets from H/o Rammehar S/o Bhagwan to PWD Road	839000	839000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
6	BARODA	KATHURA	MADINA	Const of Community Center	1772000	1772000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
7	BARODA	MUNDALANA	BARODA MOR	Const of IPB Streets from Gohana Maham Road to Metal Road Kohla	1727000	1727000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
8	BARODA	MUNDALANA	BARODA THUTHAN	Const of Parjapat Chaupal	1042000	1042000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
9	BARODA	MUNDALANA	BUSANA	Completion of Sheraya pana Gen Chaupal	1018000	1018000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	Work complete in other scheme
10	BARODA	MUNDALANA	CHIRANA	Completion of Ved pana Chaupal	830000	830000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
11	BARODA	MUNDALANA	MUNDLANA	Const. of R/wall of Pond	994000	994000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	GP	

12	BARODA	MUNDALANA	MUNDLANA	Const. of IPB Street from PWD road Siwanka to Sirshad	1835000	1835000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
13	BARODA	MUNDALANA	NURAN KHERA	Re-Construction of Balmiki Chaupal	1528000	1528000	2009	17-May-21	Completed	XEN	
14	BARODA	MUNDALANA	SHAMRI LOCHAB BARREN	Completion of Gen Chaupal	612000	612000	2011	17-May-21	Completed	GP	
15	BARODA	GOHANA	ANWALI	Const of IPB Streets from Nai Chaupal to School Wali Gali	1990000	1990000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	GP	In progress (50%). Work stopped due to encroachment in street.
16	BARODA	GOHANA	JASRANA	Const of SC Chaupal	982000	982000	2009	17-May-21	In Progress	GP	Work order issued to agency on 09.08.2023. Dismentaling work of old building is under progress after auction by Gram Panchayat.
17	BARODA	KATHURA	СННАРКА	Const of IPB Streets from Main Road to H/o Dharmender	615000	615000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (10%) Delayed due to earth work and dispute at site.
18	BARODA	KATHURA	KATHURA	Const. of Kalyana wali Choupal	834000	834000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (10%) Funds release to GP. Transferred to XEN PR on 02.05.2022. After many times tender floated. No bid received. Now work order issued, work in progress.
19	BARODA	KATHURA	KATHURA	Const of Mirashi Chaupal	1000000	1000000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (30%) Funds release to GP. Transferred to XEN PR on 02.05.2022. After many times tender floated. No bid received. Now work order issued on

											24.11.2022. Delayed due to encroachment at site.
											(400)
20	BARODA	MUNDALANA	BARODA MOR	Const of R/wall of Ansar Pond	492000	492000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (40%) Delayed due to clear site not available
21	BARODA	MUNDALANA	BUSANA	Re-Const. of Singhmar General Chaupal	715000	715000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (5%) Funds release to GP. Transferred to XEN PR on 13.05.2022. After many times tender floated. No bid received. Now work order issued to agency on 15.02.2024.
22	BARODA	MUNDALANA	BUTANA KUNDU	Completion of Gen New Chaupal	297000	297000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (10%) Work is being executed Departmentally
23	BARODA	MUNDALANA	GANGANA TANDIA PANA	Const of Community Center	1600000	1600000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	GP	In progress (60%)
24	BARODA	MUNDALANA	ISSAPUR KHERI	Const of Gen Community Center	1692000	1692000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (20%)
25	BARODA	MUNDALANA	JAGSI SOHRAWAT	Const. of IPB Streets Dholi Choupal to Bhaiya Khera	724000	724000	3255	19-Sep-23	In Progress	XEN	In progress (15%)
26	BARODA	MUNDALANA	MUNDLANA	Const. of hall in vyayamshala behind in police choki	2151000	2151000	1599	15-May-23	In Progress	XEN	In progress (5%) Work order issued to agency on 06.12.2023.
27	BARODA	MUNDALANA	SHAMRI BURAN	Comp. of BC chaupal.	400000	400000	526	19-Feb-23	In Progress	XEN	In progress (80%) Work is being executed Departmentally

28	BARODA	MUNDALANA	SHAMRI BURAN	Comp. of BC chaupal.	537000	537000	526	19-Feb-23	In Progress	XEN	In progress (70%)
29	BARODA	MUNDALANA	SHAMRI BURAN	Const. of welcome gate 11 no. shaheed numberdar.	1087000	1087000	526	19-Feb-23	In Progress	XEN	In progress (40%) Work order issued to agency vide 28938 dated 05.12.2023.
30	BARODA	MUNDALANA	SHAMRI SISAN	Const of Baddi Chaupal Gen	1900000	1900000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (60%)
31	BARODA	MUNDALANA	SIWANKA	Const of Badi Chaupal	943000	943000	2011	17-May-21	In Progress	XEN	In progress (60%)
32	BARODA	GOHANA	KAILANA KHAS	Const. of B/wall in kabristan	386000	386000	1890	15-Jun-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender re-floated and to be received on 30.01.2024, 06.02.2024, 13.02.2024, but no bid received. Again tender refloated 4th time and to be received on 22.02.2024.
33	BARODA	KATHURA	BANWASA	Const. of Bramada on Badwala Pond	729000	729000	3018	31-Aug-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.
34	BARODA	KATHURA	BHANDERI	Const. of Nala alongwith Phiri	2039000	2039000	3255	19-Sep-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.
35	BARODA	KATHURA	BHAWAR KALI RAMAN	Pavement of IPB Street from Shamshan Ghat to Shiv Mandir	858000	858000	3255	19-Sep-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.
36	BARODA	KATHURA	DHANANA	Const. of R/Wall near Govt. School Pond	1581000	1581000	3255	19-Sep-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.
37	BARODA	KATHURA	DHANANA	CONST. OF WELCOME GATE	1098000	1098000	4165	22-Dec-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

38	BARODA	KATHURA	MADINA	Const. of cow ghat of balmati wala pond.	583000	583000	526	19-Feb-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 05.12.2023, 12.12.2023, 19.12.2023, but no bid received. Again tender refloated 4th time and to be received on 29.12.2023. Bid received. Work order issued to agency vide 28150 dated 22.01.2024. Work not start due to water at site
39	BARODA	KATHURA	MADINA	Const. of veranda near Barambhi wala pond.	729000	729000	526	19-Feb-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 05.12.2023, 12.12.2023, 19.12.2023, 29.12.2023, 03.01.2024, 09.01.2024, 16.01.2024, 30.01.2024, 30.01.2024, 16.02.2024, 16.02.2024, hut no bid received. Again tender refloated 12th time and to be received on 27.02.2024.
40	BARODA	KATHURA	MADINA	Const. of Bramada on Dada Sad Pond	729000	729000	3018	31-Aug-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.
41	BARODA	KATHURA	MIRJAPUR KHERI	Const. of IPB Rasta from Dada Makhat wala to PWD Road	1180000	1180000	3255	19-Sep-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.

42	BARODA	KATHURA	RINDHANA	CONST. OF WELCOME GATE	1098000	1098000	4165	22-Dec-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 01.02.2024, 08.02.2024, but no bid received. Again tender re- floated 3rd time and to be received on 19.02.2024.
43	BARODA	KATHURA	RINDHANA JISARTHAN PANA	CONST. OF WELCOME GATE	1098000	1098000	4165	22-Dec-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 01.02.2024, 08.02.2024, but no bid received. Again tender re-floated 3rd time and to be received on 19.02.2024.
44	BARODA	MUNDALANA	AHMADPUR MAJRA	Const. of Room in Sawran Jayanti Park	514000	514000	3255	19-Sep-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 02.02.2024, 09.02.2024, 16.02.2024, but no bid received. Again tender refloated 4th time and to be received on 23.02.2024.
45	BARODA	MUNDALANA	BICHPARI	Const. of Street from House of Karam Chand to Butana PWD Road	832000	832000	3255	19-Sep-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 23.01.2024. Bid received, pending at negotiation level.
46	BARODA	MUNDALANA	CHIRANA	Const. of General Chaupal in dhasu pana.	1236000	1236000	526	19-Feb-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 06.12.2023, 19.12.2023, 28.12.2023, 04.01.2024, 12.01.2024, 19.01.2024, 30.01.2024,

											06.02.2024, 13.02.2024, but no bid received. Again tender re- floated 10th time and to be received on 20.02.2024.
47	BARODA	MUNDALANA	ISSAPUR KHERI	Re-Construction of Dhumra wali Chaupal	800000	800000	2011	17-May-21	Yet to be Started	XEN	Structure work completed in other scheme. Balance work tender floated and to be received on 13.02.2024, but no bid received. Again tender refloated 2nd time and to be received on 20.02.2024.
48	BARODA	MUNDALANA	RANA KHERI	Completion of BC Chaupal	792000	792000	2011	17-May-21	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 22.12.2023, 28.12.2023, 04.01.2024, 12.01.2024, 30.01.2024, 30.01.2024, 13.02.2024, but no bid received. Again tender floated 9th time and to be received on 20.02.2024.
49	BARODA	MUNDLANA	MUNDLANA	CONST. OF SHAHEED BITU S/O RAM SINGH DELHI POLICE GATE	751000	751000	4165	22-Dec-23	Yet to be Started	XEN	Tender floated and to be received on 27.02.2024.
50	BARODA	MUNDALANA	CHHATERA	Const of IPB Streets from H/o Pandit Mukesh to Shiv Mandir	279000	279000	162	21-Jan-22	Not Feasible	XEN	Not feasible due to street does not exist in village.

51	BARODA	MUNDALANA	JAGSI SOHRAWAT	Completion of Gen Chaupal Dholi wali	990000	990000	2011	17-May-21	Not Feasible	GP	Not Feasible - Chaupal is very old and not repairable	
		Т	otal		50611000	50611000						

Sanctioned Works	51
Completed	14
In Progress	17
Yet to be Started	18
Not Feasible	2