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----

Loss due to Cyclone ‘Amphan’

*2 Sh. Bhola Singh (Bulandshahr):

HOME AFFAIRS :-

Will the Minister of HOME AFFAIRS be pleased to state:

(a) whether a severe cyclone ‘Amphan’ had badly affected the country and if
so, the details of losses suffered, State-wise;

(b) the details of relief sought by the affected States and the assistance
provided to the farmers and fishermen by the Government, State-wise;

(c) whether there have been slow progress in utilization of funds by these
State Governments for restoration of infrastructure and rehabilitation work;

(d) if so, the details thereof and the remedial action taken thereon;

(e) whether there is urgent need for building a resilient infrastructure to
mitigate recurrent cyclone risk in these States; and
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(f) if so, the details thereof along with the other steps being taken by the
Government in this regard?

----

Legalisation of MSP

*3 Shri. Deepak Baij (Bastar ):

Agriculture and Farmers Welfare :-

Will the Minister of AGRICULTURE AND FARMERS WELFARE be pleased to
state:

(a) whether the Government intends to legalise Minimum Support Price
(MSP) for various produce of farmers and make MSP a legal right to the
farmers;

(b) if so, the details thereof and if not, the reasons therefor;

(c) the percentage of farmers getting the benefit of MSP at present;

(d) the details of the steps taken to provide the benefit of MSP to more and
more farmers; and

(e) the measures undertaken/proposed to be undertaken by the Government
to prevent procurement outside mandis below MSP?

----

e-Mandi in Madhya Pradesh

*4 Shri. Krishna Pal Singh (Guna):

Agriculture and Farmers Welfare :-

Will the Minister of AGRICULTURE AND FARMERS WELFARE be pleased to
state:

(a) whether the Government has started any scheme to introduce e-mandi in
Madhya Pradesh;

(b) if so, the details thereof, location-wise; and

(c) the number of farmers being benefited by these mandis?

----

Fishing Harbour in Machilipatnam Phase-II
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*5 Shri. Balashowry Vallabbhaneni (Machilipatnam):

ANIMAL HUSBANDRY, DAIRYING AND FISHERIES :-

Will the Minister of FISHERIES, ANIMAL HUSBANDRY AND DAIRYING be
pleased to state:

(a) whether the State Government of Andhra Pradesh has submitted a
proposal for fishing harbour in Machilipatnam Phase-II with an estimated cost
of Rs. 252 crores;

(b) if so, the details of the proposal and the action taken by his Ministry in this
regard; and

(c) the time by which the project is likely to be completed?

----

Look Out Circulars against Foreigners

*6 Sh. Gopal Chinayya Shetty (Mumbai-north):

HOME AFFAIRS :-

Will the Minister of HOME AFFAIRS be pleased to state:

(a) whether the Government has issued Look Out Circulars/Notices (LOCs)
for the foreigners living illegally in various parts of the country during the last
three years;

(b) if so, the details thereof;

(c) whether LOCs were also issued in April, 2020;

(d) if so, the details thereof; and

(e) the further action taken or proposed to be taken by the Government in this
regard?

----
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